



## **THE MBINGA COFFEE EXCHANGE**

Auction On Thursday, 31 August, 2023

at 10.30 a.m.

**AT THE EXCHANGE HALL**

**SALE NO. TCB/M/1**

9,672 Bags of Tanzania Coffee Lying at Various Warehouses

### **TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE**

1. Sale are subject to Tanzania Coffee Board Rules and Regulations 2013
2. Unless otherwise stated coffee is packed in single sisal bags of 60 Kgs. Net.  
Tare weight 1.1 Kg. Bids shall be per 50 Kgs.
3. Confirmation of bids not later than 4.00 p.m.
4. Proceeds payable to TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD on or before Prompt date.
5. Nett weight as per WAREHOUSE warrant weights.

**PROMPT DATE: 5th September, 2023**



**BREAK DOWN FOR MILD ARABICA COFFEE AS PER ZONE & WAREHOUSES**

**A: MBINGA COFFEE:**

1. MCCCCO LTD	3,560	BAGS
2. DAE LTD	5,621	BAGS
3. CMS LTD.		BAGS

**C: MBEYA/SONGWE COFFEE:**

1. MCCCCO LTD	491	BAGS
2. CCL-MEYA		BAGS
3. CMS LTD - MBOZI	-	BAGS
4. LIMA KWANZA LTD		
5. GDM CO. LTD-MBOZI	-	BAGS

**D: NORTHERN COFFEE:**

1. TCCCCO LTD		BAGS
2. CITY COFFEE - MOSHI		BAGS
3. GOURMET LTD.		BAGS
4. RAFIKI LTD		BAGS
5. ACM LTD - ARUSHA		BAGS

**TOTAL 9,672 BAGS**

# TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD

**AUCTION SALE NO.TCB/M/1 TO BE HELD ON THURSDAY, 31 AUGUST 2023**

## **SONGWE/MBEYA COFFEE - 491 BAGS**

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
1	ITENTULA AMCOS LTD&CRDB PLC 09/10035/63/	F	26	5	1,565	MCCCO-MBZ	76	63		72.00	Sold	COTACOF
2	ITENTULA AMCOS LTD&CRDB PLC 09/10035/64	TT	11	43	703	MCCCO-MBZ	77	64		75.00	Sold	DORMAN
3	ITENTULA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC09/10035/65	AF	10	26	626	MCCCO-MBZ	78	65		85.00	Sold	COTACOF
4	ITENTULA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC09/10035/66	C	27	10	1,630	MCCCO-MBZ	79	66		102.00	Sold	TANIN
5	ITENTULA AMCOS LTD & CRDB 09/10035/67	B	135	32	8,132	MCCCO-MBZ	80	67		140.00	Sold	TANIN
6	ITENTULA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 09/10035/68	A	135	7	8,107	MCCCO-MBZ	81	68		142.00	Sold	DORMAN
7	ITENTULA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 09/10035/69	AA	103	0	6,180	MCCCO-MBZ	82	69		148.00	Sold	TWT
8	ITENTULA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 09/10035/70	PB	42	17	2,537	MCCCO-MBZ	83	70		140.00	Sold	COTACOF
9	LUNDUMATU AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/013/091	F	25	53	1,553	MCCCO	123	91		47.00	Sold	SHERRIF
10	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/010/067	F	16	51	1,011	MCCCO	90	67		50.00	Sold	COTACOF
11	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB- PLC/009/060	F	15	1	901	MCCCO	81	60		50.00	Sold	DORMAN
12	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB- PLC/008/052	F	12	57	777	MCCCO	72	52		50.00	Sold	COTACOF
13	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/006/044	F	30	13	1,813	MCCCO	64	44		50.00	Sold	DORMAN
14	<b>MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/005/040</b>	<b>F</b>	<b>22</b>	<b>24</b>	<b>1,344</b>	<b>MCCCO</b>	<b>60</b>	<b>40</b>			<b>Withdrawn</b>	
15	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB- PLC/011/075	F	23	42	1,422	MCCCO	101	75		50.00	Sold	SHERRIF
16	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/014/99	F	18	20	1,100	MCCCO	132	99		56.00	Sold	IBERO
17	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/78	F	4	51	291	DAE	135	78		56.00	Sold	COTACOF
18	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/48	F	8	0	480	DAE	102	48		54.00	Sold	SHERRIF
19	KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/58	F	6	31	391	DAE	114	58		54.00	Sold	COTACOF
20	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/88	F	3	37	217	DAE	145	88		56.00	Sold	COTACOF

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
21	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/39	F	3	27	207	DAE	91	39		50.00	Sold	COTACOF
22	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/68	F	3	41	221	DAE	125	68			Withdrawn	
23	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/98	F	17	32	1,052	DAE	175	98			Withdrawn	
24	KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/57	TT	1	28	88	DAE	113	57			No bid	
25	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/67	TT	2	6	126	DAE	124	67			Withdrawn	
26	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/97	TT	13	53	833	DAE	174	97			Withdrawn	
27	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/38	TT	4	17	257	DAE	90	38		55.00	Sold	COTACOF
28	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/47	TT	4	33	273	DAE	101	47		55.00	Sold	SHERRIF
29	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/77	TT	3	43	223	DAE	134	77		55.00	Sold	COTACOF
30	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/87	TT	1	47	107	DAE	144	87		55.00	Sold	COTACOF
31	LUNDUMATU AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/013/090	TT	1	35	95	MCCCO	122	90			No bid	
32	MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/005/039	TT	2	22	142	MCCCO	59	39			Withdrawn	
33	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB- PC/006/043	TT	2	43	163	MCCCO	63	43		55.00	Sold	DORMAN
34	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB- PLC/008/051	TT	1	8	68	MCCCO	71	51			No bid	
35	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB- PLC/009/059	TT	1	9	69	MCCCO	80	59			No bid	
36	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB- PLC/011/074	TT	2	9	129	MCCCO	100	74		55.00	Sold	DORMAN
37	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/014/098	TT	1	48	108	MCCCO	131	98		55.00	Sold	DORMAN
38	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/46	AF	4	32	272	DAE	100	46		45.00	Sold	SHERRIF
39	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/37	AF	2	17	137	DAE	89	37		65.00	Sold	COTACOF
40	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/76	AF	40	5	2,405	DAE	133	76		65.00	Sold	IBERO
41	LUNDUMATU AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/013/089	AF	8	6	486	MCCCO	121	89		85.00	Sold	TANIN
42	MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/005/038	AF	8	59	539	MCCCO	58	38		110.00	Sold	DORMAN
43	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/006/042	AF	10	18	618	MCCCO	62	42		75.00	Sold	IBERO
44	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB- PLC/008/050	AF	5	36	336	MCCCO	70	50		75.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
45	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/009/058	AF	6	29	389	MCCCO	79	58		75.00	Sold	TWT
46	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/010/066	AF	5	36	336	MCCCO	89	66		75.00	Sold	COTACOF
47	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/86	AF	9	17	557	DAE	143	86		75.00	Sold	IBERO
48	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/66	AF	4	40	280	DAE	123	66			Withdrawn	
49	KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/56	AF	7	50	470	DAE	112	56		75.00	Sold	TWT
50	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/011/073	AF	11	43	703	MCCCO	99	73		78.00	Sold	COTACOF
51	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/96	AF	9	8	548	DAE	173	96			Withdrawn	
52	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/014/97	AF	5	55	355	MCCCO	130	97		70.00	Sold	DORMAN
53	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/65	E	1	24	84	DAE	122	65			No bid	
54	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/85	E	2	15	135	DAE	142	85		50.00	Sold	COTACOF
55	KIHANGI MAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/55	E	1	0	60	DAE	111	55		55.00	Sold	COTACOF
56	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/75	E	1	19	79	DAE	132	75		55.00	Sold	COTACOF
57	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/95	E	4	4	244	DAE	172	95			No bid	
58	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/36	C	6	14	374	DAE	88	36			Withdrawn	
59	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/74	C	5	55	355	DAE	131	74			No bid	
60	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/45	C	13	33	813	DAE	99	45		100.00	Sold	COTACOF
61	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/64	C	5	20	320	DAE	121	64			No bid	
62	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/94	C	52	48	3,168	DAE	171	94			Withdrawn	
63	MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/005/037	C	46	6	2,766	MCCCO	57	37			Withdrawn	
64	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/006/041	C	54	39	3,279	MCCCO	61	41		100.00	Sold	DORMAN
65	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/008/049	C	22	31	1,351	MCCCO	69	49		100.00	Sold	TANIN
66	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/009/057	C	21	25	1,285	MCCCO	78	57		100.00	Sold	DORMAN
67	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/010/065	C	34	53	2,093	MCCCO	88	65		100.00	Sold	COTACOF
68	LUNDUMATU AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/013/088	C	32	44	1,964	MCCCO	120	88		102.00	Sold	TANIN

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
69	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/014/96	C	23	46	1,426	MCCCO	129	96		102.00	Sold	IBERO
70	KIHANGI MAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/54	C	12	8	728	DAE	110	54		102.00	Sold	COTACOF
71	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/84	C	6	14	374	DAE	141	84		102.00	Sold	TWT
72	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB- PLC/011/072	C	55	29	3,329	MCCCO	98	72		107.00	Sold	IBERO
73	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/44	B	123	3	7,383	DAE	98	44		140.00	Sold	COTACOF
74	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/35	B	56	37	3,397	DAE	87	35		140.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
75	LUNDUMATU AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/013/087	B	72	6	4,326	MCCCO	119	87		142.00	Sold	TWT
76	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/010/064	B	70	28	4,228	MCCCO	87	64		142.00	Sold	DORMAN
77	MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB- PLC/005/036	B	95	31	5,731	MCCCO	56	36			No bid	
78	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/93	B	100	0	6,000	DAE	167	93			Withdrawn	
79	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/93	B	100	0	6,000	DAE	168	93			No bid	
80	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/93	B	100	0	6,000	DAE	169	93			No bid	
81	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/93	B	139	23	8,363	DAE	170	93			No bid	
82	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/014/95	B	64	39	3,879	MCCCO	128	95		142.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
83	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/63	B	67	1	4,021	DAE	120	63			Withdrawn	
84	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/73	B	60	9	3,609	DAE	130	73		142.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
85	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB- PLC/008/048	B	42	15	2,535	MCCCO	68	48		142.00	Sold	TWT
86	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB- PLC/009/056	B	48	28	2,908	MCCCO	77	56		142.00	Sold	DORMAN
87	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB- PLC/011/071	B	104	10	6,250	MCCCO	97	71		142.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
88	KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/53	B	109	48	6,588	DAE	109	53		142.00	Sold	YY TZ
89	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/83	B	50	35	3,035	DAE	140	83		142.00	Sold	TWT
90	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/43	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	96	43		142.00	Sold	YY TZ
91	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/43	A	96	44	5,804	DAE	97	43		142.00	Sold	YY TZ
92	KIPEGEI AMOS/NMB/06/05/34	A	94	7	5,647	DAE	86	34		142.00	Sold	COTACOF

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
93	[ MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/005/035	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	55	35			Withdrawn	
94	[ MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/005/035	A	96	58	5,818	MCCCO	54	35			Withdrawn	
95	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/009/055	A	96	33	5,793	MCCCO	76	55			No bid	
96	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/010/063	A	140	19	8,419	MCCCO	86	63		144.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
97	LUNDUMATU AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/013/086	A	116	45	7,005	MCCCO	118	86		143.00	Sold	IBERO
98	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/014/94	A	116	2	6,962	MCCCO	127	94		142.00	Sold	TWT
99	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/72	A	94	44	5,684	DAE	129	72		145.00	Sold	COTACOF
100	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/92	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	160	92			No bid	
101	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/92	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	161	92			No bid	
102	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/92	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	162	92			Withdrawn	
103	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/92	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	163	92			No bid	TWT
104	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/92	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	164	92			Withdrawn	
105	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/92	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	165	92			Withdrawn	
106	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/92	A	62	8	3,728	DAE	166	92			Withdrawn	
107	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/62	A	125	5	7,505	DAE	119	62			Withdrawn	
108	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/008/047	A	79	44	4,784	MCCCO	67	47		145.00	Sold	COTACOF
109	[ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/011/070	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	96	70		145.00	Sold	DORMAN
110	[ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/011/070	A	75	40	4,540	MCCCO	95	70		145.00	Sold	DORMAN
111	{ KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/08/07/52	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	107	52		146.00	Sold	YY TZ
112	{ KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/08/07/52	A	62	0	3,720	DAE	108	52		145.00	Sold	COTACOF
113	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/82	A	82	17	4,937	DAE	139	82		145.00	Sold	COTACOF
114	[ LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/42	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	94	42		146.00	Sold	IBERO
115	[ LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/42	AA	111	41	6,701	DAE	95	42		146.00	Sold	IBERO
116	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/33	AA	95	0	5,700	DAE	85	33		146.00	Sold	COTACOF

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
117	{ LUNDUMATUAMCOS/CRDB-PLC/013/085	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	117	85		148.00	Sold	TWT
118	{ LUNDUMATUAMCOS/CRDB-PLC/013/085	AA	62	32	3,752	MCCCO	116	85		148.00	Sold	COTACOF
119	[ MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/010/062	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	84	62		145.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
120	[ MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/010/062	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	85	62		148.00	Sold	DORMAN
121	[ MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/010/062	AA	61	48	3,708	MCCCO	83	62		145.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
122	{ LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/009/054	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	75	54		147.00	Sold	DORMAN
123	{ LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/009/054	AA	57	38	3,458	MCCCO	74	54		147.00	Sold	DORMAN
124	[ MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/005/034	AA	144	41	8,681	MCCCO	51	34			Withdrawn	
125	[ MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/005/034	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	52	34			Withdrawn	
126	[ MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/005/034	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	53	34			Withdrawn	
127	{ LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/014/93	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	126	93		148.00	Sold	IBERO
128	{ LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/014/93	AA	68	2	4,082	MCCCO	125	93		145.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
129	[ MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/61	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	117	61			Withdrawn	
130	[ MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/61	AA	51	28	3,088	DAE	118	61			Withdrawn	
131	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/71	AA	90	37	5,437	DAE	128	71		148.00	Sold	COTACOF
132	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/91	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	153	91			Withdrawn	
133	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/91	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	154	91			Withdrawn	
134	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/91	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	155	91			Withdrawn	
135	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/91	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	156	91			Withdrawn	
136	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/91	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	157	91			Withdrawn	
137	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/91	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	158	91			Withdrawn	
138	{ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/91	AA	85	48	5,148	DAE	159	91			Withdrawn	
139	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/008/046	AA	112	36	6,756	MCCCO	66	46		148.00	Sold	IBERO
140	[ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/011/069	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	93	69		145.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA



L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
141	[ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/011/069	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO	94	69		146.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
142	[ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/011/069	AA	51	41	3,101	MCCCO	92	69		146.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
143	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/81	AA	60	46	3,646	DAE	138	81		148.00	Sold	YY TZ
144	{ KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/51	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	105	51		148.00	Sold	YY TZ
145	{ KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/51	AA	64	6	3,846	DAE	106	51		148.00	Sold	TWT
146	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/41	AAA	117	12	7,032	DAE	93	41		148.00	Sold	YY TZ
147	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/32	AAA	49	14	2,954	DAE	84	32		148.00	Sold	COTACOF
148	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/60	AAA	88	15	5,295	DAE	116	60			Withdrawn	
149	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/70	AAA	46	9	2,769	DAE	127	70		148.00	Sold	COTACOF
150	[ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/90	AAA	100	0	6,000	DAE	149	90			Withdrawn	
151	[ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/90	AAA	100	0	6,000	DAE	150	90			Withdrawn	
152	[ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/90	AAA	100	0	6,000	DAE	151	90			Withdrawn	
153	[ UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/90	AAA	83	11	4,991	DAE	152	90			Withdrawn	
154	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/80	AAA	29	45	1,785	DAE	137	80		148.00	Sold	YY TZ
155	KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/50	AAA	83	31	5,011	DAE	104	50		148.00	Sold	YY TZ
156	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/07/06/40	PB	74	23	4,463	DAE	92	40		140.00	Sold	IBERO
157	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/31	PB	41	57	2,517	DAE	83	31		140.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
158	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/009/053	PB	50	52	3,052	MCCCO	73	53		140.00	Sold	TWT
159	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/010/061	PB	65	5	3,905	MCCCO	82	61		141.00	Sold	DORMAN
160	LUNDUMATU AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/013/084	PB	57	19	3,439	MCCCO	115	84		142.00	Sold	COTACOF
161	MATIRI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/005/033	PB	86	19	5,179	MCCCO	50	33			Withdrawn	
162	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/014/92	PB	47	53	2,873	MCCCO	124	92		142.00	Sold	DORMAN
163	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/69	PB	42	24	2,544	DAE	126	69		142.00	Sold	COTACOF
164	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/09/08/59	PB	47	18	2,838	DAE	115	59			Withdrawn	

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
165	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/89	PB	100	0	6,000	DAE	146	89			Withdrawn	
166	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/89	PB	100	0	6,000	DAE	147	89			Withdrawn	
167	UMOJA AMCOS/CRDB/12/03/89	PB	103	25	6,205	DAE	148	89			Withdrawn	
168	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/011/068	PB	63	42	3,822	MCCCO	91	68		142.00	Sold	DORMAN
169	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/008/045	PB	34	11	2,051	MCCCO	65	45		142.00	Sold	DORMAN
170	NDEMBO AMCOS/NMB/11/10/79	PB	35	50	2,150	DAE	136	79		142.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
171	KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/49	PB	63	51	3,831	DAE	103	49		143.00	Sold	IBERO

