



THE MBINGA COFFEE EXCHANGE

Auction On Thursday, 21st September, 2023

at 10.30 a.m.

AT THE EXCHANGE HALL

SALE NO. TCB/M/2

Bags of Tanzania Coffee Lying at Various Warehouses

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE

1. Sale are subject to Tanzania Coffee Board Rules and Regulations 2013
2. Unless otherwise stated coffee is packed in single sisal bags of 60 Kgs. Net. Tare weight 1.1 Kg. Bids shall be per 50 Kgs.
3. Confirmation of bids not later than 4.00 p.m.
4. Proceeds payable to TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD on or before Prompt date.
5. Nett weight as per WAREHOUSE warrant weights.

PROMPT DATE: 26th September, 2023

TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD

AUCTION RESULT SALE NO.TCB/M/2 HELD ON THURSDAY, 21ST SEPT 2023

SONGWE/MBEYA COFFEE-BAGS

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
1	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD /CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/144	F	4	22	262	CMS - MBZ	0	144		45.00	Sold	DT
2	NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/CPU/017/2023/0136	F	4	13	253	CMS - MBZ	123	136	RA	45.00	Sold	DT
3	SHILOM AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/019/2023/152	F	7	7	427	CMS - MBZ	119	152		52.00	Sold	DT
4	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/191	F	43	47	2,627	MCCCO-MBZ	222	191		73.00	Sold	IBERO
5	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD /CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/143	TT	33	22	2,002	CMS - MBZ	133	143		70.00	Sold	TWT
6	SHILOM AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/019/2023/151	TT	6	47	407	CMS - MBZ	118	151		70.00	Sold	CTCF
7	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/192	TT	22	38	1,358	MCCCO-MBZ	223	192		70.00	Sold	TWT
8	NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/CPU/017/2023/0135	TT	28	52	1,732	CMS - MBZ	122	135	RA	74.00	Sold	DT
9	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/142	AF	4	42	282	CMS - MBZ	132	142		75.00	Sold	IBERO
10	SHILOM AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/019/2023/150	AF	3	26	206	CMS - MBZ	117	150		75.00	Sold	IBERO
11	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/193	AF	35	36	2,136	MCCCO-MBZ	224	193		89.00	Sold	TWT
12	NANGONDO LTD/CRDB/MBZ/CPU/017/2023/0134	AF	11	31	691	CMS - MBZ	121	134	RA	97.00	Sold	DT
13	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/194	E	3	38	218	MCCCO-MBZ	225	194		75.00	Sold	CTCF
14	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD /CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/2023/141	C	24	38	1,478	CMS - MBZ	121	141		95.00	Sold	CTCF
15	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD 025/10051/195	C	53	0	3,180	MCCCO-MBZ	226	195		121.00	Sold	IBERO
16	SHILOM AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/019/2023/149	C	10	17	617	CMS - MBZ	116	149		118.00	Sold	IBERO
17	NANGONDO AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/CPU/017/2023/0133	C	19	39	1,179	CMS - MBZ	120	133	RA	123.00	Sold	DT
18	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/140	B	100	0	6,000	CMS - MBZ	129	140		140.00	Sold	CTCF
19	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/140	B	71	48	4,308	CMS - MBZ	130	140		140.00	Sold	DT
20	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/196	B	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBZ	227	196		140.00	Sold	TWT
21	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/196	B	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBZ	226	196		140.00	Sold	IBERO
22	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/196	B	63	0	3,780	MCCCO-MBZ	229	196		140.00	Sold	KAHAWA P

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
23	SHILOM AMCOS LTD/CRDB/019/2023/148	B	71	19	4,279	CMS - MBZ	115	148		141.00	Sold	DT
24	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/197	A	133	51	8,031	MCCCO-MBZ	231	197		143.00	Sold	CTCF
25	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/197	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBZ	230	197		143.00	Sold	IBERO
26	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD /CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/139	A	100	0	6,000	CMS - MBZ	127	139		143.00	Sold	TWT
27	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/139	A	58	0	3,480	CMS - MBZ	128	139		143.00	Sold	DT
28	SHILOM AMCOS LTD/CRDB/019/2023/147	A	69	38	4,178	CMS - MBZ	114	147		143.00	Sold	IBERO
29	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/198	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBZ	232	198		145.00	Sold	CTCF
30	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/198	AA	81	51	4,911	MCCCO-MBZ	233	198		145.00	Sold	TWT
31	SHIWINGW AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/138	AA	100	0	6,000	CMS - MBZ	125	138		145.00	Sold	DT
32	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/018/2023/138	AA	59	22	3,562	CMS - MBZ	126	138		145.00	Sold	TWT
33	SHILOM AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/019/2023/146	AA	63	29	3,809	CMS - MBZ	113	146		145.00	Sold	CTCF
34	SHIWINGA AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/2023/137	PB	46	27	2,787	CMS - MBZ	124	137		140.00	Sold	IBERO
35	SHOMOLA AMCOS LTD & CRDB PLC 025/10051/199	PB	87	51	5,271	MCCCO-MBZ	234	199		140.00	Sold	TWT
36	SHILOM AMCOS LTD/CRDB/MBZ/019/2023/145	PB	35	28	2,128	CMS - MBZ	112	145		140.00	Sold	DT
37	LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/152	F	22	5	1,325	MCCCO-MBG	205	152		45.00	Sold	IBERO
38	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/193	F	31	40	1,900	MCCCO-MBG	294	193		45.00	Sold	ARMAN
39	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/007/175	F	19	55	1,195	MCCCO-MBG	260	175		45.00	Sold	ARMAN
40	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/019/183	F	23	55	1,435	MCCCO-MBG	271	183		65.00	Sold	CTCF
41	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/022/130	F	45	19	2,719	MCCCO-MBG	175	130		72.00	Sold	IBERO
42	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/167	F	24	40	1,480	MCCCO-MBG	250	167		78.00	Sold	DT
43	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/144	F	17	31	1,051	MCCCO-MBG	193	144		79.00	Sold	TWT
44	KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/159	F	22	3	1,323	MCCCO-MBG	215	159		77.00	Sold	IBERO
45	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/231	F	19	8	1,148	MCCCO-MBG	357	231		77.00	Sold	CTCF
46	MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/262	F	20	36	1,236	MCCCO-MBG	396	262		67.00	Sold	TWT

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
47	KITUMBALOMO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/042/238	F	11	10	670	MCCCO-MBG	365	238		62.00	Sold	DT
48	KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/223	F	12	23	743	MCCCO-MBG	344	223		61.00	Sold	CTCF
49	KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/254	F	17	38	1,058	MCCCO-MBG	387	254		63.00	Sold	IBERO
50	LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/215	F	38	0	2,280	MCCCO-MBG	335	215			Withdrawn	
51	KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/246	F	23	9	1,389	MCCCO-MBG	375	246		65.00	Sold	TWT
52	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/023/137	F	18	41	1,121	MCCCO-MBG	183	137		72.00	Sold	IBERO
53	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/205	F	7	20	440	DAE	317	205		64.00	Sold	CTCF
54	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/186	F	7	37	457	DAE	298	186		70.00	Sold	TWT
55	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/156	F	4	24	264	DAE	262	156		67.00	Sold	IBERO
56	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/146	F	2	5	125	DAE	252	146		60.00	Sold	CTCF
57	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/CRDB/22/08/195	F	4	53	293	DAE	307	195		65.00	Sold	IBERO
58	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/166	F	8	5	485	DAE	274	166		60.00	Sold	CTCF
59	ILELA AMCOS/CPU/20/14/176	F	5	0	300	DAE	286	176		61.00	Sold	TWT
60	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/204	TT	4	12	252	DAE	316	204		60.00	Sold	CTCF
61	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/155	TT	2	16	136	DAE	261	155		60.00	Sold	TWT
62	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/185	TT	4	35	275	DAE	297	185		60.00	Sold	CTCF
63	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/165	TT	5	21	321	DAE	273	165		60.00	Sold	TWT
64	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/CRDB/22/08/194	TT	1	45	105	DAE	306	194		60.00	Sold	CTCF
65	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/145	TT	2	19	139	DAE	251	145		60.00	Sold	IBERO
66	LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/151	TT	3	15	195	MCCCO-MBG	204	151		62.00	Sold	DT
67	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/192	TT	2	23	143	MCCCO-MBG	293	192		60.00	Sold	TWT
68	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/007/174	TT	2	10	130	MCCCO-MBG	259	174		62.00	Sold	IBERO
69	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/022/129	TT	6	29	389	MCCCO-MBG	174	129		68.00	Sold	DT
70	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/019/182	TT	3	7	187	MCCCO-MBG	270	182		66.00	Sold	CTCF

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
71	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/230	TT	2	3	123	MCCCO-MBG	356	230		66.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
72	KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/222	TT	1	6	66	MCCCO-MBG	343	222		66.00	Sold	TWT
73	KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/253	TT	2	16	136	MCCCO-MBG	386	253		66.00	Sold	CTCF
74	LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/214	TT	5	47	347	MCCCO-MBG	334	214			Withdrawn	
75	KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/245	TT	4	12	252	MCCCO-MBG	374	245		70.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
76	MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/261	TT	1	0	60	MCCCO-MBG	395	261		60.00	Sold	CTCF
77	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/166	TT	6	39	399	MCCCO-MBG	249	166		72.00	Sold	DT
78	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/175	TT	1	27	87	DAE	285	175		60.00	Sold	CTCF
79	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/23/05/203	AF	3	3	183	DAE	315	203		64.00	Sold	TWT
80	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/191	AF	9	55	595	MCCCO-MBG	292	191			No bid	
81	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/007/173	AF	7	1	421	MCCCO-MBG	258	173		70.00	Sold	TWT
82	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/022/128	AF	25	54	1,554	MCCCO-MBG	173	128		113.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
83	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/019/181	AF	15	32	932	MCCCO-MBG	269	181		100.00	Sold	IBERO
84	LINDA AMCOS/NMB/025/150	AF	13	32	812	MCCCO-MBG	203	150		79.00	Sold	DT
85	KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/158	AF	11	48	708	MCCCO-MBG	214	158		91.00	Sold	IBERO
86	KITUMBALOMO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/042/237	AF	3	37	217	MCCCO-MBG	364	237		83.00	Sold	TWT
87	KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/252	AF	10	58	658	MCCCO-MBG	385	252		90.00	Sold	CTCF
88	LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/213	AF	29	42	1,782	MCCCO-MBG	333	213			Withdrawn	
89	KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/244	AF	9	19	559	MCCCO-MBG	373	244		77.00	Sold	DT
90	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/184	AF	1	52	112	DAE	296	184		81.00	Sold	DT
91	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/144	AF	8	13	493	DAE	250	144		103.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
92	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/154	AF	2	31	151	DAE	260	154		85.00	Sold	TWT
93	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/165	AF	14	15	855	MCCCO-MBG	248	165		108.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
94	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/143	AF	5	50	350	MCCCO-MBG	192	143		88.00	Sold	IBERO

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
95	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/023/136	AF	11	28	688	MCCCO-MBG	182	136		100.00	Sold	DT
96	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/229	AF	8	2	482	MCCCO-MBG	355	229		96.00	Sold	DT
97	MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/260	AF	2	33	153	MCCCO-MBG	394	260		80.00	Sold	CTCF
98	KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/221	AF	6	52	412	MCCCO-MBG	342	221		88.00	Sold	TWT
99	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/164	AF	4	42	282	DAE	272	164		93.00	Sold	IBERO
100	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/CRDB/22/08/193	AF	2	9	129	DAE	305	193		104.00	Sold	CTCF
101	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/174	AF	1	29	89	DAE	284	174		94.00	Sold	IBERO
102	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/202	E	1	5	65	DAE	314	202			No bid	
103	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/143	E	1	3	63	DAE	249	143			No bid	
104	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/183	E	1	31	91	DAE	295	183		80.00	Sold	IBERO
105	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/153	E	1	32	92	DAE	259	153		80.00	Sold	CTCF
106	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/163	E	1	29	89	DAE	271	163		80.00	Sold	IBERO
107	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/173	E	1	0	60	DAE	283	173		80.00	Sold	IBERO
108	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/201	C	10	0	600	DAE	313	201			No bid	
109	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/182	C	12	8	728	DAE	294	182			No bid	
110	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/190	C	71	26	4,286	MCCCO-MBG	291	190			No bid	
111	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/007/172	C	36	3	2,163	MCCCO-MBG	257	172		105.00	Sold	TWT
112	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/022/127	C	105	38	6,338	MCCCO-MBG	172	127		125.00	Sold	CTCF
113	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/019/180	C	48	26	2,906	MCCCO-MBG	268	180		126.00	Sold	TWT
114	LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/149	C	43	56	2,636	MCCCO-MBG	202	149		105.00	Sold	DT
115	KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/157	C	45	46	2,746	MCCCO-MBG	213	157		110.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
116	KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/251	C	39	12	2,352	MCCCO-MBG	384	251		125.00	Sold	IBERO
117	KITUMBALOMO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/042/236	C	30	6	1,806	MCCCO-MBG	363	236		125.00	Sold	CTCF
118	KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/220	C	33	28	2,008	MCCCO-MBG	341	220		128.00	Sold	TWT

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
119	LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/212	C	75	48	4,548	MCCCO-MBG	332	212			Withdrawn	
120	KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/243	C	53	47	3,227	MCCCO-MBG	372	243		126.00	Sold	IBERO
121	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/152	C	6	49	409	DAE	258	152		108.00	Sold	CTCF
122	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/142/	C	4	30	270	DAE	248	142		105.00	Sold	TWT
123	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/023/135	C	34	51	2,091	MCCCO-MBG	181	135		105.00	Sold	IBERO
124	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/142	C	30	47	1,847	MCCCO-MBG	191	142		110.00	Sold	DT
125	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/164	C	59	36	3,576	MCCCO-MBG	247	164		132.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
126	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/228	C	50	33	3,033	MCCCO-MBG	354	228		127.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
127	MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/259	C	48	5	2,885	MCCCO-MBG	393	259		129.00	Sold	IBERO
128	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/162	C	11	27	687	DAE	270	162		111.00	Sold	TWT
129	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/22/08/192	C	7	53	473	DAE	304	192		112.00	Sold	CTCF
130	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/172	C	7	43	463	DAE	282	172		107.00	Sold	TWT
131	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB-23/05/200	B	88	28	5,308	DAE	312	200		140.00	Sold	CTCF
132	MZUZU AMCO/NMB-PLC/012/189	B	146	55	8,815	MCCCO-MBG	290	189		140.00	Sold	TWT
133	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/181	B	110	33	6,633	DAE	293	181		140.00	Sold	IBERO
134	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/019/179	B	113	43	6,823	MCCCO-MBG	267	179		140.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
135	LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/148	B	95	4	5,704	MCCCO-MBG	201	148		140.00	Sold	CTCF
136	KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/156	B	100	36	6,036	MCCCO-MBG	212	156		140.00	Sold	DT
137	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/211	B	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	331	211			Withdrawn	
138	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/211	B	69	54	4,194	MCCCO-MBG	330	211			Withdrawn	
139	KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/242	B	104	59	6,299	MCCCO-MBG	371	242		141.00	Sold	TWT
140	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/151	B	67	49	4,069	DAE	257	151		140.00	Sold	CTCF
141	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/141	B	58	36	3,516	DAE	247	141		140.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
142	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/023/134	B	75	23	4,523	MCCCO-MBG	180	134		140.00	Sold	KAHAWA P

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
143	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/007/171	B	77	57	4,677	MCCCO-MBG	256	171		140.00	Sold	TWT
144	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/141	B	75	17	4,517	MCCCO-MBG	190	141		140.00	Sold	CTCF
145	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/163	B	116	10	6,970	MCCCO-MBG	246	163		143.00	Sold	DT
146	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/227	B	128	56	7,736	MCCCO-MBG	353	227		140.00	Sold	IBERO
147	MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/258	B	91	25	5,485	MCCCO-MBG	392	258		140.00	Sold	CTCF
148	KITUMBALOMO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/042/235	B	57	29	3,449	MCCCO-MBG	362	235		140.00	Sold	IBERO
149	KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/PLC/044/250	B	89	17	5,357	MCCCO-MBG	383	250		143.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
150	KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/219	B	66	26	3,986	MCCCO-MBG	340	219		144.00	Sold	TWT
151	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/161	B	95	0	5,700	DAE	269	161		140.00	Sold	CTCF
152	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/CRDB/22/08/191	B	79	58	4,798	DAE	303	191		140.00	Sold	IBERO
153	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/171	B	98	52	5,932	DAE	281	171		142.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
154	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/199	A	145	31	8,731	DAE	311	199		143.00	Sold	CTCF
155	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/180	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	291	180		143.00	Sold	DT
156	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/180	A	113	3	6,783	DAE	292	180		143.00	Sold	DT
157	{ LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/147	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	200	147		143.00	Sold	TWT
158	{ LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/147	A	98	31	5,911	MCCCO-MBG	199	147		143.00	Sold	IBERO
159	[KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/155	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	211	155		144.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
160	[KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/155	A	91	45	5,505	MCCCO-MBG	210	155		144.00	Sold	TWT
161	KITUMBALOMO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/042/234	A	109	54	6,594	MCCCO-MBG	361	234		145.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
162	{ KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/241	A	60	19	3,619	MCCCO-MBG	369	241		143.00	Sold	CTCF
163	{ KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/241	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	370	241		143.00	Sold	CTCF
164	[MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/188	A	53	24	3,204	MCCCO-MBG	287	188			No bid	
165	[MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/188	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	288	188			No bid	
166	[MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/188	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	289	188			No bid	

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
167	{ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/162	A	103	10	6,190	MCCCO-MBG	244	162		146.00	Sold	DT
168	{ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/162	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	245	162		146.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
169	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/140	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	189	140		143.00	Sold	CTCF
170	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/140	A	59	33	3,573	MCCCO-MBG	188	140		143.00	Sold	TWT
171	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/023/133	A	140	59	8,459	MCCCO-MBG	179	133		145.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
172	{ ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/226	A	66	44	4,004	MCCCO-MBG	350	226		144.00	Sold	CTCF
173	{ ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/226	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	351	226		147.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
174	{ ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/226	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	352	226		146.00	Sold	TWT
175	MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/257	A	150	8	9,008	MCCCO-MBG	391	257		146.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
176	[KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/249	A	76	7	4,567	MCCCO-MBG	381	249		145.00	Sold	CTCF
177	[KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/249	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	382	249		145.00	Sold	DT
178	KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/218	A	126	38	7,598	MCCCO-MBG	339	218		146.00	Sold	TWT
179	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/210	A	131	20	7,880	MCCCO-MBG	327	210			Withdrawn	
180	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/210	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	328	210			Withdrawn	
181	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/210	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	329	210			Withdrawn	
182	[MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/160	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	267	160		146.00	Sold	CTCF
183	[MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/160	A	63	11	3,791	DAE	268	160		145.00	Sold	IBERO
184	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/140	A	159	26	9,566	DAE	246	140		148.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
185	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/150	A	137	6	8,226	DAE	256	150		146.00	Sold	IBERO
186	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/22/08/190	A	145	50	8,750	DAE	302	190		145.00	Sold	CTCF
187	{ ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/170	A	100	0	6,000	DAE	279	170		149.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
188	{ ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/170	A	104	20	6,260	DAE	280	170		147.00	Sold	IBERO
189	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/198	AA	149	18	8,958	DAE	310	198		145.00	Sold	CTCF
190	[LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/146	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	197	146		147.00	Sold	TWT

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
191	[LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/146	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	198	146		146.00	Sold	IBERO
192	[LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/146	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	196	146		146.00	Sold	TWT
193	[LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/146	AA	66	26	3,986	MCCCO-MBG	195	146		146.00	Sold	IBERO
194	{ KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/154	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	208	154		147.00	Sold	DT
195	{ KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/154	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	209	154		146.00	Sold	CTCF
196	{ KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/154	AA	81	21	4,881	MCCCO-MBG	207	154		148.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
197	[KITUMBALOMO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/042/233	AA	70	33	4,233	MCCCO-MBG	359	233		148.00	Sold	DT
198	[KITUMBALOMO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/042/233	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	360	233		150.00	Sold	DT
199	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/209	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	322	209			Withdrawn	
200	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/209	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	323	209			Withdrawn	
201	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/209	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	324	209			Withdrawn	
202	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/209	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	325	209			Withdrawn	
203	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/209	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	326	209			Withdrawn	
204	{ LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/209	AA	64	41	3,881	MCCCO-MBG	321	209			Withdrawn	
205	[KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/240	AA	119	6	7,146	MCCCO-MBG	367	240		148.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
206	[KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/240	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	368	240		148.00	Sold	IBERO
207	{ MZUZU MCOS/NMB-PLC/012/187	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	286	187			Withdrawn	
208	{ MZUZU MCOS/NMB-PLC/012/187	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	285	187			Withdrawn	
209	{ MZUZU MCOS/NMB-PLC/012/187	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	284	187		143.00	Sold	KDP PLC
210	{ MZUZU MCOS/NMB-PLC/012/187	AA	65	2	3,902	MCCCO-MBG	283	187		145.00	Sold	TWT
211	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/179	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	289	179		147.00	Sold	TWT
212	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/179	AA	119	35	7,175	DAE	290	179		146.00	Sold	CTCF
213	{ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/161	AA	68	45	4,125	MCCCO-MBG	241	161		146.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
214	{ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/161	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	242	161		150.00	Sold	DT

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
215	{ KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/161	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	243	161		148.00	Sold	DT
216	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/139	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	187	139		146.00	Sold	KDP PLC
217	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/139	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	186	139		146.00	Sold	IBERO
218	[MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/139	AA	74	19	4,459	MCCCO-MBG	185	139		147.00	Sold	TWT
219	{ ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/023/132	AA	143	57	8,637	MCCCO-MBG	177	132		148.00	Sold	IBERO
220	{ ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/023/132	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	178	132		149.00	Sold	DT
221	[ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/225	AA	108	51	6,531	MCCCO-MBG	346	225		149.00	Sold	TWT
222	[ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/225	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	347	225		147.00	Sold	CTCF
223	[ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/225	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	348	225		147.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
224	[ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/225	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	349	225		149.00	Sold	CTCF
225	{ MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/256	AA	111	27	6,687	MCCCO-MBG	389	256		148.00	Sold	KDP PLC
226	{ MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/256	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	390	256		146.00	Sold	IBERO
227	[KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/248	AA	55	12	3,312	MCCCO-MBG	377	248		150.00	Sold	KDP PLC
228	[KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/248	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	378	248		149.00	Sold	DT
229	[KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/248	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	379	248		151.00	Sold	KDP PLC
230	[KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/248	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	380	248		150.00	Sold	DT
231	{ KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/217	AA	109	55	6,595	MCCCO-MBG	337	217		150.00	Sold	TWT
232	{ KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/217	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG	338	217		153.00	Sold	KDP PLC
233	[MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/139	AA	102	36	6,156	DAE	245	139		150.00	Sold	CTCF
234	[MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/139	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	244	139		150.00	Sold	TWT
235	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/149	AA	155	13	9,313	DAE	255	149		151.00	Sold	CTCF
236	{ MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/159	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	265	159		147.00	Sold	KDP PLC
237	{ MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/159	AA	54	48	3,288	DAE	266	159		146.00	Sold	CTCF
238	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/CRDB/22/08/189	AA	149	18	8,958	DAE	301	189		149.00	Sold	TWT

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
239	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/169	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE	277	169		151.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
240	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/169	AA	96	47	5,807	DAE	278	169		155.00	Sold	KDP PLC
241	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/197	AAA	58	51	3,531	DAE	309	197		148.00	Sold	TWT
242	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/178	AAA	101	0	6,060	DAE	288	178		148.00	Sold	CTCF
243	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/138	AAA	121	1	7,261	DAE	243	138		149.00	Sold	KDP PLC
244	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/148	AAA	85	14	5,114	DAE	254	148		149.00	Sold	IBERO
245	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/158	AAA	71	3	4,263	DAE	264	158		144.00	Sold	CTCF
246	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/CRDB/22/08/188	AAA	61	29	3,689	DAE	300	188		147.00	Sold	TWT
247	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/168	AAA	78	5	4,685	DAE	276	168		145.00	Sold	IBERO
248	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/196	PB	72	24	4,344	DAE	308	196		140.00	Sold	IBERO
249	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CRDB/21/08/177	PB	86	19	5,179	DAE	287	177		140.00	Sold	IBERO
250	KIGOTI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/026/153	PB	77	33	4,653	MCCCO-MBG	206	153		140.00	Sold	DT
251	KITUMBALOMO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/042/232	PB	41	51	2,511	MCCCO-MBG	358	232		140.00	Sold	CTCF
252	LUGARI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/027/208	PB	129	21	7,761	MCCCO-MBG	320	208			Withdrawn	
253	KILOSA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/043/239/	PB	75	12	4,512	MCCCO-MBG	366	239		146.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
254	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/186	PB	133	43	8,023	MCCCO-MBG	282	186			No bid	
255	KINGERIKITI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/031/216	PB	57	9	3,429	MCCCO-MBG	336	216		147.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
256	MIKANGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/024/138	PB	62	56	3,776	MCCCO-MBG	184	138		148.00	Sold	DT
257	KIPAPA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/018/160	PB	78	10	4,690	MCCCO-MBG	240	160		148.00	Sold	DT
258	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/019/176	PB	89	50	5,390	MCCCO-MBG	261	176		149.00	Sold	TWT
259	LONGA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/007/168	PB	57	53	3,473	MCCCO-MBG	251	168		149.00	Sold	TWT
260	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/023/131	PB	53	59	3,239	MCCCO-MBG	176	131		149.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
261	ILELA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/038/224	PB	91	14	5,474	MCCCO-MBG	345	224		147.00	Sold	DT
262	MALI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/041/255	PB	94	34	5,674	MCCCO-MBG	388	255		146.00	Sold	TWT

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	WRN	B.NO	CERT	SOLD	STATUS	BUYER
263	KIHONGO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/044/247	PB	51	55	3,115	MCCCO-MBG	376	247		146.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
264	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/137	PB	47	43	2,863	DAE	242	137		148.00	Sold	IBERO
265	MKUWANI AMCOS/CRDB/18/13/147	PB	46	4	2,764	DAE	253	147		148.00	Sold	KAHAWA P
266	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/19/09/157	PB	83	32	5,012	DAE	263	157		148.00	Sold	IBERO
267	LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/025/145	PB	75	6	4,506	MCCCO-MBG	194	145		145.00	Sold	CTCF
268	MIKALANGA AMCOS/CPU/CRDB/22/08/187	PB	58	52	3,532	DAE	299	187		148.00	Sold	CTCF
269	ILELA AMCOS/NMB/CPU/20/14/167	PB	55	43	3,343	DAE	275	167		149.00	Sold	CTCF
270	KIHANGIMAHUKA AMCOS/CRDB/08/07/57WD M 1 MBG LOT 24	TT	1	28	88	DAE	113	57		55.00	Sold	CTCF
271	LUNDUMATU AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/013/090 WD M 1 MBG LOT 31	TT	1	35	95	MCCCO	122	90		55.00	Sold	CTCF
272	MUUNGANO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/008/051 WD M 1 MBG LOT 34	TT	1	8	68	MCCCO	71	51		55.00	Sold	CTCF
273	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/009/059 WD M 1 MBG LOT 35	TT	1	9	69	MCCCO	80	59		55.00	Sold	TWT
274	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/06/05/36 WD M 1 MBG LOT 58	C	6	14	374	DAE	88	36		74.00	Sold	CTCF
275	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/10/09/74 WD M 1 LOT 59	C	5	55	355	DAE	131	74		78.00	Sold	IBERO
276	LIYOMBO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/009/055 WD M 1 MBG LOT 95	A	96	33	5,793	MCCCO	76	55		140.00	Sold	IBERO