



THE MBINGA COFFEE EXCHANGE

Auction On Thursday, 2nd Noember, 2023

at 10.30 a.m.

AT THE EXCHANGE HALL

SALE NO. TCB/M/4

Bags of Tanzania Coffee Lying at Various Warehouses

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE

1. Sale are subject to Tanzania Coffee Board Rules and Regulations 2013
2. Unless otherwise stated coffee is packed in single sisal bags of 60 Kgs. Net. Tare weight 1.1 Kg. Bids shall be per 50 Kgs.
3. Confirmation of bids not later than 4.00 p.m.
4. Proceeds payable to TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD on or before Prompt date.
5. Nett weight as per WAREHOUSE warrant weights.

PROMPT DATE: 7th NOEMBER, 2023



BREAK DOWN FOR MILD ARABICA COFFEE AS PER ZONE & WAREHOUSES

A: MBINGA COFFEE:

1. MCCCCO LTD.	5,855	BAGS
2. DAE LTD	2,538	BAGS
3. CMS LTD.	22	BAGS
4.LIMA MBINGA	-	BAGS

C: MBEYA/SONGWE COFFEE:

1. MCCCCO LTD	2,247	BAGS
2. CCL-MEYA	336	BAGS
3. CMS LTD - MBOZI	776	BAGS
4.LIMA KWANZA LTD	1,417	BAGS
5. GDM CO.LTD-MBOZI	-	BAGS

D: NORTHERN COFFEE:

1. TCCCCO LTD	-	BAGS
2. CITY COFFEE - MOSHI	-	BAGS
3. GOURMET LTD.	-	BAGS
4. RAFIKI LTD		BAGS
5. ACM LTD - ARUSHA		BAGS

TOTAL	13,191	BAGS
--------------	---------------	-------------

TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD

AUCTION SALE NO.ICB/M/4 TO BE HELD ON THURSDAY,2ND NOVEMBER, 2023

MBINGA COFFEE - 3,703 BAGS

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	CERT	WRN	B.NO	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
1	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/595	F	33	11	1,991	MCCCO-MBG		884	595	50.00	Sold	DORMAN
2	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB/021/152	F	2	36	156	CMS-MBG		100	152		WD	
3	KITESA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/095/645	F	8	33	513	MCCCO-MBG		970	645		WD	
4	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/440	F	31	32	1,892	MCCCO-MBG		664	440	58.00	Sold	IBERO
5	LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/487	F	15	33	933	MCCCO-MBG		733	487		No bid	
6	NYONI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/088/661	F	54	15	3,255	MCCCO-MBG		992	661	56.00	Sold	TWT
7	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/391	F	11	51	711	DAE LTD		667	391	58.00	Sold	IBERO
8	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/638	F	23	49	1,429	MCCCO-MBG		963	638	59.00	Sold	DORMAN
9	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB/021/151	TT	2	25	145	CMS-MBG		99	151	75.00	Sold	TWT
10	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/594	TT	8	51	531	MCCCO-MBG		883	594	75.00	Sold	TWT
11	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/390	TT	6	6	366	DAE LTD		666	390		No bid	
12	NYONI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/088/660	TT	10	11	611	MCCCO-MBG		991	660	75.00	Sold	DORMAN
13	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/439	TT	3	5	185	MCCCO-MBG		663	439	75.00	Sold	DORMAN
14	LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/486	TT	2	24	144	MCCCO-MBG		732	486	75.00	Sold	TWT
15	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/637	TT	3	6	186	MCCCO-MBG		962	637	75.00	Sold	IBERO
16	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/593	AF	21	12	1,272	MCCCO-MBG		882	593	99.00	Sold	IBERO
17	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/389	AF	2	31	151	DAE LTD		665	389	80.00	Sold	IBERO
18	KITESA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/095/644	AF	1	57	117	MCCCO-MBG		969	644		No bid	
19	LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/485	AF	11	38	698	MCCCO-MBG		731	485	80.00	Sold	IBERO
20	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/438	AF	22	56	1,376	MCCCO-MBG		662	438	84.00	Sold	IBERO
21	NYONI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/088/659	AF	16	33	993	MCCCO-MBG		990	659	105.00	Sold	IBERO
22	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/636	AF	13	20	800	MCCCO-MBG		961	636	104.00	Sold	DORMAN

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	CERT	WRN	B.NO	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
23	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/388	E	2	20	140	DAE LTD		664	388		No bid	
24	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/678	C	68	50	4,130	MCCCCO-MBG		1018	678		WD	
25	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/387	C	19	30	1,170	DAE LTD		663	387	110.00	Sold	TWT
26	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB/021/150	C	11	0	660	CMS-MBG		98	150	110.00	Sold	TWT
27	KITESA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/095/643	C	11	45	705	MCCCCO-MBG		968	643	110.00	Sold	TWT
28	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/437	C	82	14	4,934	MCCCCO-MBG		661	437	118.00	Sold	IBERO
29	LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/484	C	29	16	1,756	MCCCCO-MBG		730	484	115.00	Sold	DORMAN
30	NYONI AMCOS/NMB-PLC/088/658	C	137	12	8,232	MCCCCO-MBG		989	658	118.00	Sold	DORMAN
31	KITESA AMCOSECPU/NMB-PLC/094/635	C	72	35	4,355	MCCCCO-MBG		960	635	123.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
32	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/677	B	124	36	7,476	MCCCCO-MBG		1017	677		WD	
33	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB/021/149	B	71	11	4,271	CMS-MBG		97	149		No bid	
34	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/386	B	149	33	8,973	DAE LTD		662	386		No bid	
35] NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/436	B	100	0	6,000	MCCCCO-MBG		660	436	138.00	Sold	DORMAN
36] NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/436	B	84	24	5,064	MCCCCO-MBG		659	436		No bid	
37	} MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/673	B	100	0	6,000	MCCCCO-MBG		1010	673	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
38	} MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/673	B	61	9	3,669	MCCCCO-MBG		1009	673	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
39	KITESA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/095/642	B	26	51	1,611	MCCCCO-MBG		967	642		WD	
40	LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/483	B	58	41	3,521	MCCCCO-MBG		729	483	135.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
41] KITESA AMCOSECPU/NMB-PLC/094/634	B	100	0	6,000	MCCCCO-MBG		958	634	137.00	Sold	DORMAN
42] KITESA AMCOSECPU/NMB-PLC/094/634	B	62	42	3,762	MCCCCO-MBG		958	634	135.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
43	} MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/676	A	123	5	7,385	MCCCCO-MBG		1015	676	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
44	} MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/676	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCCO-MBG		1016	676		WD	
45	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB/021/148	A	74	38	4,478	CMS-MBG		96	148		WD	
46] MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/385	A	126	46	7,606	DAE LTD		661	385		WD	

L/NO		DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	CERT	WRN	B.NO	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
47]	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/385	A	100	0	6,000	DAE LTD		660	385		WD	
48	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/435	A	73	12	4,392	MCCCO-MBG		655	435		WD	
49	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/435	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		656	435	136.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
50	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/435	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		657	435	136.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
51	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/435	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		658	435	136.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
52]	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/672	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		1007	672	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
53]	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/672	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		1008	672	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
54]	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/672	A	79	44	4,784	MCCCO-MBG		1006	672		WD	
55		LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/482	A	116	5	6,965	MCCCO-MBG		728	482	137.00	Sold	DORMAN
56		KITESA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/095/641	A	37	32	2,252	MCCCO-MBG		966	641		WD	
57]	KITESA AMCOSCPU/NMB-PLC/094/633	A	143	48	8,628	MCCCO-MBG		955	633	137.00	Sold	DORMAN
58]	KITESA AMCOSCPU/NMB-PLC/094/633	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		956	633	136.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
59]	KITESA AMCOSCPU/NMB-PLC/094/633	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		957	633	137.00	Sold	DORMAN
60	}	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/675	AA	110	21	6,621	MCCCO-MBG		1012	675		WD	
61	}	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/675	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		1013	675		WD	
62	}	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/675	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		1014	675	142.00	Sold	DORMAN
63		MZUZU AMCOS/NMB/021/147	AA	87	0	5,220	CMS-MBG		95	147		WD	
64]	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/384	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE LTD		658	384	137.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
65]	MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/384	AA	99	55	5,995	DAE LTD		659	384		WD	
66	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/434	AA	128	0	7,680	MCCCO-MBG		650	434	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
67	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/434	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		651	434	137.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
68	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/434	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		652	434	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
69	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/434	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		653	434		WD	
70	}	NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/434	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		654	434	140.00	Sold	DORMAN

L/NO		DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	CERT	WRN	B.NO	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
71]	LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/481	AA	127	0	7,620	MCCCO-MBG		726	481		WD	
72]	LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/481	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		727	481		WD	
73		KITESA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/095/640	AA	60	40	3,640	MCCCO-MBG		965	640	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
74	}	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/671	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		1003	671		WD	
75	}	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/671	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		1004	671	142.00	Sold	DORMAN
76	}	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/671	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		1005	671		WD	
77	}	MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/671	AA	97	42	5,862	MCCCO-MBG		1002	671		WD	
78]	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/632	AA	119	47	7,187	MCCCO-MBG		949	632	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
79]	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/632	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		950	632		WD	
80]	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/632	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		951	632		WD	
81]	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/632	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		952	632	137.00	Sold	K.PAMOJA
82]	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/632	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		953	632	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
83]	KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/632	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		954	632	140.00	Sold	DORMAN
84		MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/383	AAA	79	29	4,769	DAE LTD		657	383		WD	
85		MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/091/674	PB	97	24	5,844	MCCCO-MBG		1011	674		WD	
86		MZUZU AMCOS/NMB/021/146	PB	36	36	2,196	CMS-MBG		94	146		No bid	
87		MKALANGA AMCOS/NMB/43/09/382	PB	92	31	5,551	DAE LTD		656	382		WD	
88		KITESA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/095/639	PB	15	37	937	MCCCO-MBG		964	639	137.00	Sold	DORMAN
89		NAHONGO AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/060/433	PB	131	41	7,901	MCCCO-MBG		649	433		WD	
90		LINGOMBA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/076/480	PB	53	39	3,219	MCCCO-MBG		725	480	137.00	Sold	DORMAN
91		MKOHA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/036/670	PB	146	54	8,814	MCCCO-MBG		1001	670		WD	
92		KITESA AMCOCPU/NMB-PLC/094/631	PB	95	37	5,737	MCCCO-MBG		948	631	137.00	Sold	DORMAN
93		UNANGO AMCOS/NMB/MBG/03/15 WD M 3 LOT 1 MBG	F	1	28	88	CMS-MBG		35	15		No bid	
94		MAPENDO AMCOS/NMB/16/113 WD M4 LOT 10 MBY	F	2	0	120	CMS-MBG		58	113		WD	

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	CERT	WRN	B.NO	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
95	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/079/521 WD M3 LOT 30 MOSHI	TT	2	18	138	MCCCO-MBG		781	521		No bid	
96	UKIMO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/077/513 WD M3 LOT 29 MOSHI	TT	1	26	86	MCCCO-MBG		768	513		No bid	
97	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/191 WD M2 LOT 80 MBG	AF	9	55	595	MCCCO-MBG		292	191	72.00	Sold	TWT
98	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/202 WD M2 LOT102 MBG	E	1	5	65	DAE LTD		314	202		No bid	
99	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/16/09/143 WD M2 LOT 103 MBG	E	1	3	63	DAE LTD		249	143		No bid	
100	KIPEGEI AMCOS/NMB/23/05/201WD M2 LOT108 MBG	C	10	0	600	DAE LTD		313	201	108.00	Sold	TWT
101	MIKALANGA AMCOS CRDB/21/08/182 WD M2 LOT 109 MBG	C	12	8	728	DAE LTD		294	182	108.00	Sold	TWT
102	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/190 WD M2 LOT 110 MBG	C	71	26	4,286	MCCCO-MBG		291	190	108.00	Sold	TWT
103] MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/188 WD M2 LOT 164 MBG	A	53	34	3,214	MCCCO-MBG		287	188		No bid	
104] MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/188 WD M2 LOT 165 MBG	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		288	188		No bid	
105] MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/188 WD M2 LOT 166 MBG	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		289	188		No bid	
106	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB/40/12/336 WD M4 LOT 56 MBY	A	100	0	6,000	DAE LTD		589	336		WD	
107	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/079/517 WD M3 LOT 48 MOSHI	A	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		777	517		WD	
108	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB/38/11/326 WD M3 LOT 51 MOSHI	A	100	0	6,000	DAE LTD		574	326		WD	
109	LUWIHI AMCOS/CRDB/25/06/217 WD M3 LOT 182 MBG	AA	100	0	6,000	DAE LTD		331	217		WD	
110] MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/187 WD M2 LOT 202 MBG	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		286	187		WD	
111] MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/187 WD M2 LOT 208 MBG	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		285	187		WD	
112] LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/079/516 WD M3 LOT 54 MOSHI	AA	86	44	5,204	MCCCO-MBG		771	516		WD	
113] LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/079/516 WD M3 LOT 55 MOSHI	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		772	516		WD	
114] LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/079/516 WD M3 LOT 56 MOSHI	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		773	516		WD	
115] LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/079/516 WD M3 LOT 57 MOSHI	AA	100	0	6,000	MCCCO-MBG		774	516		WD	
116	MZUZU AMCOS/NMB-PLC/012/186 WD M2 LOT 254 MBG	PB	133	43	8,023	MCCCO-MBG		282	186		No bid	
117	UKIMO AMCOS/NMB-PLC/077/507 WD M3 LOT 64 MOSHI	PB	33	6	1,986	MCCCO-MBG		762	507		WD	
118	LAINI AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/079/515 WD M3 LOT 65 MOSHI	PB	70	4	4,204	MCCCO-MBG		770	515		WD	

L/NO	DESCRIPTION	GRADE	BAGS	PKTS	N/KGS	W/H	CERT	WRN	B.NO	PRICE	STATUS	BUYER
119	LINDA AMCOS/NMB-PLC/080/569	PB	103	2	6,182	MCCCO-MBG		849	569		WD	
120	MAKONGA AMCOS/CRDB-PLC/83/555 WD M4 LOT 113 MBY	PB	25	0	1,500	MCCCO-MBG		828	555	137.00	Sold	DORMAN