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Auction No : TCB/M/1 Auction Date : 14/AUG/2025
MBINGA - 8,971 Bags | 538,281 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2036 F 29 40 1,780 | MBINGA COFFEE 182.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
2 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/002/1120 F 10 52 652 | DAE LTD 182.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
3 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1085 F 2 43 163 | DAE LTD 180.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
4 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- F 72 15 4,335 | DAE LTD 202.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1054
5 Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing F 50 2 3,002 | DAE LTD 208.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- (TANZANIA) LIMITED
2026/874/001/1103
6 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- F 7 28 448 | DAE LTD 211.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/001/1064 LIMITED
7 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- F 3 41 221 | DAE LTD 210.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/002/1074
8 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1093 F 6 8 368 | DAE LTD 184.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
9 Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing TT 24 41 1,481 | DAE LTD 213.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- LIMITED
2026/874/001/1104
10 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2037 TT 3 45 225 | MBINGA COFFEE 175.00 No bid -
CURING
11 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- TT 33 47 2,027 | DAE LTD 220.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/001/1055 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
12 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- TT 4 4 244 | DAE LTD 220.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/001/1065
13 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- TT 4 44 284 | DAE LTD 225.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/002/1075 LIMITED
14 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1086 T 0 50 50 | DAE LTD 171.00 No bid -
15 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1094 TT 3 16 196 | DAE LTD 210.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD
16 Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing AF 1 52 112 | DAE LTD 185.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- LIMITED
2026/874/001/1105
17 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AF 7 24 444 | DAE LTD 204.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/001/1056 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
18 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AF 3 37 217 | DAE LTD 194.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/869/001/1066 SON LTD
19 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AF 2 31 151 | DAE LTD 185.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/002/1076 LIMITED
20 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2038 AF 18 0 1,080 | MBINGA COFFEE 180.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
21 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1095 AF 4 9 249 | DAE LTD 218.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD
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22 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 8 0 480 | DAE LTD 168.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/001/1057 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
23 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- 0 52 52 | DAE LTD 153.00 No bid -
2026/869/001/1067
24 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- 1 13 73 | DAE LTD 161.00 No bid -
2026/869/002/1077
25 Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 3 49 229 | DAE LTD 160.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- SON LTD
2026/874/001/1106
26 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1096 1 34 94 | DAE LTD 145.00 No bid -
27 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1115 20 56 1,256 | DAE LTD 244.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
28 Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 83 54 5,034 | DAELTD 240.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- LIMITED
2026/874/001/1107
29] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 250.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1058
30] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 27 33 1,653 | DAE LTD 252.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1058
31 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2039 76 23 4,583 | MBINGA COFFEE 250.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
32 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1087 4 23 263 | DAE LTD Withdrawn | -
33 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- 11 39 699 | DAE LTD 240.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/001/1068 LIMITED
34 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- 5 5 305 | DAE LTD 240.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/869/002/1078 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
35 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1097 8 33 513 | DAE LTD 247.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
36} Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1116 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
37} Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1116 57 5 3,425 | DAELTD 270.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
38} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- TRADING COMPANY
2026/874/001/1108 LIMITED
39} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- PLANTATION LTD
2026/874/001/1108
40} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 264.00 No bid -
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/874/001/1108
41} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 99 49 5,989 | DAE LTD 274.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/874/001/1108
42 Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 65 34 3,934 | DAE LTD 260.00 No bid -
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/874/001/1108
43] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/001/1059 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
44] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/001/1059 LIMITED
45] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/186/001/1059
46] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 271.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/001/1059 LIMITED
47] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 274.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

2026/186/001/1059
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48] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/001/1059 Limited
49] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/001/1059 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
50] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/186/001/1059 PLANTATION LTD
51] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 12 25 745 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/001/1059 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
52) KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2040 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 270.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
53) KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2040 29 34 1,774 | MBINGA COFFEE 270.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
54 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1088 38 4 2,284 | DAELTD 251.00 No bid -
55] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/869/001/1069 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
56] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- 12 57 777 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/869/001/1069 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
57 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- 54 12 3,252 | DAE LTD 275.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/002/1079 LIMITED
58 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1098 74 31 4,471 | DAE LTD 274.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
59} Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1117 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 280.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
60} Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1117 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 275.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
61} Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1117 17 52 1,072 | DAELTD 275.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
62] Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 280.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- TRADING COMPANY
2026/874/001/1109 LIMITED
63] Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 282.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- LIMITED
2026/874/001/1109
64] Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 288.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/874/001/1109
65] Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing 89 48 5,388 | DAE LTD 275.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- LIMITED
2026/874/001/1109
66} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 291.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/001/1060 Limited
67} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 276.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1060
68} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 279.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/001/1060 Limited
69} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 289.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1060
70} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 275.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/001/1060 Limited
71} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 286.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/186/001/1060 PLANTATION LTD
72} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 287.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1060
73} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 284.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

2026/186/001/1060
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74} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- A 31 17 1,877 | DAE LTD 275.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/001/1060 Limited
75] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2041 A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 292.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
CURING
76] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2041 A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 293.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
CURING PLANTATION LTD
77] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2041 A 30 9 1,809 | MBINGA COFFEE 275.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
78] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 291.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/869/001/1070
79] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- A 78 19 4,699 | DAELTD 288.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/001/1070
80] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 293.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/869/002/1080 Limited
81] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- A 10 10 610 | DAE LTD 285.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/002/1080 LIMITED
82 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1089 A 38 45 2,325 | DAE LTD 276.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
83) Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1099 A 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 298.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
84) Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1099 A 17 41 1,061 | DAE LTD 284.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
85) Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1118 AA 100 0 6,000 | DAELTD 280.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
86) Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1118 AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 293.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
PLANTATION LTD
87) Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1118 AA 89 10 5,350 | DAE LTD 280.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
88} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 293.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/874/001/1110
89} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 285.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- Limited
2026/874/001/1110
90} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 281.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- Limited
2026/874/001/1110
91} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing AA 68 9 4,089 | DAE LTD 283.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- LIMITED
2026/874/001/1110
92) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 281.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1061
93) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 281.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1061
94) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 282.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/186/001/1061 PLANTATION LTD
95) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 286.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1061
96) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 291.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/186/001/1061
97) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 283.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1061
98) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 283.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/001/1061 Limited
99) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 281.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1061
100) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 15 31 931 | DAE LTD 284.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/186/001/1061 PLANTATION LTD
101] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2042 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 299.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
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102] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2042 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 306.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
CURING

103] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2042 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 309.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING

104] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2042 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 315.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
CURING SON LTD

105] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2042 AA 59 6 3,546 | MBINGA COFFEE 303.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING

106 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1090 AA 40 56 2,456 | DAE LTD 300.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &

SON LTD

107) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 307.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/869/001/1071

108) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 301.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/001/1071

109) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AA 24 52 1,492 | DAELTD 296.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/001/1071

110} Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 301.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/002/1081

111} Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AA 64 9 3,849 | DAE LTD 304.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/002/1081

112] Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1100 AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 303.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

113] Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1100 AA 43 38 2,618 | DAE LTD 291.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &

SON LTD

114] Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1113 AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

115] Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1113 AAA 99 51 5,991 | DAELTD Withdrawn | -

116) Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 298.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- PLANTATION LTD
2026/874/001/1111

117) Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing AAA 67 37 4,057 | DAE LTD 291.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- SON LTD
2026/874/001/1111

118} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1062

119} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/001/1062 LIMITED

120} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/001/1062

121} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/001/1062 Limited

122} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 28 12 1,692 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/186/001/1062 SON LTD

123 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1091 AAA 17 1 1,021 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &

SON LTD

124) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 292.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/869/001/1072

125) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AAA 34 38 2,078 | DAE LTD Withdrawn | -
2026/869/001/1072

126) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/002/1082

127) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AAA 10 47 647 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/869/002/1082 SON LTD

128 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1101 AAA 85 13 5,113 | DAE LTD 299.00 Sold KILIMANJARO

PLANTATION LTD

129 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/1119 PB 74 52 4,492 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

130} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing PB 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 280.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/874/001/1112
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131} Kitumbalomo Agricultural Marketing PB 29 32 1,772 | DAE LTD 274.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- LIMITED
2026/874/001/1112

132) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 271.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/001/1063 Limited

133) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 285.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/186/001/1063 PLANTATION LTD

134) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- PB 75 29 4,529 | DAE LTD 276.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/001/1063 LIMITED

135 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2043 PB 80 37 4,837 | MBINGA COFFEE 292.00 Sold KILIMANJARO

CURING PLANTATION LTD

136 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1092 PB 12 15 735 | DAE LTD 289.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

137 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- PB 46 58 2,818 | DAE LTD 279.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/869/001/1073 Limited

138 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- PB 34 38 2,078 | DAE LTD 289.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/869/002/1083

139 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1102 PB 53 48 3,228 | DAE LTD 289.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

140 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1084 uG 6 47 407 | DAE LTD 198.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)

LIMITED
MBOZI - 1,336 Bags | 80,205 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
141 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/160 F 35 24 2,124 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 215.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
WAREHOUSE (TANZANIA) LIMITED
142 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/159 T 59 15 3,555 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 216.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
WAREHOUSE LIMITED
143 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/158 AF 37 16 2,236 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
WAREHOUSE TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
144 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/156 C 66 1 3,961 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 250.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
WAREHOUSE (TANZANIA) LIMITED
145 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/157 E 7 52 472 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
146} Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/155 B 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
147} Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/155 B 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
148} Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/155 B 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
149} Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/155 B 96 50 5,810 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
150} Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/154 A 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
151} Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/154 A 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
152} Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/154 A 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
153} Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/154 A 22 15 1,335 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
154) Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/153 AA 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -
WAREHOUSE
155) Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/153 AA 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 339.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
WAREHOUSE PLANTATION LTD
156) Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/153 AA 100 0 6,000 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn | -

WAREHOUSE
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157) Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/153 AA 13 33 813 | LIMA KWANZA FARM Withdrawn

WAREHOUSE
158 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/152 PB 98 19 5,899 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 325.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
WAREHOUSE PLANTATION LTD

Issued by : TCB SYSTEM
Date Issued : 2026-01-16 17:18:00
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