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MBINGA - 4,923 Bags | 295,395 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative F 5 31 331 | MBINGA COFFEE No bid -
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2124 CURING
2 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- F 10 3 603 | MBINGA COFFEE 229.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/79/001/2132 CURING
3 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- F 9 46 586 | MBINGA COFFEE 235.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/79/002/2140 CURING LIMITED
4 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- F 6 26 386 | DAE LTD 244.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/004/1189 LIMITED
5 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- F 7 48 468 | DAE LTD No bid -
2026/859/001/1210
6 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- F 19 0 1,140 | DAE LTD 229.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/004/1199 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
7 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1220 F 5 0 300 | DAE LTD 237.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD
8 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1230 F 5 58 358 | DAE LTD 225.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD
9 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1181 F 2 56 176 | DAE LTD 239.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
10 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- TT 10 0 600 | DAE LTD No bid -
2026/186/004/1200
11 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative TT 5 52 352 | MBINGA COFFEE 223.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2125 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
12 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- TT 6 44 404 | MBINGA COFFEE 215.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/79/001/2133 CURING LIMITED
13 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- TT 2 7 127 | DAE LTD 233.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/859/001/1211
14 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1221 TT 3 38 218 | DAE LTD 230.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
15 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1182 TT 2 56 176 | DAE LTD 237.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
16 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- TT 2 16 136 | DAE LTD 246.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/004/1190 LIMITED
17 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- TT 3 53 233 | MBINGA COFFEE 234.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/79/002/2141 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
18 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1231 TT 5 0 300 | DAE LTD 246.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
19 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AF 9 53 593 | MBINGA COFFEE 240.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2126 CURING LIMITED
20 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- AF 9 28 568 | MBINGA COFFEE 244.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/79/001/2134 CURING Limited
21 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AF 5 4 304 | DAE LTD 249.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/186/004/1201 LTD
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22 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1222 AF 3 20 200 | DAE LTD 257.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
23 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- AF 4 12 252 | MBINGA COFFEE 250.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/79/002/2142 CURING
24 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- AF 5 0 300 | DAE LTD 247.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/859/001/1212 LTD
25 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AF 6 3 363 | DAE LTD 262.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/869/004/1191 LTD
26 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1232 AF 4 2 242 | DAE LTD 257.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD
27 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- E 3 32 212 | DAE LTD 217.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/004/1202 LIMITED
28 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1233 E 0 54 54 | DAE LTD 202.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
29 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1223 E 1 31 91 | DAELTD 223.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited
30 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- E 5 3 303 | DAE LTD No bid -
2026/859/001/1213
31 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- E 0 51 51 | DAELTD 206.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/004/1192 LIMITED
32 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative © 15 36 936 | MBINGA COFFEE 270.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2127 CURING
33 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- C 40 13 2,413 | MBINGA COFFEE 272.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/79/001/2135 CURING
34 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- C 23 20 1,400 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/186/004/1203
35 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1224 & 8 32 512 | DAE LTD 272.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD
36 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- C 10 16 616 | DAE LTD 272.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/859/001/1214 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
37 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- © 10 0 600 | DAE LTD 272.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/869/004/1193
38 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1234 © 11 44 704 | DAE LTD 272.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD
39 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- C 44 0 2,640 | MBINGA COFFEE 270.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/79/002/2143 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
40 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1183 C 3 53 233 | DAE LTD 273.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
41 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative B 31 17 1,877 | MBINGA COFFEE 306.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2128 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
42 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- B 67 31 4,051 | MBINGA COFFEE 310.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/79/001/2136 CURING LIMITED
43} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 311.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/004/1204 Limited
44} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- B 84 28 5,068 | DAE LTD 313.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/004/1204 LIMITED
45 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1225 B 40 16 2,416 | DAELTD 314.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
46 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- B 76 1 4,561 | DAE LTD 307.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/859/001/1215 LTD
47} Mikalanga Amcos/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 320.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/869/004/1194 LTD
48} Mikalanga Amcos/2025- B 5) 8 308 | DAE LTD 314.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/869/004/1194
49 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1235 B 48 56 2,936 | DAE LTD 320.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
50 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- B 82 7 4,927 | MBINGA COFFEE 322.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/79/002/2144 CURING Limited
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51 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1184 B 53 51 3,231 | DAELTD 322.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

52 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative A 82 58 4,978 | MBINGA COFFEE 318.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2129 CURING LIMITED

53] Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 324.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/79/001/2137 CURING Limited

54] Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- A 0 58 58 | MBINGA COFFEE 311.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/79/001/2137 CURING LTD

55] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 324.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/004/1205 Limited

56] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 321.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/186/004/1205

57] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- A 68 5 4,085 | DAE LTD 321.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/186/004/1205 Limited

58 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1226 A 48 0 2,880 | DAELTD 321.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

59 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- A 99 24 5,964 | DAE LTD 320.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/859/001/1216 LIMITED

60} Mikalanga Amcos/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 325.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/869/004/1195 LTD

61} Mikalanga Amcos/2025- A 69 58 4,198 | DAE LTD 325.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/869/004/1195 LTD

62 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1236 A 69 29 4,169 | DAE LTD 322.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)

LIMITED

63} Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 325.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/79/002/2145 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED

64} Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- A 21 34 1,294 | MBINGA COFFEE 323.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/79/002/2145 CURING

65) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1185 A 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 327.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)

LTD

66) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1185 A 16 25 985 | DAE LTD 326.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

67} Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 329.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2130 CURING LTD

68} Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 328.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2130 CURING

69} Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 9 38 578 | MBINGA COFFEE 326.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2130 CURING LIMITED

70] Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 333.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/79/001/2138 CURING PLANTATION LTD

71] Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- AA 36 37 2,197 | MBINGA COFFEE 330.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/79/001/2138 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED

72} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 330.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/186/004/1206

73} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 331.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/004/1206 LIMITED

74} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 334.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/186/004/1206

75} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AA 1 28 88 | DAE LTD 327.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/004/1206 LIMITED

76 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1227 AA 54 5 3,245 | DAELTD 334.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

77) NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- AA 99 51 5,991 | DAE LTD 330.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/859/001/1217 LIMITED

78) NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- AA 35 9 2,109 | DAE LTD 330.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/859/001/1217 LIMITED
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79] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 334.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/004/1196
80] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 338.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/004/1196
81] Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AA 39 50 2,390 | DAE LTD 341.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/869/004/1196
82 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1237 AA 78 54 4,734 | DAE LTD 336.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
83) Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 339.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/79/002/2146 CURING
84) Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- AA 64 28 3,868 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/79/002/2146 CURING
85) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1186 AA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 339.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
86) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1186 AA 82 7 4,927 | DAE LTD 340.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
PLANTATION LTD
87] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 335.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/186/004/1207
88] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 334.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/186/004/1207 LTD
89] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 331.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/004/1207 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
90] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- AAA 49 9 2,949 | DAE LTD 331.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/186/004/1207 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
91 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1228 AAA 29 0 1,740 | DAE LTD 331.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited
92] NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 339.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/859/001/1218 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
93] NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- AAA 0 24 24 | DAE LTD 330.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/859/001/1218 LIMITED
94) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 337.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/869/004/1197
95) Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AAA 55 53 3,353 | DAELTD 337.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/869/004/1197 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
96 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1238 AAA 43 21 2,601 | DAE LTD 337.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
97} llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1187 AAA 100 0 6,000 | DAE LTD 339.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD
98} llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1187 AAA 13 18 798 | DAE LTD 339.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
99 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative PB 24 25 1,465 | MBINGA COFFEE 327.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2131 CURING LIMITED
100 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- PB 45 58 2,758 | MBINGA COFFEE 330.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/79/001/2139 CURING
101 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- PB 98 42 5,922 | DAELTD 323.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/004/1208 LIMITED
102 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/003/1229 PB 24 30 1,470 | DAE LTD 330.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
103 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025- PB 44 26 2,666 | DAE LTD 330.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/859/001/1219 LTD
104 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- PB 64 8 3,848 | DAE LTD 335.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/869/004/1198 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
105 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/004/1239 PB 31 42 1,902 | DAE LTD 332.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
106 Muungano AMCOS MBINGA/2025- PB 55 23 3,323 | MBINGA COFFEE 335.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

2026/79/002/2147

CURING
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107 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1188 PB 38 18 2,298 | DAELTD 325.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
108 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/001/1180 UG 7 38 458 | DAE LTD 230.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
267 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1086 TT 0 57 57 | DAELTD 205.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
268 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- E 0 59 59 | DAE LTD 202.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/869/001/1067 LIMITED
269 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- E 1 20 80 | DAE LTD No bid -
2026/869/002/1077
270 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1096 E 1 41 101 | DAE LTD No bid -
271 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- E 2 55 175 | DAE LTD No bid -
2026/186/002/1124
272 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025- E 1 47 107 | DAE LTD 201.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/186/003/1134 LIMITED
273 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1087 C 4 30 270 | DAE LTD No bid -
274 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1088 B 38 11 2,291 | DAELTD 329.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited
275 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- AAA 34 46 2,086 | DAE LTD 336.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/869/001/1072 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
IYUNGA MBEYA - 5,953 Bags | 357,191 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
109 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY F 8 32 512 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 211.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1074 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
110 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 12 39 759 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 220.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/37/001/1110 WH
111 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- F 10 0 600 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 231.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/309/002/1065 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
112 Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative F 17 18 1,038 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 237.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1119 WH
113 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 10 0 600 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 239.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/35/001/1092 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
114 IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- F 13 6 786 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 243.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/88/001/1101 WH
115 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 9 26 566 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 234.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/168/001/1083 WH LIMITED
116 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 6 30 390 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 238.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/9/002/1145 WH
117 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 29 24 1,764 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 249.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/37/002/1163 WH
118 Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 30 0 1,800 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 235.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/34/001/1128 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
119 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 11 36 696 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 240.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/9/003/1154 WH
120 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 10 18 618 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 242.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/9/001/1137 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
121 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY TT 17 18 1,038 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 254.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)

AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1073

WH

LTD
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122 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- TT 11 10 670 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 256.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/309/002/1064 WH

123 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 16 38 998 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 259.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/168/001/1082 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

124 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 20 38 1,238 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 262.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/35/001/1091 WH

125 Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative TT 24 0 1,440 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 257.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1118 WH LIMITED

126 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 45 37 2,737 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 260.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/37/001/1109 WH

127 IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- T 29 0 1,740 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 264.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/88/001/1100 WH

128 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 19 0 1,140 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 273.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/9/002/1144 WH LTD

129 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 43 25 2,605 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 268.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/37/002/1162 WH

130 Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 51 13 3,073 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 262.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/34/001/1127 WH LIMITED

131 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 25 41 1,541 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 260.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/9/003/1153 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

132 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 24 24 1,464 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 260.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/9/001/1136 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

133 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY AF 14 5 845 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 261.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1072 WH LIMITED

134 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 8 47 527 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 253.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/168/001/1081 WH LTD

135 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- AF 6 24 384 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 263.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/309/002/1063 WH TRADING COMPANY

LIMITED

136 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 9 0 540 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 263.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/35/001/1090 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

137 Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AF 12 46 766 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 266.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1117 WH

138 IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- AF 15 0 900 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 269.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/88/001/1099 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

139 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 20 52 1,252 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 263.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/37/001/1108 WH

140 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 15 29 929 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 268.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/9/002/1143 WH

141 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 30 8 1,808 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 265.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/37/002/1161 WH LIMITED

142 Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 49 35 2,975 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 276.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/34/001/1126 WH LTD

143 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 22 0 1,320 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 273.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/9/003/1152 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

144 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 16 18 978 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 265.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/9/001/1135 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

145 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY C 5 37 337 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya No bid -
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1071 WH

146 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- (03 9 39 579 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 274.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/168/001/1080 WH

147 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- C 11 36 696 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 272.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/309/002/1062 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

148 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- C 13 24 804 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 274.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

2026/35/001/1089

WH
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149 Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 17 37 1,057 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 287.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1116 WH LTD

150 IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- 13 0 780 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 276.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/88/001/1098 WH

151 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- 20 55 1,255 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 283.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/37/001/1107 WH

152 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- 9 10 550 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 277.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/309/001/1056 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

153 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- 5 33 333 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 272.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/9/002/1142 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

154 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- 33 37 2,017 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 282.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/37/002/1160 WH

155 Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- 33 8 1,988 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 274.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/34/001/1125 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

156 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- 11 0 660 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 272.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/9/003/1151 WH

157 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- 14 0 840 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 284.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/9/001/1134 WH

158 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY 64 36 3,876 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 323.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1070 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

159 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- 79 2 4,742 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 324.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/168/001/1079 WH LTD

160 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- 65 20 3,920 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 326.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/309/002/1061 WH

161 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- 96 40 5,800 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 329.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/35/001/1088 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

162] lteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 331.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1115 WH LTD

163] Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 83 43 5,023 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 330.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1115 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

164} IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 334.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/88/001/1097 WH LTD

165} IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- 9 29 569 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 336.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/88/001/1097 WH LIMITED

166] Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 336.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/37/001/1106 WH LIMITED

167] Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/37/001/1106 WH

168] Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- 28 29 1,709 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 332.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/37/001/1106 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

169} Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 337.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/37/002/1159 WH

170 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- 48 19 2,899 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 337.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/309/001/1055 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

171 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- 59 23 3,563 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 335.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/9/002/1141 WH LTD

172} Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 330.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/37/002/1159 WH

173} Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- 54 0 3,240 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 331.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/37/002/1159 WH TRADING COMPANY

LIMITED
174] Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

2026/34/001/1124

WH
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175] Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/34/001/1124 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

176] Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 70 21 4,221 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 341.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/34/001/1124 WH LIMITED

177 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 96 19 5,779 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/9/003/1150 WH LIMITED

178) Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 341.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/9/001/1133 WH Limited

179) Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 30 4 1,804 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/9/001/1133 WH Limited

180 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY A 56 48 3,408 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 343.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1069 WH LTD

181 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 43 49 2,629 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 343.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/168/001/1078 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

182 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- A 34 0 2,040 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 339.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/309/002/1060 WH Limited

183 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 64 49 3,889 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 341.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/35/001/1087 WH

184} Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 346.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1114 WH Limited

185} Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative A 14 42 882 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1114 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

186) IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 347.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/88/001/1096 WH LTD

187) IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 3 28 208 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 343.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/88/001/1096 WH

188] Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 345.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/37/001/1105 WH

189] Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 48 42 2,922 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/37/001/1105 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

190 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- A 16 34 994 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 342.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/309/001/1054 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

191 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 64 26 3,866 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 348.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/9/002/1140 WH LTD

192] Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 347.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/37/002/1158 WH

193] Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 344.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/37/002/1158 WH LTD

194] Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 3 41 221 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 338.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/37/002/1158 WH LIMITED

195} Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 348.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/34/001/1123 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

196} Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 94 15 5,655 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 345.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/34/001/1123 WH

197} Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 346.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/9/003/1149 WH LIMITED

198} Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 7 44 464 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/9/003/1149 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

199 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 95 24 5,724 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 348.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/9/001/1132 WH

200 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY AA 7 30 4,650 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 347.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1068 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

201 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 37 0 2,220 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 341.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE

2026/168/001/1077

WH

TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
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202 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- AA 24 37 1,477 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 348.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/309/002/1059 WH LIMITED

203 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 62 12 3,732 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 347.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/35/001/1086 WH LIMITED

204 Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 94 28 5,668 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 343.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1113 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

205) IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 356.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/88/001/1095 WH

206) IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 8 39 519 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 348.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/88/001/1095 WH LIMITED

207} Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 350.00 Sold BURKA ESTATE LTD
2026/37/001/1104 WH

208} Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 21 12 1,272 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 347.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/37/001/1104 WH LIMITED

209 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- AA 10 0 600 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 346.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/309/001/1053 WH

210 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 80 17 4,817 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 350.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/9/002/1139 WH

211) Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 354.00 Sold BURKA ESTATE LTD
2026/37/002/1157 WH

212) Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 82 48 4,968 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 350.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/37/002/1157 WH

213) Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 351.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/34/001/1122 WH

214) Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 80 40 4,840 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 352.00 Sold BURKA ESTATE LTD
2026/34/001/1122 WH

215) Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 99 52 5,992 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 352.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/9/003/1148 WH

216) Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 42 49 2,569 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 351.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/9/003/1148 WH

217 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 89 15 5,355 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 354.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/9/001/1131 WH

218 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY PB 40 59 2,459 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 332.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1067 WH LIMITED

219 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 28 25 1,705 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/168/001/1076 WH PLANTATION LTD

220 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- PB 22 30 1,350 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 339.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/309/002/1058 WH TRADING COMPANY

LIMITED

221 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 40 39 2,439 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/35/001/1085 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

222 Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative PB 81 37 4,897 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1112 WH

223 IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- PB 60 22 3,622 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 339.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/88/001/1094 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

224 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 98 43 5,923 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 342.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/37/001/1103 WH LTD

225 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- PB 12 40 760 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 336.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/309/001/1052 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

226 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 41 0 2,460 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 339.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/9/002/1138 WH PLANTATION LTD

227) Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 344.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/37/002/1156 WH PLANTATION LTD

228) Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 41 22 2,482 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 343.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/37/002/1156 WH LIMITED
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229] Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 351.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/34/001/1121 WH
230] Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 29 0 1,740 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 348.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/34/001/1121 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
231 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 71 4 4,264 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 345.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/9/003/1147 WH LIMITED
232 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 62 35 3,755 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 349.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/9/001/1130 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
233 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY UG 4 17 257 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya No bid -
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1075 WH
234 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 2 0 120 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya No bid -
2026/168/001/1084 WH
235 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 5 0 300 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 231.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/37/001/1111 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
236 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- UG 4 16 256 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 241.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/309/002/1066 WH Limited
237 Nambinzo AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 2 37 157 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 241.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/35/001/1093 WH Limited
238 Iteseha Agricultural Marketing Cooperative UG 4 40 280 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 247.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society Ltd/2025-2026/39/001/1120 WH LIMITED
239 IKONYA AMCOS LTD/2025- UG 3 43 223 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 251.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/88/001/1102 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
240 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 3 14 194 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 250.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/9/002/1146 WH Limited
241 Mwanjelwa AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 8 33 513 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 255.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/37/002/1164 WH LTD
242 Nkana AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 6 28 388 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 254.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/34/001/1129 WH LIMITED
243 Shikumbi AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 5 0 300 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 252.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/9/003/1155 WH LIMITED
244 MSHIKAMANO MANYARA AMCOS/2025- UG 11 28 688 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 254.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/309/001/1057 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
SONGWE - 98 Bags | 5,919 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
245 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- F 16 10 970 | CMS LTD MBOZI Withdrawn -
2026/1190/002/514
246 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- F 3 47 227 | CMS LTD MBOZI Withdrawn =
2026/1190/001/518
248 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- TT 13 85, 815 | CMS LTD MBOZI 250.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1190/002/515 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
249 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- TT 21 13 1,273 | CMS LTD MBOZI 250.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1190/001/519 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
251 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- AF 8 51 531 | CMS LTD MBOZI 260.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1190/002/516 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
252 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- AF 9 26 566 | CMS LTD MBOZI Withdrawn -
2026/1190/001/520
254 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- C 13 59 839 | CMS LTD MBOZI 285.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1190/002/517 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
255 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- (63 11 38 698 | CMS LTD MBOZI 285.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1190/001/521 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
MBOZI - 127 Bags | 7,635 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
247 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/168 F 2 40 160 | LIMA KWANZA FARM No bid -
. VVWARLCTITUUOE .
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250 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/167 TT 37 13 2,233 | LIMA KWANZA FARM No bid -
WAREHOUSE
253 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/166 AF 21 16 1,276 | LIMA KWANZA FARM No bid -
WAREHOUSE
256 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/165 C 21 7 1,267 | LIMA KWANZA FARM No bid -
WAREHOUSE
257 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/157 E 7 52 472 | LIMA KWANZA FARM No bid -
WAREHOUSE
258 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/163 PB 37 7 2,227 | LIMA KWANZA FARM No bid -
WAREHOUSE
MOSHI MJINI - 69 Bags | 4,159 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
259 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024- AB 3 42 222 | GOURMET MOSHI 223.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2025/1241/037/862 LIMITED
260 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025- AB 8 56 536 | GOURMET MOSHI No bid -
2026/1241/002/868
261 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024- AA 2 3 123 | GOURMET MOSHI No bid -
2025/1241/037/860
262 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024- AA 18 35 1,115 | GOURMET MOSHI 251.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2025/1241/034/857 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
263 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025- AA 6 11 371 | GOURMET MOSHI 246.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1241/002/869 LIMITED
264 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024- AA 3 5 185 | GOURMET MOSHI 243.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2025/1241/035/858 LIMITED
265 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024- PB 1 42 102 | GOURMET MOSHI 226.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2025/1241/037/861 LIMITED
266 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024- REJ 25 5 1,505 | GOURMET MOSHI No bid -
2025/1241/036/859
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