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AUCTION RESULTS

Auction No : TCB/M/4 Auction Date : 04/SEP/2025

MBINGA - 3,812 Bags | 228,733 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

1 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2252

F 13 14 794 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

2 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2188

F 10 27 627 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

No bid -

3 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2108

F 3 5 185 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

208.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

4 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1251

F 15 12 912 DAE LTD 220.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

5 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1240

F 5 3 303 DAE LTD 215.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

6 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1241

TT 2 47 167 DAE LTD No bid -

7 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2253

TT 8 2 482 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

241.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

8 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2189

TT 6 27 387 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

230.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

9 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1252

TT 7 3 423 DAE LTD 236.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

10 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2254

AF 19 14 1,154 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

240.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

11 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2190

AF 15 57 957 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

248.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

12 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2110

AF 3 37 217 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

248.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

13 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1242

AF 7 3 423 DAE LTD 253.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

14 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1253

AF 7 17 437 DAE LTD 253.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

15 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1243

E 1 0 60 DAE LTD No bid -

16 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1254

E 3 22 202 DAE LTD 205.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

17 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2255

C 33 52 2,032 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

271.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

18 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2191

C 26 52 1,612 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

272.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

19 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2111

C 13 39 819 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

276.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

20 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1244

C 7 7 427 DAE LTD 278.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD
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21 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1255

C 24 45 1,485 DAE LTD 265.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

22 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2120

C 25 31 1,531 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

275.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

23 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2256

B 66 21 3,981 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

322.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

24 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1245

B 53 46 3,226 DAE LTD 321.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

25 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2112

B 31 14 1,874 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

322.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

26 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2192

B 50 43 3,043 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

329.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

27} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1256

B 99 51 5,991 DAE LTD 322.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

28} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1256

B 89 2 5,342 DAE LTD 328.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

29 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2116

B 51 8 3,068 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

337.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

30] Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2257

A 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

332.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

31] Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2257

A 50 42 3,042 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

331.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

32 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1246

A 81 21 4,881 DAE LTD 326.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

33 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2113

A 84 9 5,049 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

327.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

34) Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2193

A 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

334.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

35) Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2193

A 12 38 758 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

330.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

36} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1257

A 99 50 5,990 DAE LTD 331.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

37} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1257

A 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 341.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

38} Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1257

A 43 23 2,603 DAE LTD 329.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

39} KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2121

A 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

336.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

40} KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2121

A 15 37 937 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

330.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

41) Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2258

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

42) Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2258

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

338.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

43) Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2258

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

44) Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2258

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

338.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

45) Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2258

AA 0 1 1 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

Withdrawn -
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46} Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1247

AA 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 340.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

47} Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1247

AA 2 38 158 DAE LTD 334.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

48] KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2114

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

342.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

49] KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2114

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

341.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

50] KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2114

AA 63 4 3,784 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

339.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

51} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2194

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

340.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

52} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2194

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

343.00 Sold AFRICAN
PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED

53} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2194

AA 89 57 5,397 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

344.00 Sold AFRICAN
PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED

54) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1258

AA 99 50 5,990 DAE LTD 345.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

55) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1258

AA 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

56) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1258

AA 71 47 4,307 DAE LTD 343.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

57) KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2122

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

345.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

58) KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2122

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

345.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

59) KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2122

AA 81 40 4,900 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

346.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

60 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1248

AAA 57 50 3,470 DAE LTD 342.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

61) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1259

AAA 99 51 5,991 DAE LTD 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

62) Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1259

AAA 59 47 3,587 DAE LTD 340.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

63 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2259

PB 54 48 3,288 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

333.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

64 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2025-
2026/858/001/1249

PB 35 33 2,133 DAE LTD 327.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

65 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2115

PB 25 18 1,518 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

331.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

66 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2195

PB 42 35 2,555 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

333.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

67] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1260

PB 99 52 5,992 DAE LTD 335.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
PLANTATION LTD

68] Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/005/1260

PB 0 16 16 DAE LTD 325.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

69 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2123

PB 35 2 2,102 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

336.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

144 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025-
2026/859/001/1210

F 7 48 468 DAE LTD No bid -

145 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/004/1200

TT 10 0 600 DAE LTD No bid -

146 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/001/2037 TT 3 45 225 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
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147 NDEMBO AMCOS/2025-
2026/859/001/1213

E 5 3 303 DAE LTD No bid -

148 Umoja AMCOS Mbinga/2025-
2026/186/002/1124

E 2 48 168 DAE LTD No bid -

149 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/002/1096 E 1 34 94 DAE LTD No bid -

150 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/1077

E 1 13 73 DAE LTD No bid -

151 Kinjolu AMCOS/2025-2026/125/001/1087 C 4 23 263 DAE LTD 253.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

155] Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/006/1299

B 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 335.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

156] Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/006/1299

B 65 29 3,929 DAE LTD 335.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

SONGWE - 1,966 Bags | 118,008 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

70 IGAMBA MPYA AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/5/003/1304

F 5 44 344 MCCCO MBOZI No bid -

71 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/554

F 16 26 986 CMS LTD MBOZI 225.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

73 MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/562

F 31 39 1,899 CMS LTD MBOZI 250.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

74 HAMWELO AMCOS/2025-
2026/41/001/1288

F 13 18 798 MCCCO MBOZI 251.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

75 ANYANDWILE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/001/1296

F 16 15 975 MCCCO MBOZI 257.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

77 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/001/1312

F 11 8 668 MCCCO MBOZI 259.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

78 IGAMBA MPYA AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/5/003/1302

TT 6 45 405 MCCCO MBOZI 240.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

79 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/555

TT 25 44 1,544 CMS LTD MBOZI 260.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

80 HAMWELO AMCOS/2025-
2026/41/001/1286

TT 4 0 240 MCCCO MBOZI 256.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

82 MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/563

TT 47 15 2,835 CMS LTD MBOZI 269.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

83 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/001/1310

TT 2 15 135 MCCCO MBOZI 268.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

85 ANYANDWILE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/001/1294

TT 7 25 445 MCCCO MBOZI 277.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

86 IGAMBA MPYA AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/5/003/1303

AF 6 22 382 MCCCO MBOZI 254.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

88 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/556

AF 8 29 509 CMS LTD MBOZI 262.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

89 MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/564

AF 16 28 988 CMS LTD MBOZI 266.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

90 HAMWELO AMCOS/2025-
2026/41/001/1287

AF 7 10 430 MCCCO MBOZI 274.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

91 ANYANDWILE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/001/1295

AF 15 25 925 MCCCO MBOZI 259.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
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92 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/001/1311

AF 2 33 153 MCCCO MBOZI 255.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

94 IGAMBA MPYA AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/5/003/1305

C 6 33 393 MCCCO MBOZI 251.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

96 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/557

C 16 36 996 CMS LTD MBOZI 264.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

97 HAMWELO AMCOS/2025-
2026/41/001/1289

C 18 16 1,096 MCCCO MBOZI 284.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

98 MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/565

C 33 15 1,995 CMS LTD MBOZI 276.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

99 ANYANDWILE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/001/1297

C 17 13 1,033 MCCCO MBOZI 278.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

101 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/001/1313

C 13 13 793 MCCCO MBOZI 275.00 Sold AFRICAN
PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED

102 IGAMBA MPYA AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/5/003/1306

B 15 6 906 MCCCO MBOZI 298.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

104 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/558

B 77 59 4,679 CMS LTD MBOZI 336.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

105] MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/566

B 99 59 5,999 CMS LTD MBOZI 337.00 Sold UTENGULE ESTATES
TANZANIA LTD

106] MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/566

B 74 52 4,492 CMS LTD MBOZI 335.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

108 HAMWELO AMCOS/2025-
2026/41/001/1290

B 88 24 5,304 MCCCO MBOZI 333.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

110 ANYANDWILE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/001/1298

B 71 23 4,283 MCCCO MBOZI 332.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

111 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/001/1314

B 95 43 5,743 MCCCO MBOZI 332.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

112 IGAMBA MPYA AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/5/003/1307

A 9 0 540 MCCCO MBOZI 314.00 Sold AFRICAN
PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED

113 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/559

A 88 49 5,329 CMS LTD MBOZI 333.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

116) MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/567

A 100 0 6,000 CMS LTD MBOZI 332.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

117) MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/567

A 72 22 4,342 CMS LTD MBOZI 336.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

118 HAMWELO AMCOS/2025-
2026/41/001/1291

A 48 24 2,904 MCCCO MBOZI 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

119 ANYANDWILE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/001/1299

A 54 29 3,269 MCCCO MBOZI 337.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

121 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/001/1315

A 67 17 4,037 MCCCO MBOZI 338.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

122 IGAMBA MPYA AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/5/003/1308

AA 10 0 600 MCCCO MBOZI 316.00 Sold AFRICAN
PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED

123] NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/560

AA 99 52 5,992 CMS LTD MBOZI 323.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

124] NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/560

AA 21 3 1,263 CMS LTD MBOZI 326.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
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125} MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/568

AA 100 0 6,000 CMS LTD MBOZI 337.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

126} MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/568

AA 92 23 5,543 CMS LTD MBOZI 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

128 HAMWELO AMCOS/2025-
2026/41/001/1292

AA 28 14 1,694 MCCCO MBOZI 341.00 Sold AFRICAN
PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED

130 ANYANDWILE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/001/1300

AA 45 30 2,730 MCCCO MBOZI 344.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

132 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/001/1316

AA 38 41 2,321 MCCCO MBOZI 348.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

133 IGAMBA MPYA AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/5/003/1309

PB 4 19 259 MCCCO MBOZI 319.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

135 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/001/561

PB 35 48 2,148 CMS LTD MBOZI 333.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

136 MSANYILA AMCOS/2025-
2026/318/001/569

PB 56 55 3,415 CMS LTD MBOZI 333.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

137 HAMWELO AMCOS/2025-
2026/41/001/1293

PB 16 37 997 MCCCO MBOZI 335.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

139 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/001/1317

PB 27 17 1,637 MCCCO MBOZI 332.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

140 ANYANDWILE COMPANY
LIMITED/2025-2026/854/001/1301

PB 18 23 1,103 MCCCO MBOZI 335.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

152 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025-
2026/323/002/1235

F 34 12 2,052 MCCCO MBOZI No bid -

153 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025-
2026/323/002/1233

TT 16 12 972 MCCCO MBOZI No bid -

154 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025-
2026/323/001/1208

AF 8 8 488 MCCCO MBOZI No bid -

IYUNGA MBEYA - 431 Bags | 25,914 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

72 NAMPANJI PROBATIONERY AMCOS
LTD/2025-2026/314/001/1210

F 9 11 551 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

235.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

76 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1218

F 3 17 197 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

258.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

81 NAMPANJI PROBATIONERY AMCOS
LTD/2025-2026/314/001/1209

TT 12 21 741 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

264.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

84 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1217

TT 16 9 969 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

269.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

87 NAMPANJI PROBATIONERY AMCOS
LTD/2025-2026/314/001/1208

AF 6 9 369 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

260.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

93 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1216

AF 16 0 960 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

277.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

95 NAMPANJI PROBATIONERY AMCOS
LTD/2025-2026/314/001/1207

C 11 48 708 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

283.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

100 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1215

C 3 35 215 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

286.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

103 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/002/1223

B 2 36 156 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

296.00 Sold UTENGULE ESTATES
TANZANIA LTD
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107 NAMPANJI PROBATIONERY AMCOS
LTD/2025-2026/314/001/1206

B 57 38 3,458 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

332.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

109 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1214

B 36 0 2,160 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

333.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

114 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/002/1222

A 3 42 222 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

328.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

115 NAMPANJI PROBATIONERY AMCOS
LTD/2025-2026/314/001/1205

A 32 27 1,947 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

338.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

120 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1213

A 43 57 2,637 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

333.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

127 NAMPANJI PROBATIONERY AMCOS
LTD/2025-2026/314/001/1204

AA 26 36 1,596 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

335.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

129 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/002/1221

AA 3 31 211 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

333.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

131 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1212

AA 76 46 4,606 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

134 NAMPANJI PROBATIONERY AMCOS
LTD/2025-2026/314/001/1203

PB 23 21 1,401 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

337.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

138 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/002/1220

PB 2 43 163 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

309.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

141 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1211

PB 29 7 1,747 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

332.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

142 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/002/1224

UG 12 0 720 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

261.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

143 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/1219

UG 3 0 180 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

264.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited
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