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AUCTION RESULTS

Auction No : TCB/M/5 Auction Date : 11/SEP/2025

MBINGA - 965 Bags | 57,911 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

1 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2260

F 10 4 604 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

222.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

2 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1281

F 11 3 663 DAE LTD 235.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

3 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1282

TT 3 6 186 DAE LTD 236.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

4 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2261

TT 6 49 409 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

241.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

5 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2262

AF 8 14 494 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

246.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

6 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1283

C 16 29 989 DAE LTD 278.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

7 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2263

C 19 27 1,167 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

278.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

8) Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1284

B 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 345.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

9) Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1284

B 4 28 268 DAE LTD 334.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

10 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2264

B 38 48 2,328 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

339.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

11] Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1285

A 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 339.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

12] Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1285

A 13 35 815 DAE LTD 336.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

13 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2265

A 85 55 5,155 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

14} Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1286

AA 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 345.00 Sold KAHAWA ASILI
AGRITRADING C0 LTD

15} Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1286

AA 13 7 787 DAE LTD 339.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

16} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2266

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

350.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

17} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2266

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

350.00 Sold MEGNACIO COMPANY
LIMITED

18} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2266

AA 15 22 922 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

350.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

19 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1287

AAA 56 57 3,417 DAE LTD 349.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

20 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1288

PB 49 11 2,951 DAE LTD 349.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

21 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/002/2267

PB 32 4 1,924 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

350.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
PLANTATION LTD

22 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025-
2026/874/005/1280

UG 2 13 133 DAE LTD 226.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

23 LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2024-
2025/851/010/1847

B 25 53 1,553 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

205.00 No bid -
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24 Kipegei Agricultural Marketing
Cooperative Society LTD/2024-
2025/858/001/2025

A 23 14 1,394 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

208.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

115 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/001/2124

F 5 31 331 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

116 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/002/2252

F 13 14 794 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

117 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/001/2188

F 10 27 627 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

MOSHI MJINI - 613 Bags | 36,795 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

25 LUKANI LOSAA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/221/001/578

F 4 50 290 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 210.00 No bid -

26 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/001/584

F 1 52 112 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 215.00 No bid -

27 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/288/001/556

F 1 26 86 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 215.00 No bid -

28 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/561

C 11 42 702 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 276.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

29 LUKANI LOSAA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/221/001/577

C 26 12 1,572 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 276.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

30 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/288/001/555

C 11 23 683 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 290.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

31 NSHARA AMCOS/2025-2026/1199/001,
2025-2026/1199/001/588

C 4 0 240 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 281.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

32 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025-
2026/276/001/567

C 3 42 222 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 276.00 No bid -

33 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/001/572 C 3 33 213 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 279.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

34 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/001/583

C 33 40 2,020 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 288.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

35 LUKANI LOSAA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/221/001/575

AB 77 38 4,658 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

36 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/001/581

AB 79 8 4,748 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 352.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

37 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/559

AB 51 51 3,111 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 345.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

38 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025-
2026/276/001/565

AB 18 12 1,092 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 342.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

39 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/288/001/553

AB 58 23 3,503 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

40 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/001/570 AB 19 13 1,153 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 351.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

41 NSHARA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1199/001/587

AB 14 7 847 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 350.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

42 LUKANI LOSAA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/221/001/574

AA 31 41 1,901 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 349.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

43 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/001/580

AA 15 7 907 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 349.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD
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44 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/558

AA 20 47 1,247 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 345.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

45 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025-
2026/276/001/564

AA 6 3 363 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 351.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

46 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/288/001/552

AA 22 56 1,376 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 354.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

47 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/001/569 AA 7 7 427 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 350.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

48 NSHARA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1199/001/586

AA 5 21 321 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 347.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

49 LUKANI LOSAA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/221/001/573

PB 7 40 460 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 346.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

50 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/001/579

PB 6 44 404 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 349.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

51 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/557

PB 5 43 343 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 348.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

52 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025-
2026/276/001/563

PB 1 52 112 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 343.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

53 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/288/001/551

PB 7 10 430 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

54 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/001/568 PB 1 44 104 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 342.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

55 NSHARA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1199/001/585

PB 1 49 109 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

56 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/001/582

UG 1 38 98 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 210.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

57 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001, 2025-
2026/270/001/560

UG 1 46 106 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 210.00 No bid -

58 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/001/571 UG 0 32 32 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 210.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

59 LUKANI LOSAA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/221/001/576

UG 3 39 219 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 220.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

60 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025-
2026/276/001/566

UG 0 52 52 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 220.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

61 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025-
2026/288/001/554

UG 6 6 366 TCCCO - MOSHI WH 220.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

112 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/002/868

AB 8 56 536 GOURMET MOSHI 215.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

113 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024-
2025/1241/037/860

AA 2 4 124 GOURMET MOSHI 220.00 No bid -

114 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024-
2025/1241/036/859

REJ 25 6 1,506 GOURMET MOSHI 200.00 No bid -

IYUNGA MBEYA - 928 Bags | 55,686 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

62 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1273

F 11 54 714 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

215.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

63 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1272

TT 23 50 1,430 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

235.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited
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64 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1271

AF 12 41 761 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

233.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

65 Utambalila AMCOS/2025-
2026/72/001/1252

C 5 41 341 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

283.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

66 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1270

C 11 45 705 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

289.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

67 Shitunguru Agriculture and Marketing
Cooperative Society Limited/2025-
2026/1130/001/1264

C 5 25 325 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

288.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

68 Shokwa AMCOS/2025-
2026/112/001/1258

C 4 0 240 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

274.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

69 Utambalila AMCOS/2025-
2026/72/001/1251

B 31 42 1,902 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

331.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

70 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/002/1278

B 36 25 2,185 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

71) Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1269

B 100 0 6,000 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

351.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

72) Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1269

B 9 45 585 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

73 Shitunguru Agriculture and Marketing
Cooperative Society Limited/2025-
2026/1130/001/1263

B 42 48 2,568 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

340.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

74 Matawe AMCOS/2025-
2026/153/001/1246

B 20 0 1,200 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

75 Shokwa AMCOS/2025-
2026/112/001/1257

B 34 8 2,048 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

353.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

76 Utambalila AMCOS/2025-
2026/72/001/1250

A 22 30 1,350 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

351.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

77 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/002/1277

A 11 19 679 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

352.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

78 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1268

A 78 8 4,688 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

352.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

79 Shitunguru Agriculture and Marketing
Cooperative Society Limited/2025-
2026/1130/001/1262

A 29 50 1,790 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

352.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

80 Matawe AMCOS/2025-
2026/153/001/1245

A 14 32 872 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

355.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

81 Shokwa AMCOS/2025-
2026/112/001/1256

A 25 30 1,530 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

354.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

82 Matawe AMCOS/2025-
2026/153/001/1244

AA 30 36 1,836 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

354.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

83 Utambalila AMCOS/2025-
2026/72/001/1249

AA 18 19 1,099 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

84 Shokwa AMCOS/2025-
2026/112/001/1255

AA 22 52 1,372 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

353.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

85 Shitunguru Agriculture and Marketing
Cooperative Society Limited/2025-
2026/1130/001/1261

AA 23 40 1,420 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

351.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

86 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1267

AA 63 58 3,838 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

354.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

87 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/002/1276

AA 6 53 413 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

88 Utambalila AMCOS/2025-
2026/72/001/1248

PB 16 41 1,001 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

351.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

89 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/002/1275

PB 11 55 715 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

343.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
PLANTATION LTD

90 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1266

PB 48 0 2,880 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

352.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

91 Shitunguru Agriculture and Marketing
Cooperative Society Limited/2025-
2026/1130/001/1260

PB 19 38 1,178 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
PLANTATION LTD
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92 Matawe AMCOS/2025-
2026/153/001/1243

PB 9 45 585 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

93 Shokwa AMCOS/2025-
2026/112/001/1254

PB 19 29 1,169 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

350.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
PLANTATION LTD

94 Shitunguru Agriculture and Marketing
Cooperative Society Limited/2025-
2026/1130/001/1265

UG 19 33 1,173 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

233.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

95 Utambalila AMCOS/2025-
2026/72/001/1253

UG 19 30 1,170 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

235.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

96 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/001/1274

UG 7 0 420 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

240.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

97 Matawe AMCOS/2025-
2026/153/001/1247

UG 9 17 557 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

269.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

98 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/46/002/1279

UG 15 48 948 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

257.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

99 Shokwa AMCOS/2025-
2026/112/001/1259

UG 21 25 1,285 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

261.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

107 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1071

C 5 37 337 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

272.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

110 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1075

UG 4 17 257 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

215.00 No bid -

111 Isalalo AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/168/001/1084

UG 2 0 120 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

215.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

SONGWE - 29 Bags | 1,742 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

100 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/002/514

F 16 3 963 CMS LTD MBOZI 250.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

101 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/001/518

F 3 40 220 CMS LTD MBOZI 250.00 No bid -

104 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025-
2026/1190/001/520

AF 9 19 559 CMS LTD MBOZI 260.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

MBOZI - 127 Bags | 7,635 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

102 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/168 F 2 40 160 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

275.00 No bid -

103 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/167 TT 37 13 2,233 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

295.00 No bid -

105 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/166 AF 21 16 1,276 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

295.00 No bid -

106 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/157 E 7 52 472 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

310.00 No bid -

108 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/165 C 21 7 1,267 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

320.00 No bid -

109 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/163 PB 37 7 2,227 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

360.00 No bid -
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