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Auction No : TCB/M/6 Auction Date : 18/SEP/2025 -
MBINGA - 3,482 Bags | 208,972 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2316 F 9 35 575 | MBINGA COFFEE 221.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
2 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- F 11 36 696 | MBINGA COFFEE 221.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/874/001/2308 CURING
3 Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2340 F 28 12 1,692 | MBINGA COFFEE 229.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
4 Likwela Agricultural Marketing F 16 7 967 | MBINGA COFFEE 221.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING TRADING COMPANY
2026/852/001/2332 LIMITED
5 HETAME CO.LTD/2025- F 14 58 898 | MBINGA COFFEE 246.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/846/001/2388 CURING
6 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- TT 3 38 218 | MBINGA COFFEE 241.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/874/001/2309 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
7 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2317 TT 3 40 220 | MBINGA COFFEE 231.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
8 Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2341 T 6 42 402 | MBINGA COFFEE 259.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
9 Likwela Agricultural Marketing TT B 15 315 | MBINGA COFFEE 238.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING LIMITED
2026/852/001/2333
10 HETAME CO.LTD/2025- TT 4 2 242 | MBINGA COFFEE 264.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/846/001/2389 CURING
11 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2318 AF 11 55 715 | MBINGA COFFEE 260.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
12 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- AF 7 22 442 | MBINGA COFFEE 254.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/874/001/2310 CURING
13 Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2342 AF 24 6 1,446 | MBINGA COFFEE 264.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
14 Likwela Agricultural Marketing AF 13 45 825 | MBINGA COFFEE 250.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING TRADING COMPANY
2026/852/001/2334 LIMITED
15 HETAME CO.LTD/2025- AF 7 33 453 | MBINGA COFFEE 265.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/846/001/2390 CURING LIMITED
16 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2319 G 21 10 1,270 | MBINGA COFFEE 276.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
17 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- C 29 4 1,744 | MBINGA COFFEE 299.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/874/001/2311 CURING LTD
18 Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2343 (03 87 19 5,239 | MBINGA COFFEE 284.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
19 Likwela Agricultural Marketing C 35 20 2,120 | MBINGA COFFEE 276.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING LTD
2026/852/001/2335
20 HETAME CO.LTD/2025- (63 42 11 2,531 | MBINGA COFFEE 290.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/846/001/2391 CURING
21 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2320 B 40 25 2,425 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
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22 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- B 58 31 3,511 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/874/001/2312 CURING
23) Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2344 B 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
24) Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2344 B 36 29 2,189 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
25 Likwela Agricultural Marketing B 64 48 3,888 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING
2026/852/001/2336
26 HETAME CO.LTD/2025- B 60 39 3,639 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/846/001/2392 CURING
27 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2321 A 76 42 4,602 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
28} Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/874/001/2313 CURING
29} Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- A 10 58 658 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/874/001/2313 CURING
30} Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2345 A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
CURING
31} Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2345 A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
CURING
32} Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2345 A 83 39 5,019 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
CURING
33) Likwela Agricultural Marketing A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
2026/852/001/2337
34) Likwela Agricultural Marketing A 36 3 2,163 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING
2026/852/001/2337
35} HETAME CO.LTD/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 344.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/846/001/2393 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
36} HETAME CO.LTD/2025- A 9 48 588 | MBINGA COFFEE 344.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/846/001/2393 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
37] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2322 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
38] KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2322 AA 59 10 3,550 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
39] Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/874/001/2314 CURING
40] Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold AFRICAN
2026/874/001/2314 CURING PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED
41] Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- AA 41 30 2,490 | MBINGA COFFEE 343.00 Sold AFRICAN
2026/874/001/2314 CURING PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED
42] Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2346 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
43] Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2346 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
CURING
44] Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2346 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
45] Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2346 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 339.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
46] Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2346 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 341.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
47] Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2346 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
48] Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2346 AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 341.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

CURING
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49] Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2346 AA 2 52 172 | MBINGA COFFEE 339.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
50} Likwela Agricultural Marketing AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING LIMITED
2026/852/001/2338
51} Likwela Agricultural Marketing AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING
2026/852/001/2338
52} Likwela Agricultural Marketing AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING
2026/852/001/2338
53} Likwela Agricultural Marketing AA 83 29 5,009 | MBINGA COFFEE 339.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING LIMITED
2026/852/001/2338
54} HETAME CO.LTD/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 343.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/846/001/2394 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
55} HETAME CO.LTD/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/846/001/2394 CURING
56} HETAME CO.LTD/2025- AA 56 31 3,391 | MBINGA COFFEE 343.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/846/001/2394 CURING
57 KIKULI AMCOS/2025-2026/892/002/2323 PB 32 7 1,927 | MBINGA COFFEE 339.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
58 Kitumbalomo AMCOS/2025- PB 40 0 2,400 | MBINGA COFFEE 339.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/874/001/2315 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
59) Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2347 PB 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
CURING
60) Maguu AMCOS/2025-2026/239/001/2347 PB 1 26 86 | MBINGA COFFEE 339.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
61 Likwela Agricultural Marketing PB 52 2 3,122 | MBINGA COFFEE 341.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Cooperative Society LTD/2025- CURING LIMITED
2026/852/001/2339
62 HETAME CO.LTD/2025- PB 52 13 3,133 | MBINGA COFFEE 341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/846/001/2395 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
MOSHI MJINI - 247 Bags | 14,821 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
63 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025- C 9 54 594 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 270.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/288/002/604 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
64 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society (€] 7 7 427 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 276.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/002/595 LIMITED
65 SHIO GATE EXPORT CO. LTD/2025- AB 15 32 932 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 334.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/1257/001/592
66 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025- AB 67 19 4,039 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 370.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
2026/288/002/602 COMPANY LTD
67 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society AB 61 28 3,688 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 350.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
Ltd/2025-2026/270/002/597 COMPANY LTD
68 SHIO GATE EXPORT CO. LTD/2025- AA 15 39 939 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 340.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
2026/1257/001/591 COMPANY LTD
69 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025- AA 21 5 1,265 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 383.00 Sold MONDULI COFFEE
2026/288/002/601 ESTATE LTD
70 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society AA 25 28 1,528 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 421.00 Sold D & J DISTRIBUTORS
Ltd/2025-2026/270/002/598 COMPANY LTD
71 SHIO GATE EXPORT CO. LTD/2025- PB 2 35 155 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 338.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1257/001/590 LIMITED
72 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025- PB 6 8 368 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 366.00 Sold MONDULI COFFEE
2026/288/002/600 ESTATE LTD
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73 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society PB 6 57 417 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 381.00 Sold MONDULI COFFEE
Ltd/2025-2026/270/002/599 ESTATE LTD
74 SHIO GATE EXPORT CO. LTD/2025- UG 2 35 155 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 220.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/1257/001, 2025-2026/1257/001/593 SON LTD
75 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society UG 2 14 134 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 220.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
Ltd/2025-2026/270/002/596 SON LTD
76 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025- UG 3 0 180 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 223.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/288/002/603 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
SONGWE - 1,761 Bags | 105,702 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
7 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY F 1 13 73 | CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/642
78 TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS/2025- F 12 27 747 | CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -
2026/204/001/629
79 MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025- F 6 57 417 | CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -
2026/258/001/602
80 Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1328 F 23 4 1,384 | MCCCO MBOZI 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
81 Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/001/634 F 1 56 116 | CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -
82 Nansama AMCOS/2025- F 2 1 121 | CMS LTD MBOZI 220.00 No bid -
2026/177/001/610
83 Nansama AMCOS/2025- F 1 23 83 | CMS LTD MBOZI 220.00 No bid -
2026/177/002/618
84 Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/003/666 B 7 55 475 | CMS LTD MBOZI 258.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
85 Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/002/658 F 9 49 589 | CMS LTD MBOZI 261.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
86 TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS/2025- TT 16 12 972 | CMS LTD MBOZI 202.00 No bid -
2026/204/001/631
87 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY TT 7 31 451 | CMS LTD MBOZI 202.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/646
88 MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025- TT 24 52 1,492 | CMS LTD MBOZI 202.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/258/001/603 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
89 Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1326 TT 26 45 1,605 | MCCCO MBOZI 202.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
90 Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/001/636 TT 9 41 581 | CMS LTD MBOZI 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
91 Nansama AMCOS/2025- TT 4 31 271 | CMS LTD MBOZI 246.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/177/001/611 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
92 Nansama AMCOS/2025- TT 3 2 182 | CMS LTD MBOZI 233.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/177/002/619 LIMITED
93 Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/003/667 TT 9 33 573 | CMS LTD MBOZI 261.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
94 Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/002/659 TT 19 17 1,157 | CMS LTD MBOZI 255.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
95 TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS/2025- AF 0 17 17 | CMS LTD MBOZI 204.00 No bid -
2026/204/001/630
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96 | NANGONDO PROBATIONARY AF 1 6 66 | CMS LTD MBOZI 20400 Nobid |-
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/643
97 | MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025- AF 5 49 349 | cMs LTD MBOZI 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/258/001/604 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
98 | Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1327 AF 24 4 1,481 | MCCCO MBOZI 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
99 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/001/635 AF 3 19 199 | cMs LTD MBOZI 210.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
100 | Nansama AMCOS/2025- AF 0 52 52 | CMS LTD MBOZI 21000| Nobid |-
2026/177/002/620
101 | Nansama AMCOS/2025- AF 1 47 107 | cms LTD MBOZI 211.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/177/001/612 LIMITED
102 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/003/668 AF 3 11 191 | cMs LTD MBOZI 230.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
103 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/002/660 AF 10 25 625 | CMS LTD MBOZI 235.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
104 | TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS/2025- c 16 8 968 | CMs LTD MBOZI 215.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/204/001/628
105 | NANGONDO PROBATIONARY c 3 3 183 | cMs LTD MBOZI 215.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/647
106 | MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025- & 15 10 910 | cMs LTD MBOZI 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/258/001/605 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
107 | Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1330 C 18 14 1,094 | MCCCO MBOZI 215.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
108 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/001/639 c 5 24 324 | cMs LTD MBOZI 220.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
109 | Nansama AMCOS/2025- c 2 4 124 | cMs LTD MBOZI 272.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/177/001/613 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
110 | Nansama AMCOS/2025- c 0 48 48 | CMS LTD MBOZI 215.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/177/002/621
111 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/003/669 C 12 3 723 | cms LTD MBOZI 272.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
112 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/002/661 c 15 52 952 | CMs LTD MBOZI 273.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
113 | Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1329 E 2 21 141 | Mccco MBOZI 21800| Nobid |-
114 | TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS/2025- B 94 20 5,660 | CMS LTD MBOZI 22000 Nobid |-
2026/204/001/627
115 | NANGONDO PROBATIONARY B 12 30 750 | cMs LTD MBOZI 227.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/645
116 | MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 74 55 4,495 | CMS LTD MBOZI 220.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/258/001/606 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
117 | Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1331 B 49 6 2,946 | MCCCO MBOZI 327.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
118 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/001/640 B 22 55 1,375 | CMS LTD MBOZI 316.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
119 | Nansama AMCOS/2025- B 10 31 631 | cMs LTD MBOZI 320.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/177/001/614
120 | Nansama AMCOS/2025- B 6 45 405 | CMS LTD MBOZI 331.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/177/002/622 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
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121 Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/003/670 B 60 50 3,650 | CMS LTD MBOZI 341.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
122 Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/002/662 B 90 8 5,408 | CMS LTD MBOZI 340.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
123 TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS/2025- A 91 32 5,492 | CMS LTD MBOZI 222.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/204/001/626 LIMITED
124 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY A 5 13 313 | CMS LTD MBOZI 222.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/644
125 MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 53 50 3,230 | CMS LTD MBOZI 327.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/258/001/607 GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
126 Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1332 A 42 8 2,528 | MCCCO MBOZI 329.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
127 Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/001/637 A 9 1 541 | CMS LTD MBOZI 328.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
128 Nansama AMCOS/2025- A 6 17 377 | CMS LTD MBOZI 328.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/177/002/623
129 Nansama AMCOS/2025- A 10 54 654 | CMS LTD MBOZI 328.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/177/001/615 LIMITED
130 Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/003/671 A 63 0 3,780 | CMS LTD MBOZI 344.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
131] Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/002/663 A 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 345.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
132] Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/002/663 A 16 13 973 | CMS LTD MBOZI 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
133 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY AA 3 32 212 | CMS LTD MBOZI 224.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/648
134 TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS/2025- AA 5 44 4,544 | CMS LTD MBOZI 224.00 No bid =
2026/204/001/632
135 MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 44 45 2,685 | CMS LTD MBOZI 335.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/258/001/608 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
136 Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1333 AA 51 7 3,067 | MCCCO MBOZI 339.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
137 Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/001/641 AA 7 48 468 | CMS LTD MBOZI 331.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
138 Nansama AMCOS/2025- AA 8 24 504 | CMS LTD MBOZI 343.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/177/002/624 LIMITED
139 Nansama AMCOS/2025- AA 14 25 865 | CMS LTD MBOZI 343.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/177/001/616 GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
140 Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/003/672 AA 84 19 5,059 | CMS LTD MBOZI 345.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
141) Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/002/664 AA 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 347.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
142) Mbombo AMCO0S/2025-2026/36/002/664 AA 81 40 4,900 | CMS LTD MBOZI 344.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
143 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY PB 1 0 60 | CMS LTD MBOZI 220.00 No bid -
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144 | TUTAFIKA IKUTI AMCOS/2025- PB 33 37 2,017 | CMS LTD MBOZI 220.00 No bid =
2026/204/001/633
145 | MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025- PB 12 7 727 | CMS LTD MBOZI 325.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/258/001/609
146 | Hasale Amcos/2025-2026/1056/001/1334 PB 19 0 1,140 | MCCCO MBOZI 306.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
147 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/001/638 PB 4 15 255 | cMs LTD MBOZI 310.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
148 | Nansama AMCOS/2025- PB 1 52 112 | CMS LTD MBOZI 320.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/177/002/625
149 | Nansama AMCOS/2025- PB 3 38 218 | cMs LTD MBOZI 325.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/177/001/617
150 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/003/673 PB 21 38 1,298 | CMS LTD MBOZI 341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
151 | Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/002/665 PB 42 0 2,520 | CMS LTD MBOZI 342.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
Issued by : TCB SYSTEM
Date Issued : 2026-01-16 17:15:02
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