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Auction No . TCB/M/7 Auction Date : 25/SEP/2025
MBINGA - 2,411 Bags | 144,693 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- F 27 14 1,634 | MBINGA COFFEE 215.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/899/001/2396 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
2 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2444 F 17 52 1,072 | MBINGA COFFEE 217.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
3 Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative F 5 58 358 | MBINGA COFFEE 243.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2404 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
4 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative F 0 13 13 | DAE LTD 222.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society/2025-2026/1142/001/1301 LIMITED
5 Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- TT 13 24 804 | MBINGA COFFEE 245.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/899/001/2397 CURING LIMITED
6 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2445 TT 2 25 145 | MBINGA COFFEE 237.00 No bid -
CURING
7 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative TT 1 11 71 | DAE LTD 237.00 No bid -
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1310
8 Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative TT 1 38 98 | MBINGA COFFEE 253.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2405 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
9 Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- AF 26 36 1,596 | MBINGA COFFEE 253.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/899/001/2398 CURING LIMITED
10 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2446 AF 16 25 985 | MBINGA COFFEE 253.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
11 Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AF 3 34 214 | MBINGA COFFEE 258.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2406 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
12 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative E 1 26 86 | DAE LTD 230.00 No bid -
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1311
13 Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- C 64 22 3,862 | MBINGA COFFEE 280.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/899/001/2399 CURING
14 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2447 (] 35 52 2,152 | MBINGA COFFEE 284.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
15 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative C 5 50 350 | DAE LTD 282.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1312 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
16 Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative S 23 52 1,432 | MBINGA COFFEE 286.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2407 CURING LTD
17 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative C 6 40 400 | DAE LTD 290.00 No bid -
Society/2025-2026/1142/001/1302
18} Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 330.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/899/001/2400 CURING
19} Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- B 8 39 519 | MBINGA COFFEE 322.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/899/001/2400 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
20 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2448 B 64 41 3,881 | MBINGA COFFEE 327.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
CURING
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21 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 25 32 1,532 | DAE LTD 327.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1313 LIMITED
22 Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 56 41 3,401 | MBINGA COFFEE 331.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2408 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
23 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 30 51 1,851 | DAE LTD 329.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society/2025-2026/1142/001/1303 LIMITED
24) Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 332.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/899/001/2401 CURING
25) Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 331.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/899/001/2401 CURING LIMITED
26) Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- 7 42 462 | MBINGA COFFEE 330.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/899/001/2401 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
27) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2449 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 328.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
CURING
28) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2449 34 30 2,070 | MBINGA COFFEE 328.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
29 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 26 0 1,560 | DAE LTD 325.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1308
30] Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 335.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2409 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
31] Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 25 16 1,516 | MBINGA COFFEE 333.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2409 CURING LIMITED
32 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 31 25 1,885 | DAE LTD 332.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society/2025-2026/1142/001/1304 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
33} Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/899/001/2402 CURING
34} Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 337.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/899/001/2402 CURING
35} Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 337.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/899/001/2402 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
36} Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 339.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/899/001/2402 CURING
37} Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- 46 40 2,800 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/899/001/2402 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
38) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2450 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
CURING
39) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2450 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
40) llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2450 78 52 4,732 | MBINGA COFFEE 340.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
CURING
41 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 26 12 1,572 | DAE LTD 335.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1314
42} Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 342.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2410 CURING
43} Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2410 CURING
44} Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 337.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2410 CURING LIMITED
45} Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 4 48 288 | MBINGA COFFEE 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2410

CURING
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46 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 25 54 1,554 | DAE LTD 342.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society/2025-2026/1142/001/1305 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
47 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AAA 18 15 1,095 | DAE LTD 336.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1315 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
48 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AAA 20 5 1,205 | DAE LTD 342.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
Society/2025-2026/1142/001/1306
49 Zomba Amcos Ltd/2025- PB 85 56 5,156 | MBINGA COFFEE 336.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/899/001/2403 CURING
50 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2451 PB 54 4 3,244 | MBINGA COFFEE 335.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
CURING
51 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative PB 14 3 843 | DAE LTD 332.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1316 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
52 Mkinga Agricultural Marketing Cooperative PB 48 48 2,928 | MBINGA COFFEE 337.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/868/001/2411 CURING LIMITED
53 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative PB 17 3 1,023 | DAE LTD 338.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society/2025-2026/1142/001/1307 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
54 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative UG 2 4 124 | DAE LTD 215.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society/2025-2026/1142/001/1300 LIMITED
55 Kinjolu Agricultural Marketing Cooperative UG 3 0 180 | DAE LTD 212.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Society/2025-2026/1142/002/1309 LTD
SONGWE - 405 Bags | 24,303 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
56 HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- F 14 17 857 | CMS LTD MBOZI 219.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1233/001/682 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
59 HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- TT 15 34 934 | CMS LTD MBOZI 235.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1233/001/683 LIMITED
62 HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- AF 10 2 602 | CMS LTD MBOZI 250.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1233/001/684 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
66 HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- C 15 12 912 | CMS LTD MBOZI 284.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/1233/001/685 LTD
69 HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- B 87 1 5,221 | CMS LTD MBOZI 339.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/1233/001/686
76} HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 347.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/1233/001/687 PLANTATION LTD
77} HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- A 2 6 126 | CMS LTD MBOZI 331.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1233/001/687 LIMITED
82] HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/1233/001/688
83] HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 25 5 1,505 | CMS LTD MBOZI 339.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1233/001/688 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
89 HAYUNYI AMCOS LTD/2025- PB 35) 46 2,146 | CMS LTD MBOZI 338.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/1233/001/689
IYUNGA MBEYA - 1,253 Bags | 75,207 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
57 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 2 21 141 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 222.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/188/001/1287 WH
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58 Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- F 22 47 1,367 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 248.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/247/001/1324 WH
60 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 8 49 529 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 245.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/188/001/1286 WH
61 Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- T 65 21 3,921 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 267.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/247/001/1323 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
63 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 8 9 489 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 264.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/188/001/1285 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
64 Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- AF 50 39 3,039 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 269.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/247/001/1322 WH LTD
65 Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- E 21 47 1,307 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 240.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/247/001/1321 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
67 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- © 3 0 180 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 284.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/188/001/1284 WH LTD
68 Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- C 21 21 1,281 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 284.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/247/001/1320 WH LTD
70 Matawe AMCOS/2025- B 19 41 1,181 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 336.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/153/002/1328 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
71 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 34 30 2,070 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 336.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/188/001/1283 WH LIMITED
72] Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/247/001/1319 WH
73] Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- B 52 0 3,120 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 341.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/247/001/1319 WH
74 Itentula AMCOS Ltd/2025- AB 1 0 60 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 320.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/46/003/1288 WH LIMITED
75 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- AB 6 15 375 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 333.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/188/002/1289 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
78 Matawe AMCOS/2025- A 25 51 1,551 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 338.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/153/002/1327 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
79 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 62 35 3,755 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 339.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/188/001/1282 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
80] Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/247/001/1318 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
81] Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- A 68 24 4,104 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 342.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/247/001/1318 WH
84 Matawe AMCOS/2025- AA 37 35 2,255 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 346.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/153/002/1326 WH
85 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 90 17 5,417 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 343.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/188/001/1281 WH
86) Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 345.00 Sold MONDULI COFFEE
2026/247/001/1317 WH ESTATE LTD
87) Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 342.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/247/001/1317 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
88) Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- AA 73 9 4,389 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 344.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/247/001/1317 WH LIMITED
90 Matawe AMCOS/2025- PB 13 43 823 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 338.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/153/002/1325 WH LIMITED
91 lhombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 29 47 1,787 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/188/001/1280 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
92} Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 343.00 Sold BURKA ESTATE LTD
2026/247/001/1316 WH
93} Mimba Farms Ltd/2025- PB 16 50 1,010 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 345.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/247/001/1316 WH PLANTATION LTD
94 Matawe AMCOS/2025- UG 12 32 752 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 264.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/153/002/1329 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
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95 Ihombe AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 0 47 47 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 248.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/188/002/1290 WH
136 MSUNTE PROBATIONARY UG 4 17 257 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 207.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
AMCOS/2025-2026/926/001/1075 WH LIMITED
MOSHI MJINI - 401 Bags | 24,062 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
96 KIBOSHO CENTRAL AMCOS/2025- F 0 53 53 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 180.00 No bid -
2026/272/001/609
97 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/001/614 F 0 42 42 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 195.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
98 Uru Kati Mawela AMCOS/2025- C 9 45 585 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 275.00 No bid -
2026/140/001/638
99 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/001/613 Cc 4 16 256 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 275.00 No bid =
100 KIBOSHO CENTRAL AMCOS/2025- C 4 8 248 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 275.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/272/001/608 LTD
101 Kashashi AMCOs/2025-2026/301/001/622 AB 20 54 1,254 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 335.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
102 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/001/612 AB 29 1 1,741 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 337.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
103 Uru Kati Mawela AMCOS/2025- AB 63 37 3,817 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 338.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/140/001/636 LIMITED
104 KIBOSHO CENTRAL AMCOS/2025- AB 29 13 1,753 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 339.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/272/001/607
105 Kindi RCS Limited/2025- AB 25 11 1,511 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1156/001/617 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
106 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025- AB 20 39 1,239 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 340.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/276/002/627 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
107 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/002/632 AB 18 52 1,132 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 340.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
108 Kashashi AMCOs/2025-2026/301/001/621 AA 14 52 892 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 340.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
109 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/001/611 AA 10 53 653 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 343.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
110 Uru Kati Mawela AMCOS/2025- AA 25 17 1,517 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 340.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/140/001/635
111 KIBOSHO CENTRAL AMCOS/2025- AA 8 58 538 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 341.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/272/001/606 LIMITED
112 Kindi RCS Limited/2025- AA 6 19 379 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1156/001/616 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
113 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025- AA 6 29 389 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 340.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/276/002/626
114 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/002/631 AA 5 2 302 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
115 Kashashi AMCOs/2025-2026/301/001/620 PB 2 18 138 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 326.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
116 Nkoanrua RCS Ltd/2025-2026/20/001/610 PB 2 46 166 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 336.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
117 Uru Kati Mawela AMCOS/2025- PB 9 29 569 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 326.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/140/001/634 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
118 KIBOSHO CENTRAL AMCOS/2025- PB 3 14 194 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 326.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/272/001/605 LIMITED
119 Kindi RCS Limited/2025- PB 2 21 141 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 330.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1156/001/615 LIMITED
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120 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025- PB 2 24 144 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 327.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/276/002/625 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
121 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/002/630 PB 1 26 86 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 321.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
122 Kindi RCS Limited/2025-2026/1156/001, UG 8 40 520 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 219.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2025-2026/1156/001/618 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
123 Kashashi AMCOs/2025-2026/301/001, UG 3 29 209 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 225.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2025-2026/301/001/623 LIMITED
124 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025- UG 5 27 327 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 221.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/276/002, 2025-2026/276/002/628 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
125 MUDIO RCS LTD/2025-2026/42/002/633 UG 4 11 251 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 222.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
126 Uru Kati Mawela AMCOS/2025- UG 3 17 197 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 214.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/140/001/637 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
127 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025- AB 22 47 1,367 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 338.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/115/001/913 MOSHI WH LIMITED
128 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025- AA 3 38 218 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 339.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/115/001/912 MOSHI WH LIMITED
129 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025- PB 2 21 141 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 320.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/115/001/911 MOSHI WH LIMITED
130 Shari Speciality Coffee Group/2025- UG 4 37 277 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 223.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/115/001/914 MOSHI WH LIMITED
131 LUKANI LOSAA AMCOS LTD/2025- F 4 50 290 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 185.00 No bid -
2026/221/001/578
132 MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE F 1 52 112 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 185.00 No bid -
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/001/584
133 Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025- F 1 26 86 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 185.00 No bid -
2026/288/001/556
134 Masama Roo Amcos Ltd/2025- (63 3 42 222 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 275.00 No bid -
2026/276/001/567
135 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society UG 1 46 106 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 210.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001, 2025- LIMITED
2026/270/001/560
Issued by : TCB SYSTEM
Date Issued : 2026-01-16 17:14:33
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