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IYUNGA MBEYA - 177 Bags | 10,659 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

1 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1451

F 4 0 240 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

205.00 No bid -

2 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1450

TT 6 0 360 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

220.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

3 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1449

AF 5 27 327 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

224.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

4 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1448

C 6 37 397 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

284.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

5 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1447

B 46 0 2,760 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

341.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

7 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1446

A 39 0 2,340 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

365.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

8 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1445

AA 39 0 2,340 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

356.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

9 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1444

PB 31 35 1,895 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

356.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

SONGWE - 26 Bags | 1,616 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

6 Shimilangwada Estate Co. Ltd/2025-
2026/19/002/1467

AB 10 28 628 MCCCO MBOZI 344.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

60 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/642

F 1 13 73 CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -

61 MAULA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/258/001/602

F 6 57 417 CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -

62 Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/001/634 F 1 56 116 CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -

63 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/001/610

F 2 1 121 CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -

64 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/002/618

F 1 23 83 CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -

65 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/643

AF 1 6 66 CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 No bid -

66 Nansama AMCOS/2025-
2026/177/002/620

AF 0 52 52 CMS LTD MBOZI 201.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

67 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/649

PB 1 0 60 CMS LTD MBOZI 220.00 No bid -

MBINGA - 1,631 Bags | 97,900 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

10 LISAU AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/857/004/2292

F 27 0 1,620 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
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11 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/002/1371

F 7 22 442 DAE LTD 230.00 No bid -

12 Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2548 F 14 10 850 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

13 LONGA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1147/001/2212

F 2 56 176 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 No bid -

14 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2606

F 23 59 1,439 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 No bid -

15 LONGA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1147/002/2220

F 11 15 675 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 No bid -

16 LISAU AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/857/003/2284

F 14 17 857 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

17 Kimuli AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/84/003/2228

F 6 54 414 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

18 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/1375

TT 36 4 2,164 DAE LTD 280.00 No bid -

19 Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2549 TT 5 49 349 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

20 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2607

TT 12 11 731 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

21 LISAU AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/857/004/2293

TT 11 8 668 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

214.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

22 Kimuli AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/84/003/2229

TT 1 52 112 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

212.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

23 LONGA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1147/001/2213

TT 0 14 14 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

212.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

24 LONGA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1147/002/2221

TT 10 41 641 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

214.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

25 LISAU AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/857/003/2285

TT 0 52 52 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

212.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

26 Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2550 AF 9 5 545 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

226.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

27 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2608

AF 24 24 1,464 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

222.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

28 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/1374

AF 28 19 1,699 DAE LTD 280.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

29 LISAU AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/857/004/2294

AF 22 39 1,359 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

247.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

30 LONGA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1147/001/2214

AF 1 42 102 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

228.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

31 LISAU AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/857/003/2286

AF 6 52 412 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

253.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

32 Kimuli AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/84/003/2230

AF 7 52 472 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

247.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

33 LONGA AMCOS/2025-
2026/1147/002/2222

AF 21 21 1,281 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

255.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

34 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/1376

E 14 51 891 DAE LTD 280.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
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35 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/001/1370

C 25 51 1,551 DAE LTD 312.00 No bid -

36 Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2551 C 31 48 1,908 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

296.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

37 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2609

C 36 34 2,194 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

292.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

38 Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2552 B 87 38 5,258 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

354.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

39 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2610

B 72 52 4,372 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

357.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

40} Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2553 A 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

358.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

41} Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2553 A 47 48 2,868 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

356.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

42} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2611

A 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

355.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

43} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2611

A 35 2 2,102 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

359.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

44] Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2554 AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

359.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

45] Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2554 AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

362.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

46] Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2554 AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

357.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

47] Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2554 AA 14 6 846 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

352.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

48) Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2612

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

351.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

49) Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2612

AA 100 0 6,000 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

359.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

50) Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2612

AA 59 33 3,573 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

355.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

51 Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/004/2555 PB 49 13 2,953 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

357.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

52 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/003/2613

PB 48 30 2,910 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

357.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited

58 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/1373

F 42 23 2,543 DAE LTD 190.00 No bid -

59 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/1372

C 39 16 2,356 DAE LTD 270.00 No bid -

68 Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/003/2508 F 14 52 892 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

200.00 No bid -

69 Ilela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2445 TT 2 25 145 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

205.00 No bid -

MOSHI MJINI - 127 Bags | 7,652 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

53 BLUE MOUNTAIN COFFEE
FARMS/2025-2026/910/001/934

REJ 1 46 106 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

211.00 Sold TCB CRU

54 BLOCK AND BOCHA LTD/2025-
2026/909/004/928

REJ 7 18 438 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

207.00 Sold TCB CRU

55 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024-
2025/1241/036/859

REJ 24 58 1,498 GOURMET MOSHI 214.00 Sold TCB CRU

56 ROCKY SPECIALTY COFFEE/2025-
2026/1006/003/220

UG 91 34 5,494 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

280.00 Sold TCB CRU
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57 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024-
2025/1241/037/860

AA 1 56 116 GOURMET MOSHI 320.00 No bid -

Issued by : TCB SYSTEM
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