United Republic of Tanzania

Tanzania Coffee Board

P.O Box 732, Moshi, Tanzania | E-Mail: info@coffee.go.tz | Tel : (027)27 52324 | TIN : 100- 167-174 | VRN : 16-007036-G

S
COFEEE

Soar®

Auction No : TCB/M/10 Auction Date : 16/0CT/2025
MBINGA - 1,317 Bags | 79,026 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS || WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/185 F 0 24 24 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 200.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD MBINGA
2 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY F 42 46 2,566 | MBINGA COFFEE 261.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003, 2025- CURING
2026/1178/004/2532
3 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY F 6 56 416 | MBINGA COFFEE 226.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LTD/2025-2026/1178/005/2548 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
4 MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- F 12 19 739 | MBINGA COFFEE 222.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/885/001/2670 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
5 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY F 15 18 918 | MBINGA COFFEE 233.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/001, 2025- CURING
2026/1178/002/2516
6 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/002/190 F 1 7 67 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 210.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD MBINGA
7 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY T 9 40 580 | MBINGA COFFEE 260.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD/2025-2026/1178/001, 2025- CURING LIMITED
2026/1178/003/2517
8 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY T 4 52 292 | MBINGA COFFEE 260.00 No bid -
LTD/2025-2026/1178/002, 2025- CURING
2026/1178/004/2525
9 MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- T 6 11 371 | MBINGA COFFEE 261.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/885/001/2671 CURING LIMITED
10 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY AF 22 5 1,325 | MBINGA COFFEE 271.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/004, 2025- CURING
2026/1178/005/2542
11 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY AF 51 6 3,066 | MBINGA COFFEE 279.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/001, 2025- CURING
2026/1178/003/2518
12 MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- AF 9 44 584 | MBINGA COFFEE 260.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/885/001/2672 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
13 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/188 C 14 44 884 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 272.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD MBINGA
14 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY C 55 16 3,316 | MBINGA COFFEE 297.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/004, 2025- CURING
2026/1178/005/2543
15) TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY C 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 306.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/2535 CURING
16) TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY C 13 18 798 | MBINGA COFFEE 301.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/2535 CURING LIMITED
17 MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- C 34 12 2,052 | MBINGA COFFEE 277.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/885/001/2673 CURING
18 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY C 44 26 2,666 | MBINGA COFFEE 301.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/001/2519 CURING
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19 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/002/192 C 5 29 329 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 290.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD MBINGA
20 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/189 B 16 59 1,019 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 352.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD MBINGA
21 MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- B 60 37 3,637 | MBINGA COFFEE 368.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/885/001/2674 CURING Limited
22 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/002/194 B 8 9 489 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 363.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD MBINGA LIMITED
23 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/183 A 62 54 3,774 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 367.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD MBINGA
24} MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 370.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/885/001/2675 CURING Limited
25} MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- A 3 17 197 | MBINGA COFFEE 357.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/885/001/2675 CURING LIMITED
26 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/002/195 A 39 23 2,363 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 370.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
LTD MBINGA Limited
27 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/184 AA 73 49 4,429 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 370.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD MBINGA
28] MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 374.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/885/001/2676 CURING
29] MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- AA 73 45 4,425 | MBINGA COFFEE 373.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/885/001/2676 CURING
30 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/002/196 AA 63 27 3,807 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 375.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD MBINGA LIMITED
31 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/187 PB 4 il 241 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 345.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
LTD MBINGA Limited
32 MAKONGA AMCOS/2025- PB 42 41 2,561 | MBINGA COFFEE 369.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/885/001/2677 CURING Limited
33 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/002/193 PB 2 49 169 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 365.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD MBINGA LIMITED
34 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/001/186 UG 6 6 366 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 257.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD MBINGA
35 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/002/191 UG 2 53 173 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 270.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD MBINGA LIMITED
52 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY F 42 23 2,543 | DAE LTD 190.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/1373 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
53 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/003/2508 F 14 52 892 | MBINGA COFFEE 190.00 No bid -
CURING
54 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- F 23 59 1,439 | MBINGA COFFEE 190.00 No bid -
2026/869/003/2606 CURING
55 LONGA AMCOS/2025- F 11 15 675 | MBINGA COFFEE 190.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1147/002/2220 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
56 LONGA AMCOS/2025- F 2 56 176 | MBINGA COFFEE 190.00 No bid -
2026/1147/001/2212 CURING
57 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY F 7 22 442 | DAE LTD 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LTD/2025-2026/1178/002/1371 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
58 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/002/2445 TT 2 25 145 | MBINGA COFFEE 210.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
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59 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY TT 36 4 2,164 | DAE LTD 290.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/1375
60 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY C 39 16 2,356 | DAE LTD 293.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/003/1372
61 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY C 25 51 1,551 | DAE LTD 280.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LTD/2025-2026/1178/001/1370 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
MOSHI MJINI - 69 Bags | 4,179 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |[POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
36 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED C 2 7 127 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 228.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH LIMITED
2026/1224/004/229
37 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED AB 18 15 1,095 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 365.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH Limited
2026/1224/004/228
38 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED AA 6 19 379 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 370.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
2026/1224/004/227
39 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED PB 4 20 260 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 367.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
2026/1224/004/226
40 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED UG 16 14 974 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 273.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH LIMITED
2026/1224/003/225
41 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED UG 14 37 877 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 270.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH TRADING COMPANY
2026/1224/004/230 LIMITED
49 SIHA KIYEYO AMCOS LTD/2025- AB 2 22 142 | GOURMET MOSHI 317.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/263/003/987 LIMITED
50 Tanja Corporation Limited/2024- AA 1 56 116 | GOURMET MOSHI 325.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2025/1241/037/860 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
51 SIHA KIYEYO AMCOS LTD/2025- uG 3 29 209 | GOURMET MOSHI 236.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/263/003/986 LIMITED
IYUNGA MBEYA - 98 Bags | 5,908 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
42 ITENDE JKT COFFEE FARM/2025- C 1 57 117 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 300.00 Sold CETCO (T)LTD
2026/331/001/1505 WH
43 ITENDE JKT COFFEE FARM/2025- B 27 16 1,636 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 378.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/331/001/1504 WH LIMITED
44 ITENDE JKT COFFEE FARM/2025- A 26 45 1,605 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 378.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/331/001/1503 WH LIMITED
45 ITENDE JKT COFFEE FARM/2025- AA 17 24 1,044 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 381.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/331/001/1502 WH LIMITED
46 ITENDE JKT COFFEE FARM/2025- PB 8 45 525 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 373.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/331/001/1501 WH LIMITED
47 ITENDE JKT COFFEE FARM/2025- uG 6 5 365 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 276.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/331/002/1507 WH LIMITED
48 ITENDE JKT COFFEE FARM/2025- UG 6 16 376 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 279.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/331/001/1506 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
62 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 4 0 240 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 210.00 No bid -
2026/230/001/1451 WH
Issued by : TCB SYSTEM
Date Issued : 2026-01-16 17:12:05

Page 3 of 3 | Auction : TCB/M/10 Printed On : 2026-01-16 17:12:05



