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AUCTION RESULTS

Auction No : TCB/M/11 Auction Date : 23/OCT/2025

MBINGA - 1,301 Bags | 78,077 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

1 Mhekela Amcos/2025-2026/893/001/1073 F 1 16 76 CMS LTD MBINGA 180.00 No bid -

2 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2117

F 7 16 436 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

218.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

3 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/010/1502

F 35 10 2,110 DAE LTD 255.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

4 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1492

F 1 30 90 DAE LTD 219.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

5 Mhekela Amcos/2025-2026/893/001/1072 TT 1 0 60 CMS LTD MBINGA 200.00 No bid -

6 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/010/1504

TT 37 3 2,223 DAE LTD 255.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

7 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/001/2109

TT 0 35 35 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

231.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

8 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1493

TT 3 25 205 DAE LTD 230.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

9 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2118

TT 3 45 225 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

230.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

10 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1494

AF 8 0 480 DAE LTD 243.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

11 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/010/1505

AF 22 21 1,341 DAE LTD 299.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

12 KITESA AMCOS/2025-
2026/891/002/2119

AF 6 37 397 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

284.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

13 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1495

E 5 7 307 DAE LTD 242.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

14 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/010/1503

E 5 24 324 DAE LTD 255.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

15 Mhekela Amcos/2025-2026/893/001/1071 C 3 51 231 CMS LTD MBINGA 252.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

16 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1496

C 32 57 1,977 DAE LTD 316.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

17 LIYOMBO AMCOS LTD/2024-
2025/851/010/1847

B 25 53 1,553 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

240.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

18 Mhekela Amcos/2025-2026/893/001/1070 B 3 47 227 CMS LTD MBINGA 300.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

19) Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1497

B 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 386.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

20) Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1497

B 56 38 3,398 DAE LTD 387.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

21 Mhekela Amcos/2025-2026/893/001/1069 A 3 15 195 CMS LTD MBINGA 302.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
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22] Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1498

A 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 390.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

23] Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1498

A 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 390.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

24] Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1498

A 15 45 945 DAE LTD 385.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

25 Mhekela Amcos/2025-2026/893/001/1068 AA 4 18 258 CMS LTD MBINGA 304.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

26} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1499

AA 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 391.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

27} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1499

AA 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 393.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

28} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1499

AA 28 58 1,738 DAE LTD 392.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

29} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1500

AAA 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 395.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

30} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1500

AAA 100 0 6,000 DAE LTD 392.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

31} Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1500

AAA 13 46 826 DAE LTD 389.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

32 Mhekela Amcos/2025-2026/893/001/1067 PB 3 57 237 CMS LTD MBINGA 315.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

33 Mikalanga Amcos/2025-
2026/869/005/1501

PB 73 50 4,430 DAE LTD 387.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

34 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/010/1506

UG 8 25 505 DAE LTD 256.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

50 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/007, 2025-
2026/1178/008/2742

F 27 54 1,674 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

304.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

51 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/006, 2025-
2026/1178/009/2734

F 14 50 890 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

310.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

52 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/006, 2025-
2026/1178/009/2735

TT 6 51 411 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

304.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

53 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/007, 2025-
2026/1178/008/2743

TT 11 6 666 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

304.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

54 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/007, 2025-
2026/1178/009/2744

AF 24 7 1,447 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

308.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

55 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/002, 2025-
2026/1178/008/2526

AF 12 42 762 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

303.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

56 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/007, 2025-
2026/1178/008/2745

C 61 50 3,710 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

333.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

57 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY
LTD/2025-2026/1178/006, 2025-
2026/1178/009/2737

C 28 8 1,688 MBINGA COFFEE
CURING

327.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

MBOZI - 330 Bags | 19,841 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

35 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/168 F 2 32 152 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

224.00 No bid -

36 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/003/174 TT 21 44 1,304 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

232.00 No bid -

37 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/004/181 TT 35 40 2,140 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

261.00 No bid -
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38 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/167 TT 37 5 2,225 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

263.00 No bid -

39 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/003/173 AF 9 26 566 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

242.00 No bid -

40 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/004/180 AF 21 35 1,295 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

264.00 No bid -

41 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/166 AF 21 8 1,268 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

265.00 No bid -

42 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/157 E 7 44 464 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

265.00 No bid -

43 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/165 C 20 59 1,259 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

312.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

44 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/004/179 C 39 42 2,382 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

45 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/003/169 PB 17 19 1,039 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

391.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

46 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/004/175 PB 58 48 3,528 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

392.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

47 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/163 PB 36 59 2,219 LIMA KWANZA FARM
WAREHOUSE

391.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD

SONGWE - 59 Bags | 3,579 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

48 IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025-
2026/45/003/690

F 59 39 3,579 CMS LTD MBOZI Withdrawn -

IYUNGA MBEYA - 4 Bags | 240 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

49 Luso AMCOS Ltd/2025-
2026/230/001/1451

F 4 0 240 City Coffee LTD Mbeya
WH

200.00 No bid -

MOSHI MJINI - 845 Bags | 50,729 Kgs

LOT NO. DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS POCKETS N/KGS WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

58 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/004/1047

F 20 44 1,244 GOURMET MOSHI 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

59 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/005, 2025-
2026/1241/006/1053

F 60 3 3,603 GOURMET MOSHI 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

60 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/003, 2025-2026/1241/007/875

F 20 4 1,204 GOURMET MOSHI 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

61 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/006/1060

TT 38 39 2,319 GOURMET MOSHI 230.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

62 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/003, 2025-2026/1241/004/876

TT 17 59 1,079 GOURMET MOSHI 230.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

63 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/007, 2025-2026/1241/005/876

TT 27 13 1,633 GOURMET MOSHI 230.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

64 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/005, 2025-
2026/1241/006/1055

C 75 30 4,530 GOURMET MOSHI 335.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

65 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/003, 2025-2026/1241/007/877

C 26 7 1,567 GOURMET MOSHI 330.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
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66 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/004/877

C 27 20 1,640 GOURMET MOSHI 336.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD

67) Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/006/1063

AB 100 0 6,000 GOURMET MOSHI 383.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

68) Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/006/1063

AB 44 8 2,648 GOURMET MOSHI 381.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

69] Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/007/1069

AB 100 0 6,000 GOURMET MOSHI 393.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

70] Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/007/1069

AB 5 17 317 GOURMET MOSHI 381.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd

71 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/006/1064

AA 13 44 824 GOURMET MOSHI 390.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

72 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/007/1070

AA 19 52 1,192 GOURMET MOSHI 392.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

73 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/006/1062

PB 7 47 467 GOURMET MOSHI 389.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED

74 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/007, 2025-
2026/1241/004/1062

PB 43 32 2,612 GOURMET MOSHI 399.00 Sold MONDULI COFFEE
ESTATE LTD

75 Tanja Corporation Limited/2025-
2026/1241/005, 2025-
2026/1241/003/1056

PB 71 54 4,314 GOURMET MOSHI 398.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED

76 TCB - MOSHI/2025-2026/910/001/934
(RS TCB/M/9 LOT 53)

REJ 1 46 106 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

214.00 Sold Kigurunde

77 TCB - MOSHI/2025-2026/909/004/928
(RS TCB/M/9 LOT 54)

REJ 7 18 438 RAFIKI COFFEE LTD
MOSHI WH

214.00 Sold Kigurunde

78 TCB - MOSHI/2024-2025/1241/036/859
(RS TCB/M/9 LOT 55)

REJ 24 58 1,498 GOURMET MOSHI 214.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
SON LTD

79 TCB - MOSHI/2025-2026/1006/003/220
(RS TCB/M/9 LOT 56)

UG 91 34 5,494 City Coffee LTD Moshi
WH

250.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
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