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Auction No : TCB/M/13 Auction Date : 20/NOV/2025
MBINGA - 372 Bags | 22,331 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative F 45 31 2,731 | MBINGA COFFEE 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/003/3129 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
2 CAILA TRADING COMPANY F 0 56 56 | CMS LTD MBINGA 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/002/1194 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
3 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative TT 10 50 650 | MBINGA COFFEE 214.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/003/3130 CURING LIMITED
4 CAILA TRADING COMPANY T 0 56 56 | CMS LTD MBINGA 205.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/002/1193 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
5 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AF 10 37 637 | MBINGA COFFEE 222.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/003/3131 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
6 CAILA TRADING COMPANY AF 2 10 130 | CMS LTD MBINGA 230.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/002/1192 LIMITED
7 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative C 60 48 3,648 | MBINGA COFFEE 230.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/003/3132 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
8 CAILA TRADING COMPANY C 2 28 148 | CMS LTD MBINGA 270.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/002/1191 LIMITED
9 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative B 45 39 2,739 | MBINGA COFFEE 280.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/003/3133 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
10 CAILA TRADING COMPANY B 4 7 247 | CMS LTD MBINGA 365.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/002/1190 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
11 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative A 59 10 3,550 | MBINGA COFFEE 285.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/003/3134 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
12 CAILA TRADING COMPANY A 2 56 176 | CMS LTD MBINGA 370.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/002/1189 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
13 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 65 27 3,927 | MBINGA COFFEE 290.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/003/3135 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
14 CAILA TRADING COMPANY AA 30 14 1,814 | CMS LTD MBINGA 372.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/002/1188 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
15 Kigoti Agricultural Marketing Cooperative PB 24 18 1,458 | MBINGA COFFEE 280.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Society LTD/2025-2026/848/003/3136 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
16 CAILA TRADING COMPANY PB 6 4 364 | CMS LTD MBINGA 365.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/002/1187 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
MBOZI - 673 Bags | 40,408 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
17 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- F 1 14 74 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 200.00 No bid -
2026/844/003/202 WAREHOUSE
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18 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- F 2 5 125 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 200.00 No bid -
2026/844/001/211 WAREHOUSE
23 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- T 10 43 643 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 230.00 No bid -
2026/844/004/195 WAREHOUSE
26 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- T 16 58 1,018 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 230.00 No bid -
2026/844/001/212 WAREHOUSE
27 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- T 24 57 1,497 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 230.00 No bid -
2026/844/002/207 WAREHOUSE
28 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- T 12 5 725 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 233.00 No bid -
2026/844/003/203 WAREHOUSE
31 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- AF 1 0 60 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 234.00 No bid -
2026/844/004/196 WAREHOUSE
32 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- AF 0 50 50 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 234.00 No bid -
2026/844/003/204 WAREHOUSE
33 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- AF 1 16 76 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 234.00 No bid -
2026/844/002/208 WAREHOUSE
34 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- AF 2 14 134 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 234.00 No bid -
2026/844/001/213 WAREHOUSE
41 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- c 35 55 2,155 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 319.00 No bid -
2026/844/003/205 WAREHOUSE
44 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- c 28 44 1,724 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 323.00 No bid -
2026/844/002/209 WAREHOUSE
45 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- © 33 16 1,996 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 340.00 No bid -
2026/844/001/214 WAREHOUSE
46 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- c 26 41 1,601 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 325.00 No bid -
2026/844/004/197 WAREHOUSE
85 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- PB 53 43 3,223 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 381.00 No bid -
2026/844/002/210 WAREHOUSE
86 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- PB 49 54 2,994 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 381.00 No bid -
2026/844/001/184 WAREHOUSE
87 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- PB 44 45 2,685 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 383.00 No bid -
2026/844/004/201 WAREHOUSE
88 LIMA KWANZA LIMITED/2025- PB 53 24 3,204 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 382.00 No bid -
2026/844/003/206 WAREHOUSE
112 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/005/215 TT 43 30 2,610 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 230.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
113 | Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/005/216 AF 14 30 870 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 234.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
114 | Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/005/217 c 58 50 3,530 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 340.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
WAREHOUSE (TANZANIA) LIMITED
115 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/168 F 2 32 152 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 220.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
116 | Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/003/174 TT 21 44 1,304 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 230.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
117 | Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/004/181 T 35 40 2,140 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 255.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
118 | Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/167 T 37 5 2,225 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 235.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
119 | Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/003/173 AF 9 26 566 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 240.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
120 | Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/004/180 AF 21 35 1,295 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 280.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
121 | Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/002/166 AF 21 8 1,268 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 272.00 No bid -
WAREHOUSE
122 Lima Ltd/2025-2026/141/001/157 E 7 44 464 | LIMA KWANZA FARM 305.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
WAREHOUSE TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
IYUNGA MBEYA - 2,981 Bags | 178,876 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |[POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE| STATUS |[BUYER
19 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1606 F 5 22 322 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 210.00 No bid -
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20 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- F 9 8 548 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 210.00 No bid -
2026/210/001/1598 WH
21 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 18 41 1,121 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 210.00 No bid -
2026/207/001/1590 WH
22 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- F 7 28 448 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 251.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/245/001/1570 WH
24 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1605 T 10 38 638 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 230.00 No bid -
WH
25 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- TT 18 16 1,096 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 231.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/210/001/1597 WH LIMITED
29 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- T 46 38 2,798 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 230.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/207/001/1589 WH LIMITED
30 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- TT 9 41 581 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 287.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/245/001/1569 WH
35 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 39 46 2,386 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 234.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/207/001/1588 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
36 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- AF 26 14 1,574 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 234.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/210/001/1596 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
37 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1604 AF 12 27 747 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 234.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
38 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- AF {17 49 1,069 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 262.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/245/001/1568 WH
39 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- E 6 31 391 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 311.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/207/001/1587 WH SON LTD
40 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- C 4 46 286 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 301.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/245/002/1575 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
42 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1603 C 6 17 377 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 324.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
43 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- C 11 0 660 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 316.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/210/001/1595 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
47 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- C 19 18 1,158 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 326.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/207/001/1586 WH LTD
49 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- © 8 54 534 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 344.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/245/001/1567 WH
50 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- B 8 18 498 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 331.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/245/003/1580 WH
51 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- B 31 23 1,883 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 359.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/245/002/1574 WH
52 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1602 B 82 8 4,928 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 374.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
WH LIMITED
53) Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 375.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/207/001/1585 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
54) Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 375.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
2026/207/001/1585 WH LTD
55) Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 100 0 6,000 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 376.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/207/001/1585 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
56) Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 16 8 968 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 375.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/207/001/1585 WH
57) UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- B 100 0 6,000 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 379.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/210/001/1594 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
58) UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- B 75 0 4,500 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 379.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/210/001/1594 WH LIMITED
59 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- B 81 36 4,896 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 377.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/245/001/1566 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
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60 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- A 27 25 1,645 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 365.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/245/002/1573 WH
61 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- A 5 35 335 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 370.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/245/003/1579 WH
62} Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1601 A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 382.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
63} Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1601 A 5 24 324 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 376.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
WH LTD
64 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- A 71 0 4,260 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/245/001/1565 WH
65) Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 389.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/207/001/1584 WH SON LTD
66) Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 392.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/207/001/1584 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
67) Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 396.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/207/001/1584 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
68) Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 54 32 3,272 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/207/001/1584 WH SON LTD
69} UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 381.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/210/001/1593 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
70} UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 382.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/210/001/1593 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
71} UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- A 27 33 1,653 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 383.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/210/001/1593 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
72 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- AA 3 39 219 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 360.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/245/003/1578 WH
73 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- AA 28 25 1,705 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 372.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/245/002/1572 WH
74 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1600 AA 92 34 5,554 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 389.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
WH SON LTD
75 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- AA 69 46 4,186 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 397.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/245/001/1564 WH PLANTATION LTD
76} Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 399.00 Sold AFRICAN
2026/207/001/1583 WH PARTNERSHIPS
KILIMANJARO LIMITED
77} Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 391.00 Sold KILIMANJARO
2026/207/001/1583 WH PLANTATION LTD
78} Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 386.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/207/001/1583 WH
79} Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 0 8 8 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 372.00 No bid -
2026/207/001/1583 WH
80] UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 399.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/210/001/1592 WH
81] UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 406.00 Sold KAMAL AGRO LTD
2026/210/001/1592 WH
82] UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- AA 12 35 755 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 383.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/210/001/1592 WH SON LTD
83 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- PB 4 54 294 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 351.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/245/003/1577 WH SON LTD
84 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- PB 18 8 1,088 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 371.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/245/002/1571 WH SON LTD
89] Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 373.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/207/001/1582 WH LIMITED
90] Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 383.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/207/001/1582 WH LIMITED
91] Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 16 23 983 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 370.00 Sold M/S SHERRIF DEWJI &
2026/207/001/1582 WH SON LTD
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92 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1599 PB 74 0 4,440 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 377.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
WH LIMITED
93] UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 372.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/210/001/1591 WH LIMITED
94] UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- PB 20 24 1,224 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 378.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/210/001/1591 WH
95 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- PB 36 41 2,201 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 383.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/245/001/1563 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
96 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- UG 11 49 709 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 216.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/245/003/1581 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
97 Mpalila Sheria Begeze/2025- uG 26 54 1,614 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 232.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/245/002/1576 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
SONGWE - 933 Bags | 56,002 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
48 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY C 22 46 1,366 | MCCCO MBOZI 344.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
LTD/2025-2026/1178/009/1481
99 IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- F 76 50 4,610 | CMS LTD MBOZI 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/004/771 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
100 IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- TT 65 8 3,908 | CMS LTD MBOZI 245.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/004/773 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
101 IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- AF 14 55 895 | CMS LTD MBOZI 230.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/004/772 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
102 IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- (63 54 6 3,246 | CMS LTD MBOZI 297.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/004/774 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
103) IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 99 59 5,999 | CMS LTD MBOZI 349.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/45/004/775 LIMITED
104) IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 99 59 5,999 | CMS LTD MBOZI 353.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/45/004/775
105) IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 52 52 3,172 | CMS LTD MBOZI 358.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/45/004/775
106} IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 99 59 5,999 | CMS LTD MBOZI 372.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/45/004/776
107} IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 99 59 5,999 | CMS LTD MBOZI 357.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/45/004/776 LIMITED
108} IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 0 39 39 | CMS LTD MBOZI 332.00 No bid -
2026/45/004/776
109] IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 99 59 5,999 | CMS LTD MBOZI 365.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/45/004/777 LIMITED
110] IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 85 24 5,124 | CMS LTD MBOZI 366.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/45/004/777
111 IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- PB 60 47 3,647 | CMS LTD MBOZI 367.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/45/004/778
MOSHI MJINI - 24 Bags | 1,460 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
98 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED uG 24 20 1,460 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 252.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN

(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/006, 2025-2026/1224/009,
2025-2026/1224/005, 2025-
2026/1224/002, 2025-2026/1224/007,
2025-2026/1224/008, 2025-
2026/1224/010, 2025-202

WH

(TANZANIA) LIMITED
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