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Auction No . TCB/M/14 Auction Date : 27/NOV/2025
MBINGA - 3,016 Bags | 180,966 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS || WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/008/1631 F 14 28 868 | DAE LTD 180.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
2 Mikalanga Amcos/2025- F 23 59 1,439 | MBINGA COFFEE 181.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/869/003/2606 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
3 llela AMCOS/2025-2026/144/003/2508 F 14 52 892 | MBINGA COFFEE 180.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
4 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- F 95 39 5,739 | DAE LTD 270.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/1265/002/1639
5) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- F 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/123/002/3248 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
6) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- F 47 7 2,827 | MBINGA COFFEE 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/123/002/3248 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
7 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/008/1632 T 7 6 426 | DAE LTD 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
8 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- T 2 17 137 | DAE LTD No bid -
2026/1265/002/1640
9 KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- T 42 22 2,542 | MBINGA COFFEE 282.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/123/002/3249 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
10 KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AF 44 51 2,691 | MBINGA COFFEE 296.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/123/002/3250 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
11 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- E 4 55 295 | DAE LTD 263.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1265/002/1641 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
12 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/008/1633 C 11 29 689 | DAE LTD 260.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
13) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- @ 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 332.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/123/002/3251 CURING
14) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- C 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 321.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/123/002/3251 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
15) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- C 99 24 5,964 | MBINGA COFFEE 318.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/123/002/3251 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
16 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/008/1634 B 46 42 2,802 | DAE LTD 320.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
17) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/123/002/3252 CURING
18) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/123/002/3252 CURING
19) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/123/002/3252 CURING Limited
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20) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/123/002/3252 CURING
21) KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- B 51 21 3,081 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/123/002/3252 CURING
22 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/008/1635 A 34 40 2,080 | DAELTD 320.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
23} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/123/002/3253 CURING LIMITED
24} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/123/002/3253 CURING Limited
25} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/123/002/3253 CURING
26} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/123/002/3253 CURING Limited
27} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/123/002/3253 CURING Limited
28} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- A 68 52 4,132 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/123/002/3253 CURING LIMITED
29 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/008/1636 AA 24 36 1,476 | DAE LTD 323.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
30] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 382.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/123/002/3254 CURING LIMITED
31] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/123/002/3254 CURING
32] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 382.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/123/002/3254 CURING LIMITED
33] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 382.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/123/002/3254 CURING
34] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 381.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/123/002/3254 CURING LIMITED
35] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 381.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/123/002/3254 CURING
36] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 382.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/123/002/3254 CURING
37] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 383.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/123/002/3254 CURING LIMITED
38] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 381.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/123/002/3254 CURING
39] KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- AA 7 47 467 | MBINGA COFFEE 381.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/123/002/3254 CURING
40 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/008/1637 AAA 21 6 1,266 | DAE LTD 323.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
41 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/008/1638 PB 11 41 701 | DAE LTD 328.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
42} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 381.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/123/002/3255 CURING
43} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 381.00 Sold Tanin Global Ltd
2026/123/002/3255 CURING
44} KINGERIKITI AMCOS/2025- PB 40 52 2,452 | MBINGA COFFEE 380.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/123/002/3255 CURING
MOSHI MJINI - 61 Bags | 3,695 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
45 J & S PREMIUM PRODUCT (T) F 5 41 341 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH Withdrawn -
LTD/2025-2026/1168/011, 2025~
2026/1168/010, 2025-2026/1168/009,
2025-2026/1168/007, 2025-
2026/1168/008/764
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46 | LUKANI LOSAA AMCOS LTD/2025- F 4 42 282 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 205.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/221/001/578
47 | Masama Mula RCS Ltd/2025- F 1 18 78 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 180.00 Sold TCB CRU
2026/288/001/556
48 | MANUSHI NARUMU COOPERATIVE F 1 44 104 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 201.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
JOINT ENTERPRISE LIMETD/2025-
2026/971/001/584
49 | J &S PREMIUM PRODUCT (T) c 8 19 499 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH Withdrawn | -
LTD/2025-2026/1168/012/773
50 | J&S PREMIUM PRODUCT (T) c 31 13 1,873 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH Withdrawn | -
LTD/2025-2026/1168/011, 2025-
2026/1168/010, 2025-2026/1168/009,
2025-2026/1168/007, 2025-
2026/1168/008/763
51 | J&S PREMIUM PRODUCT (T) uG 4 38 278 | Tccco - MosHI wH Withdrawn | -
LTD/2025-2026/1168/011, 2025-
2026/1168/010, 2025-2026/1168/009,
2025-2026/1168/007, 2025-
2026/1168/008/762
52 | J&S PREMIUM PRODUCT (T) uG 2 35 155 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH Withdrawn | -
LTD/2025-2026/1168/012, 2025-
2026/1168/012/771
95 | LYAMUNGO AMCOS LTD/2025- F 1 25 85 | Tccco - MosHI wH 180.00 Sold TCB CRU
2026/1238/001/696
SONGWE - 910 Bags | 54,644 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS [POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
53] | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- F 99 56 5,996 | MCCCO MBOZI Nobid |-
2026/323/003/1908
54] | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- F 29 0 1,740 | MCCCO MBOZI Nobid |-
2026/323/003/1908
55 | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- F 34 4 2,044 | MCCCO MBOZI Nobid |-
2026/323/002/1235
56 | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- TT 52 14 3,134 | MCCCO MBOZI Nobid |-
2026/323/003/1906
57 | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- T 16 4 964 | Mccco MBOZI Nobid |-
2026/323/002/1233
58 | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- AF 28 3 1,683 | MCCCO MBOZI 220.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/323/003/1907 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
59 | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- AF 8 0 480 | Mmccco mMBOZI 226.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/323/001/1208 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
60) | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- c 100 0 6,000 | MCCCO MBOZI 250.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/323/003/1909 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
61) | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- C 1 18 78 | Mmccco mBozI Nobid |-
2026/323/003/1909
64] | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MCCCO MBOZI 360.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/323/003/1910
65] | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MCCCO MBOZI 360.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/323/003/1910
66] | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- B 34 24 2,064 | MCCCO MBOZI 360.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/323/003/1910
70} | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MCCCO MBOZI 361.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/323/003/1911
71} | NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- A 34 3 2,043 | MCCCO MBOZI 365.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

2026/323/003/1911
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74 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- AA 89 28 5,368 | MCCCO MBOZI 380.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/323/003/1912

77 NJEJE INVESTMENT LIMITED/2025- PB 59 39 3,579 | MCCCO MBOZI 380.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/323/003/1913 LIMITED

88 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY F 1 13 73 | CMS LTD MBOZI No bid -
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/642

89 Mbombo AMCOS/2025-2026/36/001/634 F 1 56 116 | CMS LTD MBOZI No bid -

90 Nansama AMCOS/2025- F 2 1 121 | cMS LTD MBOZI No bid -
2026/177/001/610

91 Nansama AMCOS/2025- F 1 23 83 | CMS LTD MBOZI No bid -
2026/177/002/618

92 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY AF 1 6 66 | CMS LTD MBOZI No bid -
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/643

93 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY AF 15 52 952 | MCCCO MBOZI Withdrawn | -
LTD/2025-2026/1178/010/1505

94 NANGONDO PROBATIONARY PB 1 0 60 | CMS LTD MBOZI No bid -
AGRICULTURAL MARKETING
COOPERATIVE SOCIETY LTD/2025-
2026/1141/002/649

IYUNGA MBEYA - 405 Bags | 24,342 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

62 Nguiluka AMCOS/2025- c 14 36 876 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 293.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE

2026/244/001/1689 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED

67} | Nguiluka AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/244/001/1688 WH

68} | Nguiluka AMCOS/2025- B 6 21 381 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 378.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2026/244/001/1688 WH

72 Nguiluka AMCOS/2025- A 83 23 5,003 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 385.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/244/001/1687 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

75 Nguiluka AMCOS/2025- AA 77 15 4,635 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 384.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/244/001/1686 WH LIMITED

78 Nguiluka AMCOS/2025- PB 67 7 4,027 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 384.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/244/001/1685 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

80 Nguiluka AMCOS/2025- UG 57 0 3,420 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 235.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/244/001/1690 WH TRADING COMPANY

LIMITED
Mbeya, Rungwe - 136 Bags | 8,215 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

63 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION [@ 2 10 130 | RUNGWE COFFEE 281.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/001/2 CORPORATION WH LIMITED

69 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION B 6 52 412 | RUNGWE COFFEE 380.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/001/3 CORPORATION WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED

73 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION A 26 52 1,612 | RUNGWE COFFEE 380.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/001/4 CORPORATION WH LIMITED

76 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION AA 23 33 1,413 | RUNGWE COFFEE 380.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/001/5 CORPORATION WH
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79 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION PB 2 10 130 | RUNGWE COFFEE 373.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/001/1 CORPORATION WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
81 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION B 1 3 63 | RUNGWE COFFEE 320.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2024-2025/1285/002/10 CORPORATION WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
82 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION B 2 52 172 | RUNGWE COFFEE 320.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2024-2025/1285/001/6 CORPORATION WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
83 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION A 6 3 363 | RUNGWE COFFEE 322.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2024-2025/1285/002/11 CORPORATION WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
84 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION A 17 52 1,072 | RUNGWE COFFEE 322.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2024-2025/1285/001/7 CORPORATION WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
85 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION AA 8 28 508 | RUNGWE COFFEE 320.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2024-2025/1285/002/12 CORPORATION WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
86 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION AA 32 52 1,972 | RUNGWE COFFEE 324.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LIMITED/2024-2025/1285/001/8 CORPORATION WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
87 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION PB 6 9 369 | RUNGWE COFFEE 320.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LIMITED/2024-2025/1285/002/9 CORPORATION WH
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