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Auction No : TCB/M/16 Auction Date : 11/DEC/2025
MBINGA - 1,677 Bags | 100,626 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS || WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY F 17 6 1,026 | CMS LTD MBINGA 180.00 No bid -
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1428
2 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY T 10 15 615 | CMS LTD MBINGA 205.00 No bid -
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1427
3 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY AF 4 55 295 | CMS LTD MBINGA 215.00 No bid -
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1426
4 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY AF 6 50 410 | MBINGA COFFEE 271.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD/2025-2026/1178/005, 2025- CURING LTD
2026/1178/006/2549
5 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY C 60 10 3,610 | CMS LTD MBINGA 310.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1425 LTD
6 TWENDE SHAMBA COMPANY © 4 32 272 | MBINGA COFFEE 314.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
LTD/2025-2026/1178/002/2527 CURING LTD
7] LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY B 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBINGA 358.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1424 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
8] LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY B 50 9 3,009 | CMS LTD MBINGA 360.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1424 LIMITED
9} LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY A 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBINGA 361.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1423 LIMITED
10} LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY A 32 36 1,956 | CMS LTD MBINGA 360.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1423 LIMITED
11} LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY AA 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBINGA 365.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1422 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
12} LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY AA 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBINGA 367.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1422 LIMITED
13} LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY AA 88 28 5,308 | CMS LTD MBINGA 364.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1422 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
14 LIALE FARM ESTATE COMPANY PB 80 17 4,817 | CMS LTD MBINGA 358.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
LTD/2025-2026/884/004/1421 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
15 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/009/1706 uG 5 55 355 | DAE LTD 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
46 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- F 10 5 605 | MBINGA COFFEE 285.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1266/002/3272 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
47 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- F 8 33 513 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 285.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1266/003/257 LTD MBINGA TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
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48 AFAD COFFEE COMPANY F 2 55 175 | CMS LTD MBINGA 180.00 No bid -
LIMITED/2025-2026/1287/001/1412
49 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- T 1 36 96 | MBINGA COFFEE 285.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1266/002/3273 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
50 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AF 5 44 344 | MBINGA COFFEE 285.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1266/002/3274 CURING TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
51 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- c 28 57 1,737 | MBINGA COFFEE 330.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3275 CURING
52 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- C 33 2 1,982 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 330.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/259 LTD MBINGA
53 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- B 46 58 2,818 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/261 LTD MBINGA
54 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- B 45 58 2,758 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3276 CURING
55) | GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/262 LTD MBINGA
56) | GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/262 LTD MBINGA
57) | GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 18 27 1,107 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/262 LTD MBINGA
58 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 96 44 5,804 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3277 CURING
59] | GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
60] | GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
61] | GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 29 3 1,743 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
62) | GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3278 CURING
63) | GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 29 21 1,761 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3278 CURING
64 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- PB 14 30 870 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/260 LTD MBINGA
65 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- PB 27 5 1,625 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3279 CURING
66 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- UG 13 17 797 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 285.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1266/003/258 LTD MBINGA TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
67 NGIMA AMCOS/2025-2026/216/001/1404 UG 2 0 120 | CMS LTD MBINGA 205.00 No bid -
68 MOUNT LIPEMBE AGRICULTURE UG 1 38 98 | CMS LTD MBINGA 205.00 No bid -
LTD/2025-2026/1087/001/1146
SONGWE - 1,109 Bags | 66,545 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |[POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE | STATUS |[BUYER
16 IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- F 68 38 4,118 | cMs LTD MBOZI 200.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/005/794 TRADING COMPANY
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17} | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- TT 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/005/795 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
18} | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- T 27 0 1,620 | CMS LTD MBOZI 210.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/005/795 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
19 | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- AF 16 12 972 | cMs LTD MBOZI 223.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/005/796 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
20 | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- c 84 6 5,046 | CMS LTD MBOZI 267.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/45/005/797 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
23} | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 332.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/45/005/798 Limited
24} | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 335.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/45/005/798 Limited
25} | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 336.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/45/005/798 Limited
26} | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 332.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/45/005/798 LIMITED
27} | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- B 1 29 89 | cMs LTD MBOZI 320.00 No bid -
2026/45/005/798
30] | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 322.00 No bid -
2026/45/005/799
31] | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 322.00 No bid -
2026/45/005/799
32] | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- A 12 39 759 | cms LTD MBOZI 322.00 No bid -
2026/45/005/799
35) | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | CMS LTD MBOZI 342.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/45/005/800 Limited
36) | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 53 14 3,194 | CMS LTD MBOZI 342.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/45/005/800 Limited
39 | IGANDA AMCOS LTD/2025- PB 45 47 2,747 | CMS LTD MBOZI 320.00 No bid -
2026/45/005/801
IYUNGA MBEYA - 443 Bags | 26,628 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
21 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- c 2 18 138 | city Coffee LTD Mbeya 260.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/208/004/1756 WH LIMITED
22 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- c 4 0 240 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 306.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/208/001/1748 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
28 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 52 8 3,128 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 366.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/208/004/1755 WH LIMITED
29 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 37 9 2,229 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 366.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/208/001/1747 WH LIMITED
33 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 56 50 3,410 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 368.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/208/004/1754 WH LIMITED
34 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 50 42 3,042 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 368.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/208/001/1746 WH LIMITED
37 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 54 52 3,292 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 374.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/208/004/1753 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
38 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 51 0 3,060 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 370.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/208/001/1744 WH LIMITED
40 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 18 37 1,117 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 366.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/208/004/1752 WH LIMITED
41 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 45 31 2,731 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya | 370.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/208/001/1745 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
42 | Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- uG 8 22 502 | city Coffee LTD Mbeya 220.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/208/004/1757 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
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43 Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 4 24 264 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 215.00 No bid -
2026/208/003/1751 WH
44 Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- uG 11 38 698 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 220.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/208/001/1749 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
45 Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 2 20 140 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 220.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/208/002/1750 WH LIMITED
69 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1606 F 5 22 322 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 180.00 No bid -
WH
70 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- F 9 8 548 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 180.00 No bid -
2026/210/001/1598 WH
71 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 18 41 1,121 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 180.00 No bid -
2026/207/001/1590 WH
72 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1605 TT 10 38 638 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 205.00 No bid -
WH
73 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 0 8 8 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 360.00 No bid -
2026/207/001/1583 WH
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