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MBINGA - 4,268 Bags | 256,100 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
1 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025- F 2 51 171 | CMS LTD MBINGA 150.00 No bid -
2026/238/004/1553
2 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025- F 0 55 55 | CMS LTD MBINGA 150.00 No bid -
2026/881/002/1561
3] Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative F 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 180.00 No bid -
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3627 CURING
4] Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative F 11 44 704 | MBINGA COFFEE 180.00 No bid -
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3627 CURING
5 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3570 F 10 31 631 | MBINGA COFFEE 180.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
CURING Limited
6 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/003/315 F 10 54 654 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 190.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
LTD MBINGA Limited
7 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- F 27 38 1,658 | MBINGA COFFEE 190.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1190/003/3320 CURING Limited
8 Mbifacu Ltd/2025-2026/122/001/1859 F 7 52 472 | DAE LTD 190.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
9 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025- TT 4 0 240 | CMS LTD MBINGA 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/238/004/1552 Limited
10 Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative TT 17 11 1,031 | MBINGA COFFEE 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3628 CURING Limited
11 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025- TT 0 55 55 | CMS LTD MBINGA 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/881/002/1560 Limited
12 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3571 TT 2 50 170 | MBINGA COFFEE 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
CURING Limited
13 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025- AF 1 21 81 | CMS LTD MBINGA 221.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/238/004/1551 Limited
14 Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AF 12 30 750 | MBINGA COFFEE 220.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3629 CURING Limited
15 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025- AF 0 55 55 | CMS LTD MBINGA 220.00 No bid -
2026/881/002/1559
16 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- AF 19 13 1,153 | MBINGA COFFEE 220.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1190/003/3322 CURING LIMITED
17 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3572 AF 10 18 618 | MBINGA COFFEE 220.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
CURING Limited
18 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025- (03 12 56 776 | CMS LTD MBINGA 230.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/238/004/1550 Limited
19} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative C 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 230.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3630 CURING Limited
20} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative (@] 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 230.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3630 CURING Limited
21} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative C 38 1 2,281 | MBINGA COFFEE 230.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3630 CURING Limited
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22 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025- 6 34 394 | CMS LTD MBINGA 240.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/881/002/1558 Limited
23 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3573 21 1 1,261 | MBINGA COFFEE 242.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
24 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- 61 41 3,701 | MBINGA COFFEE 317.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1190/003/3323 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
25 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/003/317 9 58 598 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 316.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LTD MBINGA (TANZANIA) LIMITED
26 UPOLO AMCOS/2025- 1 42 102 | CMS LTD MBINGA 259.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1119/001/1539 LIMITED
27 Mbifacu Ltd/2025-2026/122/001/1860 11 14 674 | DAE LTD 319.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
28 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025- 41 0 2,460 | CMS LTD MBINGA 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/238/004/1549 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
29) Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3631 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
30) Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3631 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
31) Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 71 5 4,265 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 No bid -
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3631 CURING
32 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025- 30 1 1,801 | CMS LTD MBINGA 346.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/881/002/1557 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
33 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3574 27 18 1,638 | MBINGA COFFEE 356.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
34 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- 12 4 724 | MBINGA COFFEE 348.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1190/003/3324 CURING LIMITED
35 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/003/319 21 51 1,311 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 351.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LTD MBINGA (TANZANIA) LIMITED
36 UPOLO AMCOS/2025- 4 56 296 | CMS LTD MBINGA 348.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1119/001/1538 LIMITED
37 Mbifacu Ltd/2025-2026/122/001/1861 70 46 4,246 | DAE LTD 353.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
38 UKILIMASI AMCOS/2025- 2 52 172 | DAE LTD 347.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1061/002/1879 LIMITED
39 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025- 39 13 2,353 | CMS LTD MBINGA 347.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/238/004/1548 LIMITED
40} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3632 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
41} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 347.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3632 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
42} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 347.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3632 CURING LIMITED
43} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative 59 51 3,591 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3632 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
44 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025- 34 13 2,053 | CMS LTD MBINGA 347.00 No bid -
2026/881/002/1556
45 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3575 54 4 3,244 | MBINGA COFFEE 347.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
CURING
46 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- 12 56 776 | MBINGA COFFEE 347.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1190/003/3325 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
47 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/003/320 88 33 5,313 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 359.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LTD MBINGA (TANZANIA) LIMITED
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48 UPOLO AMCOS/2025- A 3 26 206 | CMS LTD MBINGA 350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1119/001/1537 LIMITED
49 Mbifacu Ltd/2025-2026/122/001/1862 A 86 0 5,160 | DAE LTD 360.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
50 UKILIMASI AMCOS/2025- A 5 23 323 | DAE LTD 354.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1061/002/1880 LIMITED
51 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025- AA a7 19 2,839 | CMS LTD MBINGA 350.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/238/004/1547 LIMITED
52} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 353.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3633 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
53} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3633 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
54} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3633 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
55} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3633 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
56} Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative AA 46 8 2,768 | MBINGA COFFEE 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3633 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
57 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025- AA 53 5 3,185 | CMS LTD MBINGA 350.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/881/002/1555 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
58 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3576 AA 99 52 5,992 | MBINGA COFFEE 356.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
CURING
59 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3576 AA 9 35 575 | MBINGA COFFEE 357.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
CURING LIMITED
60 LEADERS LINK COMPANY LTD/2025- AA 1 45 105 | MBINGA COFFEE 353.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1190/003/3326 CURING LIMITED
61 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/003/321 AA 91 19 5,479 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 363.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LTD MBINGA (TANZANIA) LIMITED
62 UPOLO AMCOS/2025- AA 16 12 972 | CMS LTD MBINGA 357.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1119/001/1536 LIMITED
63 Mbifacu Ltd/2025-2026/122/001/1863 AA 85 28 5,128 | DAE LTD 361.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
64 UKILIMASI AMCOS/2025- AA 4 52 292 | DAE LTD 358.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1061/002/1881 LIMITED
65 Mbifacu Ltd/2025-2026/122/001/1864 AAA 59 43 3,583 | DAE LTD 364.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED
66 UKILIMASI AMCOS/2025- AAA 6 52 412 | DAE LTD 364.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1061/002/1876 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
67 MKOHA AMCOS LTD/2025- PB 13 30 810 | CMS LTD MBINGA 348.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/238/004/1546 LIMITED
68] Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative PB 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3634 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
69] Ugogo Agricultural Marketing Cooperative PB 39 48 2,388 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 No bid -
Society LTD/2025-2026/878/001/3634 CURING
70 Mkalanga Amcos LTD/2025- PB 14 22 862 | CMS LTD MBINGA 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/881/002/1554 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
71 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/004/3577 PB 18 24 1,104 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
72 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/003/318 PB 2 21 141 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 345.00 No bid -
LTD MBINGA
73 UPOLO AMCOS/2025- PB 3 14 194 | CMS LTD MBINGA 349.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1119/001/1535 LIMITED
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74 Mbifacu Ltd/2025-2026/122/001/1865 PB 36 38 2,198 | DAE LTD 360.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
(TANZANIA) LIMITED
75 UKILIMASI AMCOS/2025- PB 2 52 172 | DAE LTD 349.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1061/002/1877 LIMITED
76 Lugari AMCOS/2025-2026/116/003/316 UG 3 21 201 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 210.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
LTD MBINGA Limited
77 TANZANIA COFFEE BOARD/2025- UG 2 27 147 | MBINGA COFFEE 214.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/942/001/3626 CURING Limited
78 UPOLO AMCOS/2025- UG 2 16 136 | CMS LTD MBINGA 214.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1119/001/1540 Limited
79 Mbifacu Ltd/2025-2026/122/001/1858 UG 12 12 732 | DAE LTD 245.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Limited
80 UKILIMASI AMCOS/2025- UG 6 52 412 | DAE LTD 231.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1061/002/1878 LIMITED
81 DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- F 30 20 1,820 | MBINGA COFFEE 150.00 No bid -
2026/1288/001/3400 CURING
82 DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- T 3 38 218 | MBINGA COFFEE 243.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1288/001/3401 CURING Limited
83 DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- AF 13 39 819 | MBINGA COFFEE 259.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/1288/001/3402 CURING
84 DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- C 82 26 4,946 | MBINGA COFFEE 292.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1288/001/3403 CURING LIMITED
85) DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 361.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1288/001/3404 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
86) DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- B 0 36 36 | MBINGA COFFEE 345.00 No bid -
2026/1288/001/3404 CURING
87] DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 363.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1288/001/3405 CURING LIMITED
88] DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- A 42 10 2,530 | MBINGA COFFEE 359.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1288/001/3405 CURING (TANZANIA) LIMITED
89 DAYB BEST COFFEE CO LTD/2025- PB 47 42 2,862 | MBINGA COFFEE 349.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1288/001/3408 CURING LIMITED
185 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- F 10 47 647 | MBINGA COFFEE 150.00 No bid -
2026/1265/001/3153 CURING
186 COTTI TANZANIA LIMITED/2025- TT 2 17 137 | DAE LTD 237.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1265/002/1640 Limited
187 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- © 33 2 1,982 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 330.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/259 LTD MBINGA
188 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- C 28 57 1,737 | MBINGA COFFEE 330.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3275 CURING
189 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- B 46 58 2,818 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/261 LTD MBINGA
190 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- B 45 58 2,758 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3276 CURING
191 CAILA TRADING COMPANY B 8 0 180 | CMS LTD MBINGA 340.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/003/1432 LIMITED
192) GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 99 51 5,991 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/262 LTD MBINGA
193) GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/262 LTD MBINGA
194) GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 18 36 1,116 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -

2026/1266/003/262

LTD MBINGA
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195 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- A 96 44 5,804 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3277 CURING
196 CAILA TRADING COMPANY A 1 12 72 | CMS LTD MBINGA 342.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/003/1431 LIMITED
197) GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 99 51 5,991 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
198) GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
199) GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 29 12 1,752 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/263 LTD MBINGA
200) GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3278 CURING
201) GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- AA 29 21 1,761 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3278 CURING
202 CAILA TRADING COMPANY AA 6 0 360 | CMS LTD MBINGA 355.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/003/1430 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
203 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- PB 14 30 870 | KYEJU'S COFFEE CO 396.00 No bid -
2026/1266/003/260 LTD MBINGA
204 GULF COFFEE AND TEA LIMITED/2025- PB 27 5 1,625 | MBINGA COFFEE 400.00 No bid -
2026/1266/002/3279 CURING
205 CAILA TRADING COMPANY PB 8 44 224 | CMS LTD MBINGA 341.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1220/003/1429 LIMITED
IYUNGA MBEYA - 2,670 Bags | 160,247 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
90 KASENGE AMCOS/2025- F 15 41 941 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 201.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/108/001/1982 WH
91 Rumbiaa AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 10 19 619 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 200.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/211/001/1959 WH Limited
92 KASENGE AMCOS/2025- TT 25 25 1,525 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 267.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/108/001/1981 WH
93 Rumbiaa AMCOS Ltd/2025- TT 11 5 665 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 266.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/211/001/1958 WH LIMITED
94 Rumbiaa AMCOS Ltd/2025- AF 15 13 913 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 267.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/211/001/1957 WH
95 KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AF 45 11 2,711 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 281.00 Sold CETCO (T) LTD
2026/108/001/1980 WH
96 BWENDA AMCOS/2025- (03 2 37 157 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 276.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/154/001/1987 WH LIMITED
97 KASENGE AMCOS/2025- C 16 5 965 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 321.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/108/001/1979 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
98 MASOKO AMCOS/2025- C 5 9 309 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 309.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/329/001/1973 WH TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
99 Rumbiaa AMCOS Ltd/2025- (€] 14 9 849 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 300.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/211/001/1956 WH Limited
101] KASENGE AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1978 WH
102] KASENGE AMCOS/2025- B 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1978 WH
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103] | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- B 22 49 1,369 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1978 WH
104 | MKOGWE AMCOS/2025- B 46 17 2,777 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 368.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/920/001/2003 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
105 | BWENDA AMCOS/2025- B 66 20 3,980 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 366.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/154/001/1986 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
106 | MASOKO AMCOS/2025- B 43 19 2,599 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 367.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/329/001/1972 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
107 | UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- B 30 43 1,843 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 366.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/210/002/2003 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
109 | Rumbiaa AMCOS Ltd/2025- B 53 48 3,228 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 372.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/211/001/1955 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
110 | MAKANDANA AMCOS/2025- B 24 37 1,477 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 369.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/328/001/1950 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
111 | BWENDA AMCOS/2025- B 25 9 1,509 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 367.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/154/002/1992 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
112] | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/108/001/1977 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
113] | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1977 WH
114] | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- A 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1977 WH
115] | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- A 15 40 940 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1977 WH
116 | MKOGWE AMCOS/2025- A 80 50 4,850 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 372.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/920/001/2002 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
117 | MASOKO AMCOS/2025- A 33 8 1,988 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 361.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/329/001/1971 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
118 | UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- A 38 0 2,280 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 360.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/210/002/2002 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
120 | Rumbiaa AMCOS Ltd/2025- A 64 0 3,840 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 359.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/211/001/1954 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
121 | BWENDA AMCOS/2025- A 90 25 5,425 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 370.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/154/001/1985 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
122 | MAKANDANA AMCOS/2025- A 25 21 1,521 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 373.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/328/001/1949 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
123 | BWENDA AMCOS/2025- A 48 a7 2,927 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 373.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/154/002/1991 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
124} | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1976 WH
125} | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1976 WH
126} | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1976 WH
127} | KASENGE AMCOS/2025- AA 57 29 3,449 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1976 WH
128) | MKOGWE AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 376.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/920/001/2001 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
129) | MKOGWE AMCOS/2025- AA 2 47 167 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 363.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/920/001/2001 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
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130 MASOKO AMCOS/2025- AA 32 53 1,973 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 374.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/329/001/1970 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
131 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- AA 33 50 2,030 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 376.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/210/002/2001 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
133 Rumbiaa AMCOS Ltd/2025- AA 87 0 5,220 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 376.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/211/001/1953 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
134} BWENDA AMCOS/2025- AA 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 376.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/154/001/1984 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
135} BWENDA AMCOS/2025- AA 6 50 410 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 372.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/154/001/1984 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
136 MAKANDANA AMCOS/2025- AA 34 50 2,090 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 375.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/328/001/1948 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
137 BWENDA AMCOS/2025- AA 54 42 3,282 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 377.00 Sold BESTER FEED AND
2026/154/002/1990 WH GRAIN TANZANIA
LIMITED
138} KASENGE AMCOS/2025- PB 100 0 6,000 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1975 WH
139} KASENGE AMCOS/2025- PB 20 38 1,238 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 380.00 No bid -
2026/108/001/1975 WH
140 MKOGWE AMCOS/2025- PB 29 48 1,788 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 367.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/920/001/2000 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
141 MASOKO AMCOS/2025- PB 26 21 1,581 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 368.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/329/001/1969 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
142 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- PB 21 37 1,297 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 369.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/210/002/2000 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
144 BWENDA AMCOS/2025- PB 39 48 2,388 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 370.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/154/001/1983 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
145 Rumbiaa AMCOS Ltd/2025- PB 38 11 2,291 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 369.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/211/001/1952 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
146 MAKANDANA AMCOS/2025- PB 18 15 1,095 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 360.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/328/001/1947 WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
147 BWENDA AMCOS/2025- PB 17 16 1,036 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 370.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/154/002/1989 WH LIMITED
148 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- UG 8 48 528 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/210/002/2004 WH Limited
149 MAKANDANA AMCOS/2025- UG 13 47 827 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 238.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/328/001/1951 WH Limited
150 MASOKO AMCOS/2025- UG 11 12 672 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 259.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/329/001/1974 WH Limited
151 BWENDA AMCOS/2025- UG 1 0 60 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 236.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/154/003/1994 WH LIMITED
152 BWENDA AMCOS/2025- UG 9 0 540 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 250.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/154/002/1993 WH LIMITED
153 BWENDA AMCOS/2025- UG 20 45 1,245 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 249.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/154/001/1988 WH LIMITED
154 MKOGWE AMCOS/2025- UG 21 36 1,296 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 250.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/920/001/2004 WH Limited
206 NDEMBELA AMCOS/2025- F 11 43 703 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 170.00 No bid -
2026/206/001/1819 WH
207 UKOMBOZI AMCOS - MBEYA/2025- F 9 8 548 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 170.00 No bid -
2026/210/001/1598 WH
208 Lupepo AMCOS Ltd/2025- F 18 41 1,121 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 170.00 No bid -
2026/207/001/1590 WH
209 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1606 F 5) 22 322 || City Coffee LTD Mbeya 170.00 No bid -
WH
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210 Nkunga AMCOS/2025-2026/209/001/1605 TT 10 38 638 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 170.00 No bid -
WH
211 Simike AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 32 21 1,941 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 170.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/197/001/1810 WH LIMITED
212 Kyobo AMCOS Ltd/2025- UG 4 24 264 | City Coffee LTD Mbeya 170.00 No bid -
2026/208/003/1751 WH
Mbeya, Rungwe - 101 Bags | 6,103 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
100 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION C 0 33 33 | RUNGWE COFFEE 295.00 No bid -
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/002/14 CORPORATION WH
108 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION B 15 52 952 | RUNGWE COFFEE 358.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/002/15 CORPORATION WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
119 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION A 32 17 1,937 | RUNGWE COFFEE 353.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/002/16 CORPORATION WH LIMITED
132 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION AA 41 46 2,506 | RUNGWE COFFEE 371.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/002/17 CORPORATION WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
143 RUNGWE COFFEE CORPORATION PB 11 16 676 | RUNGWE COFFEE 369.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
LIMITED/2025-2026/1285/002/13 CORPORATION WH (TANZANIA) LIMITED
MOSHI MJINI - 382 Bags | 22,959 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER
155 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society F 1 5 65 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 150.00 No bid -
Ltd/2025-2026/270/004/890
156 KIMASIO AMCOS LTD/2025- F 2 44 164 | GOURMET MOSHI 170.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1216/003/1237 Limited
157 KIMASIO AMCOS LTD/2025- TT 1 48 108 | GOURMET MOSHI 215.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
2026/1216/003/1238 Limited
158 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED G 4 49 289 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 251.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH Limited
2026/1224/013/279
159 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society C 9 20 560 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 249.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/004/889 LTD
160 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society © 2 14 134 | GOURMET MOSHI 305.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/1328 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
161 KIMASIO AMCOS LTD/2025- (&3 4 54 294 | GOURMET MOSHI 318.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
2026/1216/003/1239 TRADING COMPANY
LIMITED
162 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED AB 42 0 2,520 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 328.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH
2026/1224/013/280
163 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society AB 24 28 1,468 | GOURMET MOSHI 359.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/1330 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
164 KIMASIO AMCOS LTD/2025- AB 37 29 2,249 | GOURMET MOSHI 365.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1216/003/1241 (TANZANIA) LIMITED
165 NODO TANZANIA COMPANY AB 15 36 936 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 361.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LIMITED/2025-2026/1230/003/1432 MOSHI WH
166 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED AA 11 21 681 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 349.00 Sold COTACOF LTD

(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025-
2026/1224/013/282

WH
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167 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society AA 5 31 331 | GOURMET MOSHI 359.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/1331 LIMITED

168 KIMASIO AMCOS LTD/2025- AA 6 58 418 | GOURMET MOSHI 360.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1216/003/1242 LIMITED

169 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society AA 46 55 2,815 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 362.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/004/886 LIMITED

170 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED PB 6 55) 415 || City Coffee LTD Moshi 320.00 Sold M/S. IBERO COFFEE
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH TRADING COMPANY
2026/1224/013/278 LIMITED

171 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society PB 3 28 208 | GOURMET MOSHI 346.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/1329 LTD

172 KIMASIO AMCOS LTD/2025- PB 5 16 316 | GOURMET MOSHI 346.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
2026/1216/003/1240 LIMITED

173 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society PB 11 52 712 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 346.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/004/885 LIMITED

181 KIFARU COFFEE ESTATE LIMITED UG 20 16 1,216 | City Coffee LTD Moshi 215.00 No bid -
(SHANGRILA ESTATE LTD)/2025- WH
2026/1224/013/281

182 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society UG 2 4 124 | GOURMET MOSHI 220.00 Sold DRK General Merchants
Ltd/2025-2026/270/001/1327 Limited

183 NODO TANZANIA COMPANY UG 1 19 79 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 220.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
LIMITED/2025-2026/1230/003/1433 MOSHI WH LIMITED

184 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society UG 1 35 95 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 254.00 Sold KAHAWA PAMOJA (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/004/888 LTD

213 Uru North Joint Enterprises Co-op. Society AB 83 55 5,035 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 360.00 Sold M/S. TAYLOR WINCH (T)
Ltd/2025-2026/270/004/887 LIMITED

214 MACHAME NKUU AMCOS/2025- AB 20 8 1,208 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 370.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1234/001/843 (TANZANIA) LIMITED

215 MACHAME NKUU AMCOS/2025- AA 5 43 343 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 366.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1234/001/842 (TANZANIA) LIMITED

216 MACHAME NKUU AMCOS/2025- PB 1 26 86 | TCCCO - MOSHI WH 363.00 Sold M/S. DORMAN
2026/1234/001/841 (TANZANIA) LIMITED

217 HORTANZIA LTD/2025- UG 1 30 90 | RAFIKI COFFEE LTD 170.00 No bid -
2026/1248/002/1093 MOSHI WH

Njiro-Arusha - 184 Bags | 11,048 Kgs
LOT NO. | DESCRIPTION GRADE | BAGS |POCKETS N/KGS | WAREHOUSE PRICE STATUS BUYER

174 EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES AB 23 4 1,384 | ARUSHA COFFEE MILL 319.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
LTD/2024-2025/1002/004, 2024- LTD WH
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/1002/012,
2024-2025/1002/009, 2024-
2025/1002/011, 2024-2025/1002/005,
2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/

175 FINAGRO PLANTATIONS LTD/2024- AB 30 25 1,825 | ARUSHA COFFEE MILL 291.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2025/1160/022, 2024-2025/1160/022, LTD WH
2024-2025/1160/019, 2024-
2025/1160/025, 2024-2025/1160/003,
2024-2025/1160/004, 2024-
2025/1160/006, 2024-2025/1160/012,
2024-2025/1160/0

176 FINAGRO PLANTATIONS LTD/2024- AB 62 30 3,750 | ARUSHA COFFEE MILL 310.00 Sold COTACOF LTD
2025/1160/022, 2024-2025/1160/022, LTD WH
2024-2025/1160/019, 2024-
2025/1160/025, 2024-2025/1160/003,
2024-2025/1160/004, 2024-
2025/1160/006, 2024-2025/1160/012,
2024-2025/1160/0
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177

EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES
LTD/2024-2025/1002/002, 2024-
2025/1002/001, 2024-2025/1002/002,
2024-2025/1002/001/119

AB

27

16

1,636

ARUSHA COFFEE MILL
LTD WH

268.00

Sold COTACOF LTD

178

EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES
LTD/2024-2025/1002/007, 2024-
2025/1002/006, 2024-2025/1002/008,
2024-2025/1002/007/343

AB

17

21

1,041

ARUSHA COFFEE MILL
LTD WH

268.00

Sold COTACOF LTD

179

EDELWEISS OLDEANI ESTATES
LTD/2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/1002/012,
2024-2025/1002/009, 2024-
2025/1002/011, 2024-2025/1002/005,
2024-2025/1002/004, 2024-
2025/1002/013, 2024-2025/

AB

11

371

ARUSHA COFFEE MILL
LTD WH

310.00

Sold COTACOF LTD

180

FINAGRO PLANTATIONS LTD/2024-
2025/1160/022, 2024-2025/1160/022,
2024-2025/1160/019, 2024-
2025/1160/025, 2024-2025/1160/003,
2024-2025/1160/004, 2024-
2025/1160/006, 2024-2025/1160/012,
2024-2025/1160/0

AB

17

21

1,041

ARUSHA COFFEE MILL
LTD WH

268.00

Sold COTACOF LTD
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